	97815 Vol. <u>mg</u> Page 3952
n an an Sairtí	FILED STATE OF OREGON NEAMATH CO. SPRCIPT COURT
1	IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON
2 3	FOR THE COUNTY OF KLAMATH CLERK OF COURT
3	In the Matter of the Marriage of $NO. 88-7\overline{68}$ DI
5	SHELLI MARGARET CLARK,
6	Petitioner, ) ATTORNEY'S LIEN
8	JOHN ERNEST CLARK,
9	Respondent,
10	)
11	The undersigned, ENVER BOZGOZ, hereinafter called "Claimant"
12	and fur film of Enver Bozgoz, Attorney at Law 1125 Demo
13	Street Klamath Falls, Oregon, gives notice is

h Falls, Oregon, gives notice of and claims the following attorney's lien pursuant to ORS 87.445.

This lien arises out of services rendered to Petitioner, Shelli Margaret Clark in the above captioned dissolution of marriage proceeding in the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Klamath.

An itemized statement of the attorneys fees is set out in Exhibit "A" which is attached and incorporated herein in the sum of \$2,065.48, payment of said sum was due on February 21, 1989.

The undersigned claims a lien in the amount set forth above in and to the real property and proceeds from any sale of said real property located in Klamath County, State of Oregon NOTICE OF CLAIM OF ATTORNEY LIEN-Page 1

60

14

15

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

25 26

(LAA 24

97601

more particularly described as: 1 Lot 41, First Addition to Madison Park 2 for which sale is pending at this time. 3 I further certify that I sent a true copy of this within 4 Lien, certified by me to be such, to my client, Shelli M. Clark 5 at 1300 N. "L" Street, #62, Lompoc, California 93436. 6 7 66018 ENVER BOZGOZ 8 Claimant 9 STATE OF OREGON 10 ss. County of Klamath ) 11 I, ENVER BOZGOZ, being first duly sworn, depose and say 12 that the above lien claim contains a true statement of my demand 13 and the amount due my law firm and is true as I verily believe. 14 15 16 ENVER BOZGOZ, OSB #66 \$65 SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN to before me this 8th day of March, 1989. 17 18 -1 ٩. O \$ 5 19 97601 PUBLIC FOR OREGON NOTARY My Commission Expires: 8-12-91 20 STREET DREGON 882-5505 AFTER RECORDING RETURN TO: 21 NE South 22 Enver Bozgoz ĒĒ Attorney at Law AT HT 23 1135 Pine Street Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601 24 25 NOTICE OF CLAIM OF ATTORNEYS LIEN-Page 2 26

3953

## CORRECTED STATEMENT

ENVER BOZGOZ ATTORNEY AT LAW 1135 Pine Street Klamath Falls, OK 97601 (503) 882-5505

**TO**:

Shelli Clark 4279 Constellation Road Lompoc, CA 93436

DATE: 2/21/89

ර්ෂ Clark v. Clark 88-768DI

#### -ATTORNEY FEES-

Preparation of petition, affidavit, motion and order for temporary custody. Affidavit and restraining order	
and restraining order	4.00 hours
Review of 11/11/88 letter from Atty. Aspell	.50
Review of letter from client	.50
Review of affidavit, motion and order to show cause from respondent	
[1] A. M. Martin, M. M. Martin, M. M. Martin, M. M. Martin, Phys. Rev. Lett. 19, 101 (1996).	1.00
Preparation of Request for Froduction	1.00
Review of 11/22/88 letter from Atty. Aspell	.25
Office consultation u/cfient. 11/27/88	1.00
Review letter from Atty. Aspell	. 25
Court appearance show cause hearing and	
conference with Aspell's office	2.00
Preparation of temporary support order	.50
Review of 12/16/88 letter from Atty. Aspell	. 25
Preparation of Garnishment	1.25
Review of Citibank VISA account and resp. financial statement	
	1,50

3955

#### Shelli Clark Statement - Page 2

Preparation of 2nd Request for Production		
Review of file documents and for trial	preparation	1.00
Conference w/client 1/19/89		3.00
Trial 1/19/89		1.00
Conference w/client 1/20/89		7.00
Trial 1/20/89	and the second	1.00
		5.00

TOTAL HOURS TO DATE

 TOTAL FEE OWING TO DATE = 32 hours x \$75.00/hr. = \$2,400.00

 Payment of 10/7/88

 TOTAL FEES OWING TO DATE

# 1200.00

- ---- --- -

### -COSTS ADVANCED-

12/14/88	Klamath County Sherifi Service fee, #14255 (garnishment)	\$ 15.00
1/16/89	Terry Griffin Service fee, #14347	
1/18/89	Mike Davis	15.00
	Witness fee & miles ok #14353	5.48
1/18/89	Terry Griffin service fee, ck #14355	
1/20/89	Circuit Court	30.00
	trial & reporter fees ck #14365	100.00
	TOTAL COSTS OWING	

#165.44

Shelli Clark Statement - Page 3

# TOTAL ATTORNEY FEES & COSTS OWING

\$2055.48

3956

#### STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH: ss.

Wy oo

Filed for record at reque	st of <u>Enver</u>	Bozgoz	the8th d	av
of <u>March</u>	A.D., 19 _89	at12:09o	clock <u>P.M.</u> , and duly recorded in Vol. <u>M89</u>	
	of	Co.Lien Docket	on Page <u>3952</u> .	_,
			Evelyn Biehn County Clerk	
FEE \$25.00			By Quellino Mullanolare	

STATEMENT