1

2

4

5

6

7 8

9

; 10 : 11

12 13

; 14 15

> 16 17

18 19

ATOMES ALLS
ATOMES ALLS
ATH FALLS, OREGON 97
PHONE (303) 482-5505
C 7 7 7

25 26

24

IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON
FOR THE COUNTY OF KLAMATH

In the Matter of the Marriage of IMO RAE WEBER,

Petitioner,

and

WILLIAM JOSEPH WEBER,

Respondent,

NO. 9001466 DI

NOTICE OF CLAIM OF

ATTORNEYS LIEN

The undersigned, Enver Bozgoz, hereinafter called "Claimant" of the law firm of Enver Bozgoz, Attorney at Law, 1135 Pine Street, Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601, gives notice of and claims the following attorney's lien pursuant to ORS 87.445 in the sum of \$5,455.00.

This lien arises out of services rendered to IMO RAE WEBER, in the above captioned suit in the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Klamath.

A Decree of Dissolution of Marriage was entered in the above entitled proceeding on February 15, 1991. The undersigned claims a lien in the amount set forth above upon the attached Itemized Statement and upon the interests of Imo Rae Weber in and to the real property and proceeds from any subsequent conveyance thereof awarded to her in said Decree of Dissolution of Marriage. Said

NOTICE OF CLAIM OF ATTORNEY'S LIEN -Page 1

real property is located in Klamath County, Oregon, and is more particularly described as follows:

Lot 5, Block 1, Tract 1002, LA WANDA HILLS, in the County of Klamath, State of Oregon.

I further certify that I sent a true copy of this within Lien, certified by me to be such, to my client, Imo Rae Weber, at P. O. Box 172, Proberta, California 96078.

DATED this 26 day of February, 1991.

ENVER BOZGOZ, OSB #86018 Claimant

STATE OF OREGON)
: ss.
County of Klamath)

I, ENVER BOZGOZ, being first duly sworn, depose and say that the above lien claim contains a true statement of my demand and the amount due my law firm as I verily believe.

ENVER BOZGOZ, Claymant

SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN to before me this 26 day of February, 1991.

OFFICIAL SEAL
DIAME BOZGOZ
NOTARY PUBLIC - OREGON
COMMISSION NO. 199359

NOTARY PUBLIC FOR ORESON
My Commission Expires: /-22-92.

MY COMMISSION EXPIRES JAN. 22, 1992
AFTER RECORDING RETURN. TO

Enver Bozgoz

Attorney at Law 1135 Pine Street, Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601

NOTICE OF CLAIM OF ATTORNEY'S LIEN -Page 2

ENVER BOZGOZ ATTORNEY AT LAW 1135 Pine Street Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601

Imo Rae Weber P. O. Box 172 Proberta, California 96078

Re: Weber and Weber

ITEMIZED BILL

DATE	ITEM	
4/25/90		TIME
5/7/90	Office consultation with client	1
5/7-8/90	Preparation of	1
	Motion, Order to Show Cause, Service on Respondent and Preparation of Uniform Support Affidavit	2
5/21/90	Show Cause hearing Review of Bank Documents	2
5/24/90	Review of letter, job termination	2
5/31/90	Keview of -	-25
6/5/90	call to client to advise of decision Preparation of Temporary Money Judgment transmittal to Court and opposing attorney Client Called	•50
6/19/90	Client called	1
	to client with suggestion, using seatter	1
6/20/90	Review of letter from Respondent's attorney Review of Response and Counter-Petition	.50
5/22/90	Review of Court notices trial setting conference and settlement hearing, letter	.25
•	Cilent	

	그는 하는 사람들이 많아 하는 것이 되는데 경기를 받는 지수는 하는데 되지 않는데 되었다.	
Page 2 Weber ite	mized statement	· ·
6/23/90	Preparation of Request for Production of Documents, transmittal to opposing attorney	
7/13/90	Review of client's letter regarding garnishment of Respondent's wages, preparation of garnishment papers,	1
7/25/90	Letter to opposing attorney re: providing with copy of 401-K plan	
7/26/90	Office consulation with client, prepare letter to opposing attorney requesting that Respondent pay back support, putting house for sale and hiring appraiser	1
7/29/90	Review Phyllis Rutledge re: rent	.25
8/9/90	Prepare Affidavit, Motion and Order to Show Cause re: hiring of appraiser and why Respondent should not pay for appraisal	1
8/10/90	Office consultation with client re: hiring of appraiser and amending Petition, letter to client re: settlement hearing	1
8/13/90	Office consultation with client re: issues for Show Cause hearing, what work has been done on case	1
8/20/90	Show Cause hearing	1
	Settlement hearing	1
	Review of Respondent's Response, Preparation of Motion to Strike language that Petitioner receives support from another man	. 1
8/29/90	Review of opposing Attorneys's order re: appointing appraiser	.25
8/29/90	Office consulation with client re: agreement that client and husband had reached settlement, advise not to accept	1

Page 3 Weber iter	mized statement	
9/19/90	Office consulation with client review personal property list and values	1.50
10/1/90	Review of letter from client re: Bank of America, review of Judge's decision regarding filing amended Petition	.50
10/10/90	Review of client's letter regarding rental and insurance forms	.50
10/18/90	Letter to opposing attorney regarding obtaining insurance forms, go to opposing attorney's office to pick up forms	1
10/31/90	Transmittal to client of insurance forms	.25
11/1/90	Review of Respondent's Affidavit and Motion to file Amended Response, preparation of Objection to filing Amended Response	1
11/5/90	Letter to client with check and additional insurance forms, advise of trial date	.50
11/10/90	Telephone call to client, trial cancelled explanation, no judges	.50
11/16/90	Review of Respondent's Memorandum in support of filing Amended Response, research of authorities	1
12/1/90	Two telephone calls from client re: medical problems, requesting Respondent to provide medical insurance discussion with secretary, review of file regarding personal property, advise client to get medical reports	2
12/5/90	Preparation of Trial Memorandum, Exhibits research of authorities, Preparation of Uniform Support Affidavit, Support Calculations, trial preparation with client	5
12/6/90	Preparation of Closing argument, trial preparation and trial	8

TOTAL HOU	RS	60.75
Attorney	rate \$100.00 per hour x 60.75 hrs.=	\$6,075.00
	advanced: Check number 16526 to Lynett Ezell for witness fee:	\$30.00
12-06-90	Check number 16525 to Circuit Court for Reporter fee:	50.00
# Page 5 Weber ite	mized statement	
12-07-90	Check number 16536 to Circuit Court (reporte for reporter fee:	er fee) 50.00
TOTAL COS	TS ADVANCED:	130.00
Plus Tele	fax	
12/17/90	5 pages	\$5.00
12/18/90	5 pages	5.00
12/19/90	4 pages	4.00
12/20/90	3 pages	_3.00
TOTAL TEL	EFAX	17.00
	S AND COSTS RETAINER*	6,222.00 - <u>767.00</u>
TOTAL AMO	UNT DUE AND OWING	\$5,455.00

Trust Account payments and disbursements:
Less initial consultation fee:

100.00

Less Retainer paid into trust	1,000.00
TOTAL PAID IN	1,100.00
Refund of consultation fee to client	100.00
BALANCE REMAINING	1,000.00
Check No. 1431, Circuit Court filing fee	-113.00
Check No. 1432, Terry Griffin, service fee	- 20.00
*Attorneys fees paid:	767.00

		·	COTTATATA	$\Delta \mathbf{r}$	KLAMATH: ss.	
OTATE	$\Delta \mathbf{E}$	ODECON	TUNINIY	UP	KLAWAIII. 33.	
VIAIR.	115	UKEUUII.	COULTE	-		

	the 26th de	аy
Filed for record at rec	nuest of Enver Bozgoz need to State of the Local need to State of Local need to State	_,
ofFeb	A.D., 19 91 at octook	
	or Go. Hen County Clerk	
	By Queline Mulendere	_
FEE \$40.00		