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Klamath County Sheriff’s Office

Civil Division

CARL R. BURKHART, SHERIFF — 316 MAIN ST. — 503-883-4187 — KLAMATH FALLS, OREGON 97601

RECEIVED
JUL 11 1981
bt Baard of Commissioners

July 10, 1991

Sheriff’s Return of Sale

The following parcels listed on the attached addendunm were sold
at public auction, held in the Commissioner’s Hearing Room, on
April 3@, 1991.

Total sales amounted to $281,905.00.

Carl R. Burkhart, Sheriff
Klamath County, Oregon

chael Gf:Lj/u}/‘Depu\y

“To Protect and To Serve The Community™




TAaX LOT NUMBER SRI-Q2 1 CA-REIPA-QER-BR

HEY
JQ O R =
EHL UEbCRIPTIDN t E 1RQ %ek & Wagon Trails"

-QLR
$E,9®@.@®
DAN" HEFNER
727 MADRONE

SUNNYVALE, CA %4586

QQSAG— Q47 QR —Qaa~RG

9_

77

LE IUER RANCH

" Blk-4, Little River

rﬂx LOT NUMBER Ri

KE 6531
LodaTIoN o LITT
~LEBAL-DESCRIFTION Lt &
- ACREAGE

SALE PRICE $.
S0LD TO NO BID
- STREET - - S

" CITY, STATE ZIF

K 129934
LOCATION WAGON TRAILS
hgggL DESCRIFTION Lot 9, Blk. oy Hanon Tralls
‘-SQLE PRICE 1@@ .
--80LD TOD GERhLD D DHNDUFF
. STREET 1883 CUNNINGHQM QVE
T EFFYy —~STATE-ZIF-- ~MEDFBORD; —0OR T s e

-¥TQX-EDT~NUNBERW">RESG9—®1EB@—@E9@®—@@@—@@~
T HKEY

TAX LOT NUMBER RES@9-21 3DB—-QZ4TA—2AQ-QR

KEY EeE e

“LLOCATION LCHRIST
~~LEGQL DESCRIFPTION PDP.:E4SE4, Sec. 13, ACCESS ?
‘TQC E 1.0

NO RID

TQX LOT NUMBER REZSQO~-ZZ5QQ0—-21 300-00@-22
TTKEY 69q974
g—LDCQrIDNﬂ"~—A“-~ GILEHRIST—— e e S
'LBEGEEGDESCRIPFIDN FOR. LOT i, Blk. 1, Chapman Tract, Gilchrist

CR

T SALE FRICE $SQD. A
TS0LD—T O ADRA LN~ EOVEL Y- SR
L STREET HC 32 BOX 5@
~.CITY, STATE ZIF GILCHRIST, OR

~TAX LOT NUMBER Rd¢@9 —0ESAR-06 50000000

(s KEY 124081

2 LOCATION JACK PINE VILLAGE

T EEGAL-DESCRIPTION- Lot—-15-Blk. Sy ~Jackpine—Village —— e .
" ACREAGE

SOLD.AT. AUCTION




SALE PRICE $=, S0V, 2D
KEN CURBOW
P O BDOX _1%@
CRESCENT, OR 97733

FAX LOT- NUMEBER RLSl@—@E?@@—@l?@@—@@@—@@
KEY 127364
L GCARTION GILCHRIST
"LEGARL DEbCRIPTIDN Hor NE4bw4, Lot &, Gilchrist
ACRERGE- —- " — v . . .
SALE FRICE ‘56 @@v] it}
saLb TO BDB KOoC
T STREET HC &1 BUA imBB
CITY, -STATE -ZIF - -LAFINE, OR

R;ul@ @u&ﬁ@ — 2o QA Wu@ U@

KE 14383~ - e e e o e e
LDC SUN FOREST EbTQ1ES
LEGQL DESCRIPTIDN Lot 78, Blk. 15 Sun Forest Estates
ACK
SHLE‘PRICE : $1, 100, 0 -
'SDLD TD hQLPH HUBER
STREET HC 61 BOX 1235
LITY, STQTC ZIF LARINE, DR 94739

: &2§ LOT NUMRER ?:gl@ —~QZ6BR-Q8 1022220
3955
_LOCAT-TON—-~ - ——--GUN~ FOREST ESTRTES -+ mmomm o e

2T LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Blk &, Sun Forest Estates

ACREARGE

SALE FPRICE $1, S0@. rajn}
- SDLD—TO———*——‘-’—RQLPH HUBRER-—-
#;STREET HC 61 BOX 1255
S~ CITY, STARTE ZIF LARINE, OR 94739

TQX LoT ‘NUMBER “RE310- @u&C@ ElA@@ —gaa- —an
. KEY 140573
*’LDCQT SUN FOREST ESTATES
AEGRE—DESGRIPTIDN‘ Lt—-89,—BLk—1,—Sun—Foresti— Estates——— -
ACRERGE
SALE FRICE $1, 200, 08
TISOLD _TO GQYLEN R WALTERS
 STREET—— e =1 4 38— EARL 8T mmem o T T T
f;LITY, STATE Z1IF NAFR, CA

A AX—LOT—NUMEER————RE310-036CO-06-1 80~ Q0Q~ AP ——— ===
S KEY 141796

JLLOCATION SUN FOREST ESTATES

-LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 7, Blk 13, Sun Forest Estates

RGREAIGE — oo e S

81,250, 00

sSOLD TO FEREY GOODEILL

STREET FEREY Rox 129

7 CITY,~STATE-Z1P-- LAPINE,  OR 97739 o ommmmmr o

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




TAX LG
N
LEGAL DESCRIp
ACREAGE

SALE FRICE .
SULD Tg

T NUMBER
oN
TION

STATE z1p

TAX LOT NuMBER
"KEY
LOCATION -
LEGAL DESCRIFTIaAN
ACREAGE

: 70
. STREET
O CITY, sTATE 7ip

Pmd

~TAX LOT NUMBER
TKEY

S LOCATION
-LEGAL- DESE
ACREAGE

-3 SALE FRICE

"SOLD TgQ
" STREET- .. _

R

|

C
TION R

'AX LOT NUMBER
KEy—__ "77%F
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIp
T ACREAGE
SALE-FRIC
SOLD T
STREET )
CITY, STATE z1gm

EN_,_ [

R24@9-p
S370Q
ERE
Lt

1
BEATION-—
EGAL DESCRIFTION

i
C

SDLD.QT.QUCTIDN

RIFTION .-[L€

F O BOox I53
QPINET—BR-97?59-—~—--——-‘—

Z936ba-01900-nag—an

i
&bREST ESTATES
s Blk 1@, Sun Forest

r 2QQ. a.
NALD S FREEmaN
MCLAREN Qug

A FARK, CA 913p7

—WEGDQ—QEIQG—Q@Q—EG

FOREST ESTATES -
3, Blk 12, sun Forest

19-036 D2"09 200 00a-gg
[}

UN FOREST EsTaTeEg

' ﬁf‘Blk”llv“SUn~Fow

est~Estates~

1@—@36D@—®97@@—@@@—®®~—~‘~
2214

UN FOREST ESTATES
17, BIk 11, Sun

. S
BOWDEN

Forest Estates

$1
OnN

2408-@
S52@99..
HEMUL T
or. NE4SE4,
. 85

SGDQ—EEGQG—@@Q—@G

Sec.36, Chemult

$Es

3@CQ-®4E@@—®@@—

SCENT-- . T e
11, Ri1gk 4, Crescent

@a




ACRERGE

sa.
DDLENE L JDHN

CITY, STATE ZIF  CRESCENT, QOR

TAX LOT NUMBER  R=¢ Seaaa- -Q6 700 -RAR-B@
KEY

LOCATION ND RIVtRa NORTH
- Lt-24,. Blk 12y Two Rivers-North

$5, 30A. 2@
JUDY URBACK
- e z-———1734-CARLSON -DR- - __
CITY, 5TATE z1F KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97403

ﬁmJQXVLDT-NUMBER~~V~th®7 ~QQ1AA- 11508~ —R0a-2a
_KEY 62898

"LOCATION TWO RIVERS NORTH
EEGQL DESCRIRTION Lt 2, Blk 1@, Two Rivers North
SALE BRICE $4, 00, Q0

S0LD TO LEONARD HARIS

STREET E6@4 AUTUMN AVE
ELTYy—-STATE--ZIF——KLAMATH -FALLS - DRw97b@u—~m~~-~

AEEX LOT NUMBER Rz b@?g@@lB@ @”S@@ —~QQQ—-2aa

LOCATION TND RIVERS NDRTH

LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 28, Blk 4, Two Rivers North
ACREAGE

SQLE~PRICE-——~—-——$¢TJB® ~QA——
SOLD TO GARY CORNELIUS
STREET SReS G ST

CITY STATE ZIP SFRINGFIELD, GOR 9g477

rﬂé LOT NUMBER RZ627 001 BE-06500-002-00
LOCATEON———— O~ RYvER:~N0RTH~~~ -
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 7y BlKk 15, Two Rivers North
. ACREAGE
$3, S0@. O

T -~LEONARD-HARRIS-~— e
S6@4 AUTUMN AQVE
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 976w1

TAX LOT NUMBER R2728—~-21600-00400—-320-Q
2 'KEY 751519
- LOCATION CHEMULT
LEGAL-DESERIFTION—2 @@L~wide_strip;-Eavro&}—Springs-~~*~»»~«~w'm~
ACREAGE 14.58
$2, 30D, @
JOE FQRRELL

. —————— @—-B T T e L

: R T “HE OX—768-
‘CIFY STATE ZIF CHILOQUIN, UR 97 24

S0LD. AT. AUCTION




FRX-LOT Nup HSERE8-E19A0~019aa—nmm_ 2
f’(8¢ LOT NUMBER 3‘755,8 Gl3RAa~@19ap 2l B by
LOCATIgN BEAVER MARSH

LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 11, BIik 4, N. Beaver Marsh, IMFRQOV.,
-RCREAGE.. e . : R S
SALE FRICE $2, B2Q. Qg

3 SHIRLEY BEVERLY
HC =@ poy 114
CHEMULT, G

CTAX Lot NUMEBER R31@7—®@1DD—1®6@@—@@@-@@

— KEY T --78989. 17T SEE e

"L LOCATION SILVER LaKgE
7 T LEGAL DESCRIFTION For. NE4 Sec l,li'or‘SElrSE#, For N
"7 ACREAGE 16. 21

; ~SF)LE—F'RICE»-»-»--»<——~~-‘—$S,—~7®®. Q@ -

S0LD TOU JIM HARVIE
6739 BECKTON
STATE z1p KLAMATH FALLS, oRr

3UTAX LOT NUMBER RSSIS—@IE@@—@@I@Q—@@@—@D
T HEY 175884
- LOCATION - . —v-»w»l-(LF}MQTH»—FQLLS~FDREST-- ESTQTES\~~—~—~-~—~»
--LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt ic, BRik 18, Sycan Unit, KrrFe
= ACREAGE 12,25
T SALE ERICE $350. Q@
TSOLDTFOo_TT T —DAN-HEENER . ___ T
L STREET 727 MADRONE
P CITY, STATE zIp SUNNYUQLE, CA 94p8p

2 TAX LOT NUMBER R3313-

KEY 175893

‘LOCATION BLAMATH FALLS Foregt ESTATES
‘LEGQLwDESCRIPTIDN~Lt~4Dr—Blk—48¢—Sycan~Unrtr“KFFE
ACREAGE 18, 37

-SALE FRICE $250. an

2S0LD To DAN HEENER

-~ SFREET— . &7 MADRONE

“CITY, STATE z1p SUNNYYAL

§}§Q¢~EOT‘NUMBER~~ »ﬁgg}?zalsam—alsmm—waa—w@m~~~~

< LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS Fogegy ESTATES
LEGAL DESCRIRTION | g 78y Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE——. : ebo -1 77N Unit ¢

MCLAREN AUE
ANOBA-FARK,-CA-9 1307 __

"TTAx LoT NUMBER
KEY -
TLOCATI ON

SOLD. AT. RUCTION




LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt <€, Blk 1s, Sycan Unit KFFE
GE 1a. 46

3250, o
RDNQLB S FREEMAN
71iia MCLAREN AVE
SITY, STATE z1r  CANGGA FARK, CA 91307

FQX LOT NUMBER RIZ13-01 30001 500- —RQ2A-aR
176253

LDLQTION : KLQNQTH FALLS FOREST- ESTATES -

LEGAL DESLRIPTIGN Lt &D, B1k 18, Sycan Unit KFFE

ACREAGE la. 47

SALE PRICE $S5Q. a@

SOLD--FQ~—— - . © ‘RONALD-S FREEMAN — - - -

STREET 7118 MCLAREN AQVE

CITY, STATE zZip CRANOGA FARK, CA 91zp7

525 LOT NUMBER R$u1u—a1u@@ DE0RD-POT—a

T LOCATION KLQMQTH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
~~EEEEE DESCRIFTION- %3 zﬁ;mBlk“i y8ycam-Unit-KFFE —~— .

;;QXMLUT'NUMBER~ ~R3

$250. QR
RDNQLD S FREEMAN

Tl e MELAREN-AYE

CANOGA FARK, CA 913a7

T ;% Q130a—~ —O210Q-20@Q—@ -
[A=3=

- LOCATION LQMQTH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
"LEGRL DLSCHIPTIDN Lt 3D, Blk 18 Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREABE-—— .~ 7 " ———-1d. 46 - - e e
SALE PRICE $325.

‘SOLD TO KEITH HENDERSDN

- STREET BOX 95

3
5}

[
:-Clxyw—STgTEWZID—r-BEN CDMDND CA-950QS

TQX LOT NUMBER S315-01300-02200-DRa— -2

T 1 7EE R

“LOCQTIDN KLQMQTH FQLLS FDREST ESTQTES

JLEGAL PESCRIFTION Lt SA, Blk 18, Sycan Unis KFFE
~ ACREAG 1. 47’
SALE- F‘RICE B £ e
©80LD TO RONALD § FREEMAN

- STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE

~CITY, STATE ZIF  CANOGA FARK, CA 91za7

,TQX LUT NUMBER R3313-a1300-02 SQQ~Q2A-GR
L KEY 176197
LOCATION - KLAMATH FALLS. FOREST-ESTATES-- -
LLbQL DESCRIPFIUN Lt 4D, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
- ACRERGE 1@.4L
:,CQLE FRICE 3 @@
SOLD--TC e ~RDNQL S EENQN—~--—-~««VW—~H

AVE

STREET 7118 MOLARE

S0LD. AT. AUCTION




c1ry, STATE ZIF CANOGA FARK, CA 913a7

;g§'Lor NUMBER R3313-01300-02400~202-22
LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LEGAL-DESCRIFTION Lt 48, Blk- 18, Sycan UNit-KFFE
ACREAGE 10, 4

$25Q. Q@

RONABLD 5 FREEMAN
- 7118 MCLAREN. AVE -
CITY, STQTE ZIpP CANOGA FPARK, CA 921307

_TgX LOT NUMBER @1 300-A336A—-2Q—-aQ
KEY
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCR IPTIDN Lt 178, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
- ACREAGE ——— -~ RN .ba : mm e e
... SALE PRICE =D, @@

- 80LD TO RDNQLD S FREEMAN

" STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE

~CITY,~-STATE--ZIF- -CANOGA--FARK,--CA 913@7-

TQ¢ LOT NUMBER R @13@@ 034@@ ulvnignin}

LDCQTIDN KFFE .
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lg 17C, Blk 18, Syecan Unit KFFE

QCREQG

RONALD S FREEMAN
~ 7118 MCLAREN AVE
TCITY, STATE ZIF CANOGA FARK, CA 91307

TAX LOT NUMBER R3213-01300-03500-002-00
TTHE 17623
TEOEATION———-— - — - KLAMATH-FALLS FOREST-ESTATES — oo e
:LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 16B, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
i - ACREAGE 9.53
$E250. 0

SOED—T O e - RONBLDo S- FREEMAN -

STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE

CITY, STATE ZIF  CANOGA FARK, CA 913@7

?EEQWLB;EED&éER ATug'§¥@1a®m 02600—-200-AR
221
LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
EEGAL- DESERIFT-ION- Lt—4u6-51k—1a~—Sycan—Unat S —
ACREAGE s.40 o
$25Q.

RONALD 5 FREEMAN
ET - o 7118~ MELAREN - AVE = o oo
CITY, STATE ZIF CANOGR FARK, CA 91307

331301 3a0—-a37Q00-200-0Q - -
76339

TTAAX- LOT NUMBER - R
ILKEY 1

S50LD. AT. AUCTION




LOCATION HLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LEGAL DESIRIPTLDN Lt qu Elk 18, SyCdn Unit hFFE
2.7 -
$'b@ Q2

RONALD S FREEPMAN
7118 MCLAREN AVE
CITY,-STATE ZIF CANOGA FARK, - CA 913a7.

TEX LOT NUMBER R3313-01200-03800—-00A-02
CKEY ... . 17684 ..
LOCATION KLAMATH FQLL: FOREST ESTATES
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 15C, Blk 18, Sycan Unit HKFFE
ACREAGE S. 30
$250. 09 - -

RONALD 5 FREEMAN

7118 MCLAREN AVE
CITY, STATE ZIF  CANDGA FARK, CA 91307

:« TAX LOT NUMBER R3313-01302-23900-00Q—ad

—HKEY 176375

—wLDCQfIUN—~—~-v~~~VLQMQTH FALLS -FOREST-ESTATES— ~
I LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lt 15D, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACRERGE 12.24

‘?SQLE FRICE $500. AR

---80LD—-F—~— - - -~--DAN-HEFNER ——--

. BSTREET 727 MADRONE

'-VLITY STATE ZIF SUNNYVALE, CAR 94u86

TQ* LOT NUMBER ‘ RE;} Q13- @41@@ PaninBiing
762
A

l:LDCQTIDN VL MATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
-LEGAL—DESCRIFT-ION - Lt—JGD, Blk—18,8ycan-Unit-HKFFE-— -
2= ACREAGE - 64
SALE FRICE $S2Q. 3@
1SOLD TO DAN JEFNER
—8FREET——— o - 727-MADRONE——
CITY, STATE ZIF SUNNYVALE, CAR 94286

77
A

TQk—LGT NUMBER—-——-R33153-@:21 Q- 334 30— QA ~GQ
~ KEY 176352

- LOCAT KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTARETS
LEGéh DESCRIPTIDN %t &R, Blk 6, Sycan Unit KFFE

$7@@.@@
VOLTURNO ADAMO
T 35353 LOWER LAKE ROAD

S-S TATE—Z I P— —KLEAMATH-FALYS, -OR-9S76@1

TAX LOT NUMBER RE313-222@00—-Q24d0—-A0Q~-Q1D

KEY: — —-176687F

LOCATI KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LEGAL DESCRIPFIDN Lt 14B, Blk &, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE 11.31

SALE-FRIEE - ~-—3 5QQ e e
SOLD TO VOLTURND ADAMG

SOLLD. AT. AUCTION"




2530 LOWER LAKE ROAD
KLHMQTH FQLLS UR 9B7ec1

TAX LOT NUMBER 1 3-023I00-PEZCO-BOL-0R
KEY Qa8

LOCATION. KUAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 5B, Blk 17, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE

SALE FRICE $E5Q. A

S0LD -TO- - DAVID THONESON

STREET F O BOX 626

CITY, STATE ZIR QRCHDIR, CA 91v66

1QX LUT NUMBER RGJI —~ZIOD-AIQVQ—- 22D -G
EY 177@16
LOCQTIDN ~ KLAMATH FALLS FGREST ESTATES
«LEbQLnDEaDHIPTIDN Lt &8, -Blk--16, -Sycan-Unikt- REFE
.. RCREAGE 9.186
SQLE PRICE $250. AR
"S0OLD TO RONALD S FREEMAN
~aTREET - 7118 -MCLAREN-AVE. -
L. CITY, ETQTE /_IF' CANOGAR FARK, CA 91 @7

sﬁgéAhDTwNUMBERw~~w?$$é§~@&3®m—®31@0—@@@—D®w~~~
< LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
“TLEGAL DESCRIPTIDN Lt 2C, Blk 16, Sycan Unit KFFE
TAGREAGE-— - -~ .Cg, 691 —07 7 TrTAN PRt OATE
SALE FRICE $475. 20

JAMES L HAWKINS

X
CJTYr—STQTE~ZIP-—~BDNQNZQ —UR-—97623 —

";gx LOT NUMBER R3313-02300-03600-000-00

LoeaTion KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LEEELCDESCRIPTIDN L 75 Blk 16, Sycan Unit KFFE

A

UGLTURND ADAMO
; 3335 LOWER LAKE ROAD
;CITY, STATE ZID KLAMATH FALLS, UR 97n®1

TQ$ LOT NUMBER ?%%iiI@EEGQ—@37@@—®®®—®@
LBEATION————— KLAMATH- FAkLS-FOREST- ESTATES oo oo
LEGAL DESCRIRTION Lt 7C Blk 16, Sycan Unit KFFE

ACREAGE

SQLE FRICE $ u@.@@

TSOLED T8 — RONALD -5~ FREEMAN - — oo .

"DTREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE

CITY, STATE ZIRF CANOGA FARK, CA 91307

TAX LOT NUMBER 7 R3313—® ‘@@ a«e@@—mam 0@

SOLD.AT. AUCTION




KEY 17715Q
LOCATION } KLAMATH FaLLs FOREST EsTires
LEGHE”DESCRIPFION Lt 7D, Blk 16, Sycan Onit RFFE
AGE 12.57
$300. A

ACRE
RONALD § FREEMAN
7118 MCLAREN AUE
CANOGA FARK, cA 91za7

TAX LOT- NUMBER. - RESIB*@EB@@—B39®@—D®®—@B

KEY 177169 .
LOCATION KLAMATH FaLly FOREST EsTATES

T LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 8C, Blk 16, Sycan Unit KFFE

- RACRERGE - . . . - 1a. - - -

5 SN, AR

VOLTURND ADAMO
; 3535 LOWER LAKE Roap
CITY, STATE zIp - KLAMATH FRLLS, or 9784

S TRAX LOT NUMBER R3313—®E4@@—®®16®—@@®—®D
e MEY—e T T B Ry 4C 2 e T Tt eeem L
L LOCATION KLAMATH FalLLs FOREST eSTATES
- LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 7B, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFrg
T RCREARGE 1Q. 5@
‘SALE-PRICE . BT 1=t T, I, .
. SOLD TO ANDY GRAHAM
‘- - STREET 3508 LINDBERG 5T
T CITY, STATE ZIR {LAMATH FALLs, o

- TAX LOT NUMBER R3313—®E4®D—@®E@@—@@@—@@
KEY 177310
&GBQi&QN“-—m~M~T—KLQMQTHvFREES—FGRESI~ESTQTESW—~ww
LEGAL DESCRIFTION L+t 7C, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
RCREAGE 12.51
SALE FRICE $32Q. 2@

nr80LD-TO- T ONDY—-GRAHAM —.. . _

i_STREET 3308 LINDBERG ST

-+ CITY, STATE ZIR \LAMATH FALLS, 0w

o AT e
2 TAX LOT NUMBER R3313—®E4®@—®®3@®—D®®—®®
S HKEY . 177329
o KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
TI DN-li_—p‘—BB,—B lk—1 &8y--Syecan-Uni CRFFE-——
.53
$50Q, a@
T ANDY GRAHAM
—STREET . —3F08-LINDEERG..ST R T e ——————
CITY, STATE z1p KLAMATH FALLS, oR

—TQX—LDI~NUMBERm-—R3313—®E4@@—@@7@@—@@@—@@—~m~--—_~nﬂ—m«»-mw
KEY 177579

KFFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 3D, it KFFE
ACREAGE— — """ 1a.33".F B e
" SALE PRICE




SOLD 7O UDLTURNO QDQND
STREET 3535 LOoW LﬁHb ROARD
EFTYy-STRTE Z1If KLAMATH FQL GR 97s@1

TAX LOT NUMBER RGSI“—@;4@@ LTl R Y Sy
CKEY- .. .. :

/. - 177 .
LULQTIUN lFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt SE, R1k 1&g Syecan Unit KFFE
ACRERGE 8.1 8
SALE-PRICE . . - 3250, Qg
SOLD TO PUNQLD S FREEMAN
STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE
LITY STQTE ZIR CANOGA PQRK CQ 9lu0/

"TAX LOT NUMBER : DE4HRD-205 do-agH— —-aQ
EY '

L LOCATION—... . o S
- LEGAL DESCRIATION [ Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFg

S ACR
‘5 =3, G
“~ - RONALD- 5- FREEMAN
7118 MCLAREN AVE
STATE z21IR CANDGR FARK, ChA 913@7

{TQX LOT NUMBER  Ra513-amign -01000-000-pa

1/7q4g
LDCQTIDN FFE
LEGRL_DESCRIDTIDN Lt 96, Blk -18, Sycan -Unit KFFE
" ACREAGE 8.@8
SHLE PRICE S3Q. QA
.80 RDNQLD S FREEMAN
STREET—M— T o711 B—MOLAREN- AVE - e U
“CITY, STATE zIm CANOGA FARK, CA %1z3a7

::Tgé—hDTnNUMBER—~ RSEI; 22499—@13@@—@@@—@@—-~—wu~~w~~m«~~~~~—~~~w»w»~
CKE 17
- LOCATION KFFE

TéggQL DESCRIFTION %t BQ Blk 18 Sycan Unlt KFFE
— e 0. —— ——

SQLE FRICE $;u@ @@

S0LD TO UDLTURND ADAMO

STREET 535 LOWER LAKE ROAD

G}$¥-STQTE—ZIP~»—HLQMQTH-FQLLS OR— 9/b@1~——~~—_~—-~~———m~~~~‘~~~~—“-~»———

I e —————— e ——

TQX LOT NUMBER RE313-0z400- @14@@—@@@ -

= TR rE9 s 7T TTeT
<_LOCQTION RLAMATH FALLS FOREST EsTATES
- LEGAL EESCPIPTIDN L% 7? Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE

ACRE
— P QR e . T e e




TARX LOT NUMBER ; ; 4P0Q-21 50— -2

HEY i

LOCAT1O -FALLS FOREST-ESTATES
LEGAL DEbCRIPTIDN L L Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE

. B
R B . UULTURND ADAMO
STREET 39539 LOWER LQKE HOQD
ciTYy, STATE ZIpP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97621

TAX LOT NUMBER T2 Q4 DB—D 16 QR—2BA-BD
- KEY
~LOCA H H FALLS FDRLbT ESTATES
LEGQL DEQCRIPTION L.t -14F, -Blk 18, -Sycan Unit-- HKFFE-
AAQCHtQGE 7.9%
‘SALE FRICE $£D®
~30LD 70 RONALD S rHCEMQN
STREET———-— o = 41 18- MCOLAREN-AVE -— -~ mom oo e
CITY, STATE ZIF CANGGA FARK, CA 913a7

FAX--LOT— NUMBER. - --R33 I-Q240—01 700 -2QH—-30 ————-

“HKEY 177267
- LOCATI KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
“’LEGQL DESCRIPTIDN Lt 14E, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE
;'QCREQGE}—w—wa—M_——w~?r91-—wuﬁu—wmw—w«~nm-#~—~— e
CiSALE FPRICE $250. 2@ .

o SOLD TD RONALD S FREEMAN

CiSTRE 7118 MCLAREN AVE

-«CITY, STQTE"ZIP CANOGA--PARK—-CA--91307 -

TQX LOT NUMBER T?%l;;@EQ@@—@iB@@—@@@—@@
PJLDCQTIDN KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
\_EGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 14D, Blk 18, Sycan Unit HKFFE
ACREAGE 7.91
SALE—PRICE—-———————$250 Q& s
[t RDNQLD S FREEWQN
=2 STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE
S CITY, STATE ZIF CANOGA FARK, CA 91387

;2{5 LOT NUMBER R §;29@¢4@@—@19@a—@m—m
/=

1=:DCAT-10 ~——-—-KLF\MF—\TH—»FQLLS FORESTEGTATES — - —mmme — omm = o rmmmsoeee

LEGAL Df:bCRII TIDN Lt 14C Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE

ACREAGE .91
L SALE FPRICE $250. 00

| 2BED T~ - RONALD -5 - FREEMAN-
eI STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE
JZRITY, &TATE zIF  CANOGA FARK, CA 91307

TAX LOT NUMBER RE2313-02400-0210@-QBQ—aA

KEY 177&&@

LOCATI K

LEGAL— DEQCRIF‘TIDN Lt*-i‘rB ~Blk-18,—Sycan-tUnit-KFFE- ——— = -
ACREAGE 12.8

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




RICE
T

STATE Z1p A ss086

—TQX1L0T~NUMBERW 3—@34@@~@E4@@—@@@—@®»
. REY SE :
- LBCATIUN
"LEGAL DESCRIFTION i 18, Syean Unit Krrge
~BCREAGE. . - = e - -
SALE FRICE
- SOLD TO
"STREET
DIJW,«STQTEwZJP~~~

o

”4@@—@35@@—@@@—@@

LOCATION =
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 12B, Ei1k 18, Sycan Unit KFpg

T RACREAGE 3. 86
SQLE—PRICE~%~“—~»~‘«w~$35®.Q@---m——-w~-~»‘—m»~‘~~-n-~~-‘-‘
SULD TO RONRLD 3 FREEMAN

: STREET 7118 MCLAREN AyE

TCITY, sSTare ZIF C ARK, cAQ 31307

< TAX
TKEY
TLOCATION FE— —_
~LEGAL DESCRIFTIG Lt 11A, B1k 13, Sycan Unit
- ACREAGE 9. &&
TSALE & $260. op

-SOLD-TC — =TURND-ADAMG

* STREET 535 LOWER LAKE ROAD

- CITY, STATE z71m KLAMATH FaLLs, R 976@1

LOT Numper '—@Eé@@~@86@@~@@@—@@

ZTAX LaT NUMBER ?3313-@24@@—@&7@@~@@@~@@

+HEY 177429 :

- LocAaTtIon KFFE

;fEEGQE~DESGRIPTIONw&t~éng~Blk%iBywSycan-Unit~KFFE-—-w~w—~“—~~n
S.

$. Q0
NO BID
STREEF——_ . NO BID
—CITY, sTaTE z1p

T~ NUMBER- - R33
EY 7392

LOCATION KFFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION L% 12, Ri1k 18, Syecan Unit KFFg
QBREQGE&~~—~«“—H--“9r86—~-w~~~-»>w~w~*~‘-M—ﬁ~~—~~»~—~«~
$325. Qg
: VOLTURND RDAMO
- STREET S335 LOWER LAKE RrRoap
mCI$¥r“STQTE~ZIP"~'KLRMQTH~FQLES,~OR~976@Lm

SDLD.QT.QUCTIDN




FAX LOT NUPMBER - 400-0E92Q-DE2 -2
':\{ - R -

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIFTION Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE 9. 86

SALE FRICE.
SGLD TO

STREET .
CITY, STATE ZIR
TAX LOT NUMBER - Q2400031 00— DP2 -0

KEY -

LOCATION KFFE_ - . . e
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt » Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE ae

. EET
- CITY, STRTE ZIF

fQX LoT NUMBER ) @G @@
hCY
. LOCATION
-~ LEBAL - DESCRIFTION - »--Blk-18,--Sycan--Unit-KFFE--
.. ACREAGE .
--SALE FPRICE $. 2
TT8OLD TO

L STREET oo -
ZECITY, STATE LJ.F'

»—JQX-LDTNNUMBER ~-REZ13-02400-034 00~ 000~ 0P e
/

LDCQTIUN KFFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 12C, Blk 18, Syean Unit KFFE
ACREAGE —- — - - - - Q.86 ..o LT TT T T TR
“SALE PRICE $. 0@

-+ S0LD TO NGO BID

= STREET

—»CITYr~5TQTE A

TAY LOT NUMBER 3313
) S —— 774
'“LDDQTIDN KFF FE_
.. LEGAL DESCRIFTIGON Lt ic
- ACREAGE 9.
L SALE-FRICE - o $.Q@
2S0LD_T0 NO BID
STREET
‘"CITY, STATE ZIF

=

=

—
&

g—@;4@@ et igvinly vt

D, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE

TQ§ LOT NUMBER QZ422-Q35QQ-2RQ-AQ

KEY

LOCATIOUN.. R O U
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 13€, Blk 18, Sycan Unit KFFE

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




ACREAGE
SALE F‘RI CE
“S0LD-Tg---
STREET _
CITY, STATE z1m

e o (1T
<>Dn

NER -
RONE
LE, CAL 94066

-~

T NUMBER  Raz =Rl Ty T

'LDCQTIUN HFFE )
LEGQL DEQCRIPTIGN Lt IED BRlk 14, Sycan. Unit KFFE
=

) $. 00
NO BID

Tgx LOT-NUMBER - - R3313-02400- —~03800-000-0@
EY 177695

'LDCQTION KFFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 3n, B1k 16, Sycan Unit Krrg
- ACREAGE — 9.51% S LTI TNE N
SALE FRICE s, @
50LD TG NO BID

T STREET

;sCITwaSTQTE Z1p -

LDCQTIDN FFE

LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt SB, Blk 16, Syecan Unit KFFe
- ACREAGE 9.u

SARE-FERIGE—— . _ "

2 80OLD TO

STREET

LIFY STQTE ZIP

“Tax Lot NUMBER Ra215-az400- T03900-20a-on
KEY.- 1z7cae

= TAX LOT NUMBER 3—@34@@—@4@@@—@0@—@@
s KEY 77
LOEATION — ~KFF e
LEGAL DESCRIPTIDN Lt uC Blk 16 Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE 9.9
‘SALE FRICE
SOLD—TFO— . UDLTURND QDQMD T e
STREET 2535 LOWE LAKE RoAD
CiTy, sTaATE ZIFR RLAMATH FF)LLq OR 97c@1

-TAX LOT NUMBER  Ras 31 3-02400-04200- 000 -0
KEY 177659
LOCATION KFFE
LEGAL-DESCRIFTION- Lt- 2B Blk -16,-Sycan Unit-Kkere..
ACREAGE
- SALE PRICE " $is0. oo
. SOLD TO DAN HEFNER
CSTREET—- ... T LB MADRONE -
= CITY, STATE z1FS0NN YUQLE CA 94086

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




vax LOT - NUMBER DELDP-DAELA~DED~2D

KEY

LOCATION ) B

{ECAL DESCRIFTION Blk 16, Sycan Unit KFFE

ACREAGE - .
SALE ERICE Seq. 00

SuLD _TO RRY K COON

STREET =24 SE ERMINE

C1TY, STATE ZIF LBANY, OR 972

tf' \.C' BTG
1D
['l

TQX LOT NUMBER A 2400~ 47 00~ DOE- 12

EY-
LDPQT 10N
LEGAL DESCRIRPTION Lt A, Blk 16, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE 11. 36
CGALE RPRICE- e oo S 1, T 7. 1 P
SoLD TO VOLTURND ADRAMO
STREET 55 LOWER LAKE ROAD
‘CITY, STQTE ZID VLQNQTH FQLLS, OR 976@1

TaY LOT NUMBER R3313-0E400-05600-002-00
- KEY L7770
L BCATION e o M F B i S
" [EGAL DESCRIFTION L% €n, Blk 1&, Sycan Unit KFFE
-  ACREAGE 9.6
SALE PRICE $450. 00
-80LDTO- — -~  GEORGE ~FONDELLA - — oo e
STRE 266 RIVER BEND ROAD
c1rv, 'oTaTE zIF  CHILOGUIN, OK 27624

TAX ‘Lot T NUMBER R3313-02400—Q5720--Q2a-2d

T KEY 177711

1.0CA KFFE

-LEGQL DESCRIPTIDV Lt-—-6B,-- Blk~1br«qycan»UnltﬂHFF:—»—ﬂn
- ACREARGE 7.84
TSALE PRICE $o0@. BA
7 S0LD T0O . GEORGE FONDELLA

STREET— e 296 RIVER-BEND--ROAD

,‘CITY, STATE ZIF CHILOQUIN, OR 976&4

-TAX- LOT-NUMBER. — -R32 B 1 e
KEY 178391

“lGeaTioN KEFE
oA ESCRIFTION Lt 4B, Blk 14, Sycan Unit KFFE
'~QDREQGE———~_W«~--—~8 R

.gALE FRICE $2oR. 0@

-8sOLb TO DAVID THDMF‘SDN

STREET B 0 BOX 626

CITY-maTQTE 21 ~AREADIA—CA—9 1@EE - mrmmr T

“TAX LOT NUNBLR @;6@@—@@4@@ @@@—@0

CREY -
S LOCATION

SULD. AT. AUCTION




DESCRIFTION Lt 43 Blk 14, Sycan Unit Kreg
3 .G

GreE- - H»fB”;H&MpsDN
STATE 215 HRLHDIQ CA 91uves

G‘
mD
@
m

L
Sy

OUUJUM.'
~i‘"r'f‘:n
< momm
s m

=0
w

TAX LoT NUNBER Ruulu‘kis BA-a1aap- —QRa-ap

KEY
LDLQTIUN - - KFFE .
EGQL DESLRIPTIDN Lg 88’ Blg 14 Syean Unit KFFE
$gq@ g
O DQU THGMPSDN

STREET BUX 626
CIiTy, STATE z1m QRCQDIQ CA 91084

;fﬁimld?hﬁﬂﬁééﬁﬁ”“>:§d>mé /@@—@@8@@-@@@—6@nm
E

’FLDCQTION
~»LEGQL~DEQCRIPTION qulk~6r»Sycan~Unit‘KFFE~~

ACREAGE
S@. @

S
DAYID" THOMESON
F-0-BOX. GG
ARCADIA, Ca S1@es

E?@B—@l9@@—@@@—@@~~—m

LDCQTIUN
LEGAL DESDRIDTIDN Ceh Blk 11, _Sycan P Unit Kepg
ACREAGE— ST g 7 0 Sycar

bQLE I . 0@
SOLD Tg D THDMPSDN

bTREE P 0 BOX 6ga
C1TY, 6TQTE~ZIP—~~QRCQDIQ q—eaaaeuﬁﬁ-ﬂ‘--»-~a‘—

f;?¢ LOT NUMBER { g8®@~@®uw® ~0QR-py
LOLQTIDN
LEGAIL DESCRIE Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE 3
4aRLE—PRIGE- - ——— e
_‘SDLD TO

-+ STREET
CITY STATE ZIP QRLQDIQ LQ 91@66

~TQX Laor NUMBER R3313—9g828—684@®—@@®~®@
179524

-~LGCQTIDN'~—~-» KEFE— . T e
“LEbQL DEDLRIPTIDN Lt 11D, Bik &, Syean Unit krre

11,
$gq0 1)
DRU:D THDUPSGN-~“
ISPy

SOLD.QT.QUCTION




CITY, 5TATE ZIF ARCADIA, CR 91066

Tnx LOT NUMBER R '@aa@@—m14®@4mmm—@m

LDCHTIDN .

LEGAL: D:SLRIPTIUN Lt Blk 7, Sycan unit WFFE
ACRERGE 1@. Q2

SALE RRICE & 400, D2

SOLD TO QHFSDN

STREET

Lll\, STATE

TAX LOT- CNUMBER

HEY

LocaTIu )
LEGAL i 7, Sycan Unit KEFE
QDREQCE : :
SALE PRI CE =3 @

. goLb TG DRUID THDMPSON

aTthT p 0 _BOX =¥
\CIFY TATE-ZIF- RRQLDIQ;-‘R g1@66 -

-TAX LOT NUMBER R
CKEY-— T T -1
. LDCQTIDN
. [EGAL DE SCRIFTION L
T’QCREQGE 9.

. RICE e Qe T T [N
SoLD _TO DQUID THgMPSDN

~‘SFREET © O _BOX 62h
CIT STQTE ZIF QRCQDIQ, 91066

S

313 ME @m—@hemm @mm—mm
? e R
, Blk 7, Sycan Unlt KFFE

lf;g¢ LOT NUMBER 1o—m_a@®—me7@m—@@m—am
ﬁochlu B [ R
EGEEbLRIPTIUN =y =8, Blk 7, Syean Unit WFFE
RICE 3250, 00
rumeﬂUID—THDMpGDNA——-
£ 0 BaX 626
CRCADIA, CA 91066

R3S
179
_WFF

2 TAR LOT NUMBER R3313—® 8@@ @'bGG—GGG—GQ
HKEY 179817
LOCATIO WFF
LECQL DEQDRIPFIDN Lt,JBQ,.Blkﬂlr_chanwunit_KFFEW,,M-wWM
QLRLQ 9.
T SALE FRICE $275. 00
DAVID THDNPSDN
g-0-BOX- Hizb- IUNIR
QRCQDIQ, CA 91@66

;WEQQ0—®14@0—@@0—@®~

SGLD.QT.QUCTIDN




LOCATION KFFE o
LECHL DESLRIPTIUN Lt iR, Blk 3, Sycan Unit KFEFE

PRICE o é@@ 2@
Eh GEDRGE FONDELLA

aTkEET 296 RIVER END RAGD
CITY, STATE zI1p CHILOQUIN OR 97&24

TAX LOT NUMBER
REY. 2
LOCATION KIFF

LESQL DESCRIPTIDN Lt 2D

ACR .85

SALE PR1ce $350. 0

SULD TO DQVID THUH‘"GN
STREET 0 BOX &z

CITY, STATE zIf QRCQDIFI Ch dleee

'.ﬁﬁé LOT NUMBER R3313-0z900~ —21800-20a-na
N E T

18@4
LOCATION . o FFE--
gEbQL DESCRIPTIDN Lt uﬂ Blk 5, Syean Unlt lFFb
CR
SAiLE PRIC& $ug |
SOLD TG e -DAVID- THDMPSDN
“BSTREET B O BOX 586
_CITY, STATE ZI1p QRCQDIQ €A 91vsa

TQX LOT NUMBER 'Ré'13;@39@d—6e7®w—aé629®

19a5
LDCQTION
LEGQLGDEDCRIPTIDN Lt 4B Blk«uywSycan*Unit“KFFE~
(5\_!;..-_’.
DQUID THDNPSDN
—STREET—-——«»»-W RO BOX- 6E6 e
CITY STATE ZIR QRCQDIQ LQ 91@66

TOX—LOT-NUMBER-- .. ~R¢3}3—@E9®@—®31@@—B@®—®@-Q~H»~~~«~vn~~~~M~~m
KEY 182376
LOCATIUN KFFE
LEGAL DpE ZR, k 3, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE-— e -9 . 8& T e
SALE S0@. 9@

CGEORGE PONDELLA
286 RIVER BEND RGAD
¥—CITY—~aTQTE~LIP --CHILDUQIN-—-DR--‘Bfc:n_*f—<—~—-»—~—»————~~—»~—»w

'TQX LOT NUMBER REEIE—@;Q@Q —QE2Q2-2ne-2p

REY— e iBaa “4~m»~~v~~—~»---~—~~~_mw-u~_-~wu~

* LGCATION KEFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 1G, Blk S5, Sycan Unit kere
8

ACREAGE
T 3050, @R e .
GEORGE FONDELLA

SULD. AT. AUCTION




=36 EBEND ROAD
3TRTE ZIF CHI OR 97624

VER
LOGUIN,

TAX LOT NUMBER REZ13-0E95Q0~-B32Qa-a0Q0—-QQ
HKEY 182z

LOCATION - KFFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 1
RCREAGE 2. 66

SALE PRICE 3759, 00

SOLD TO . GEONGE pDNDELLQ -
STREET =86 RIVER BEND ROAD
CITY, STATE ZIPR CHILOQUIN, OR 978624

3-
@8
B, Blk 5, Sycan Unit KFFE

TQA LOT NUMBER Hugla—ﬂgﬂwﬂ @:9®@~w@w -2
EY 180440
LUCQTIDN HFFE
“LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt . 18D, Bilk 5, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACRERGE 3. 86

- 8ALE FRICE $375. Q@
"SOLD 7O DQUID THDMPbDN

-STREET- . B -ROX--62 -

L CITY, STATE ZIEF QRCQDIQ LQ 91@66

ilTanLGT~NUMBERw~~~R33
L KEY av

15-@

K 792

- LOCATION VFFE

LtGQL DtSCRIPTIDN Lt 3R, Blk 1, Sycan Un1t HFFE
ACREA - 19,89 - e :

SALE PRICt $g7q.@®

SOLL TU RONALD S FREEMAN

STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE

—CIFy—STATE- ZIF —-CANOGA-FPARK,~CA--9 1 3@ 7o e .

BIQB—G190A-A0H—aQ-

‘TéX LOT NUMBER R3315- @o@@@ @;D@@ @@@ 17

. .1B i S

. LOCATION KFFE

LEGAL DESCRIFTIUN L.t ‘,B, Rlk 1, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE 1. a5

SALE- FRICE- - —w e $ 250, Q01 -

SOLD 7O RONALLD S FREEMAN

STREET 7118 MCLAREN AQVE

CITY, STATE ZIF  CANOGA FARK, CA 91307

TAX LOT NUMBER AZROV-02 1 00— A0A-20

LOCATION o KFE - —

LEGAL DESCRIFTION 30, Blk 1, Sycan Unit KFFE
GE ia. s

$25@. 2@
~-RONALD ~S -FREEMAN -~ - = .-
7118 MCLAREN AVE
CANOGA FARK, CA 913Q7

REET
S CITY, STATE ZIR

TAX LOT NUMBER  R3313-03000-03500-000-00

SOLD.AT. AUCTION




HREY 180949
LQ%S'IUE CRIFTION EFFf Blk &, g it KER
5 HE%GE S S BB’ Ss oyean Unit KFFE

bQLE FRICE $3Q2. AR
©S4ULD T0 GEORGE FONDELLA
-E96 RIVER _BEND ROAD

STQTE Zip CHILOGUIN, Ogr S76E4

TAX LOT NUMBER R3IJ1Z-a320Q0- @34@@—@@@—@@
KEY 18@9#8
LOCATIUN FFE
- LEGAL, DESCRIFTION Lt 1C, B1lk 2, Sycan Unit KFFE
- ACREAGE R =T Sl e
aﬁU:. I-F(IL,E. $300., pa
. S0L TU GEORGE FONDEL LR
~~STRLEF =56 RIVER BEND ROABD
,‘CIIYVVSTQTE ZIFR . CHILGuUIN -OR -R7824

‘“TQX LOT NUMBER Raula—@uwﬂﬂ —R3S0D-R@@—-Gp

_.,l»/ e 18 @a9e7. _ _ "TTC e

LUCQTIUN FFFE
7 LEGAL D:SCRIPTIDN Lt =B, Blk Z, Syecan Unit KFFE
T ACREARGE 3. 86
-—SQL&—DRICE T — -SSR, Q. e
SOLD T GEORGE FONDELLA .
.,STREET S96 RIVER BEND ROAD
: STQ1L ZIP LHILDOUIN OR 9/6“'

(TAX LOT NUMEER REEIS—@E@@@—@QB@@-@@@—@@
EY 8iloas

LOCATION- —~HKFFE_ e

LEBHLG s = Schn Unit KFFe

$ . ag
S0L - e RDNQLD S FREEMAN- - T e e
STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE
CITY, STATE z1pm CANOGA FRARK, CA 91za7

TRX LOT NUMBER R3313-as000- ~04400-000—az

‘K 18147
LDCQTIDN KFFE
- gggQL DEQCRIPTIDN Lg 169,»Blk-;ruSycan~Unit~KFFE
: E .
SQLE PRICE S5, 2
T o HUNQLD 5 FREEMAN
STREETw«»m»» -~ 7118 MCLAREN- AVE—

CITY STATE ZIP CANOGA FARK, CaA 91za7

“‘E§$ LUT- NUMBER--Roulo—@S@E@—@4S@@~@@@-@@-"M-»umm;r
&

151@
d- LOCATION FE
jTLEGQL DESCRIFTION Lt 17D, Blk g, bycan Unlt HFFE
—~QCREQC& e T8, 88. LT e .
bQLb FRICE & 5@ @0




50LD TO
STREET
CITY,

STATE ZIF

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIFTIONM
ACREAGE
BALE-FRICE

SuLD _TO

STREET

cIiTY, STATE ZIR

TAX LOT NUMBER
CHEY

LOCATION -
LEGAL DESCRIFTION
- ACREAGE

sSALE FRICE

. 80LD- TO-

L STREET
“C1TY, STATE ZIF

~ TAX LOT NUMBER

L KEY

-~ LOCATION

~ LEGAL -DESCRIFTION -
= ACREAGE

-7 SALE PRICE

~'30LD 1O

STREET e oo -
‘CITY, STATE ZIF

T LOT-NUMBER -

\

4
.- LOCATION

"~ EGAL DESCRIFTION L

. ACREAGE — -
- SALE ERICE
“30LD _TO

~“STREET
L EITY,- STATE-ZIF. -

©TAX LOT NUMBER
CUMEY e

S LBCATION

. LEGAL DESCRIFTION
- ACREAGE

Z BALE-FRICE - m =

SOLD TO
. STREET
CCITY, STATE ZIF

50LD.AT. AUCTION

KLAMATH FALLS,

DAVID THOMESON
£ 0 BUX 626
ARCADIA,

Ch 91@68
—PI0OR~-25 1 QY- A -2

Blk =, Sycan Unit KFFE

$ZSd. BG

RONALD S FREEMAN
7118 PMCLAREN
CANDOGR FARK,

AVE
CA 91307

210@a—-Q1200-2Qa-Q@

333

OR 976121

23100-01300-200-20

Q2
ORGE FONDELLA
e—RIVER-REND--ROAD ---— -
ILORUIN, OR 97624

? Q3100-31900-QRP—ad- -

can Unit WKFFE

gD, Blk 2, S¥

D3 1ZO—A3IZVA-P2QB-2d

KFFE

Sycan Unit

GEORGE FONDELLA
256 RIVER BEND ROAD
EAILOGUIN, OR 976&4




&Eé LOT NUMBER D3 10A-DZ4DE—RED QR
LacaTl _ .
LEGAL DtbCRIPTION &y Sycan Unit HKFFE
ACREA 8. 86

SALE PRICE .

SOLD--TO - . GEQRGE.- FONDELLA

STREET 296 RIVER BEND

C1TY, STATE ZIF  CHILOGUIN, OR

Téé-LDT NUMBER Raaizjwueam—mmawa—www—@m

18:W8-
LOCATION KFFE
EEESL DESCRIFTION Lt BQ Blk- 7, Syecan Unit -HFFE
SALE pPICt $. 08
SOLD TO D
SBTREET——— - 0 o
CITY, STATE ZIF

~ TAX--LOT- NUMBER. - QIZQD-DDEQD~ DR~ D e

R3
KEY 15
KE
Lt

71
D,

- LDCATION
 LEGAL DEDCRIPTIGN

Elk 7y 8Sycan Unit KFFE

,:...._w._,ﬁ,,.. A —
S0. G
GEDRGE PONDELLA
296 RIVER BEND ROAD

- -CHILOBUIN,—OR-97684% -~ — oo o

F
6
$

TAX LOT NUMBER R2313-03200-01400-200-0n
AEA~—~—-—~~-~~~48&199»—*"
LOCATION KEFE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 12B, Blk 5, Sycan Unit
T ACREAGE 9. 86
CSALE PRICE— e 4 @
=2 30LD TO NO BID
- STREET
j;chY, STATE ZiF

~-THX LOT NUMBER R3313-23200-01700~-22@—Q

o 18:@64
LDCQ:IUN e e M R e
"LEGAL. DESCRIFTION Lt 14C, Blk 5, Sycan Unit
ACREAGE 9. 86

L~ SALE RPRICE $200. G
:DLD-TU~—_~————-—GEDRGE~PDJDELLQM~~—~—~~—~—-~~m
.STREET 96 RIVER BEND ROAD
CITY STATE ZIF CHILDGUIN, OK 97624

ggé LOT NUMBER BIERD-DERRD-BAY-Ta

TLOCATION K
" LEGAL—~DESCRIFTION- S =3y Sycan-Unit-KFFE - - -
ACREAGE

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




SALE FRICE

SCOLD ro

STREET :
CITY, STATE zIm

TRX LOT. NUMBEK —BEE@@—@ES@@—@@Z—@@
KEY =g
LGCATIUN

LLbJL DESCRIFTION Blk qaycan “nlt VIFE

CREAGE
- $250. rajr]
DQVID THOMESON
0 BOX &6
s 3TRTE ZIR QRDQDIQ CA - 91mea .

aHx LaT NUMELH Ra¢14—®“;@@-®41w@~®®® =121

AEY. _. - -181911 7 S L
LDLQTIDN HKFFE

LEGAL. DESCRIFTION Lt oB, Blk 5, Sycan Unit KFFE
T ACREAGE 9.

“SALE-PFRICE ... .. ___ " ~$.D®ﬁ»nm~w
,ﬁULD }D ND BID

i;;gx LOT NUMBER z ~B4Z00-0Qa-a@

“LOCQtIUN - FFE... .. . e
LEGAL DESCRIPTIUN Lt &R, Blk S, Sycan Unit PFFE
- ACREAG - 86

- SALE FRICE . 0@

7—30 LD TD—-—~—~-_N,DNU BID_ __
STREET

.CITY STATE z1p

TQX LOT NUMBER

LDCQTIUN KFF
—LECQL—DESCRIPTIDN - 5r~8ycan_Unit_KFFE“_MhR___H__ML”
_ACREAGE 5. 86
- SALE F~RICE
-SOLD TO
~—bTREET e
CITY, sTaTte ZIP

T@X~LDT—NUMBER— ----- R231 glseee-es400-000-00e

LOCATION FFE
LEGAL 52ESCRIFTION e I8 Blk 5, Syean Unit KFFE
- ACREAG 9,8 - : :
SALE PRICC 3. 00

SOLD TO NO BID
CSTREET

CITY, STATE-ZIR-- - oo .

SULD.AT. AUCTION




TAY LOT NUMEBER
UCATIUN

LEGAL DESCRIFTION
RACREAGE

SALE PRICE.

SCLD TU

STREE

CITY, STATE Z1p

TQX LOT NUMBER —RB5720-0aa—-aa

LDCQTIGN cooe o KERE. L —
F bycan Unlt KFFE

TEX'LQT NUMBER
K
- LOCATIUN

- LEGAL_DESCRIFT

- ACREAGE
TSALE PRICE . @
~SULD TO ERvID ;HDMESDN

[ o] —& e

S5TATE ZIp QRLQDIQ CA 91066

3?1;:@33@@—@11@@—@@a=a®_w_»__um»Mamw-wﬁh

- 182670

LOCATIUN KFFE

iLEGQL DESCHIPFIDN Lt &D, Blk 12, Sycan Unit KFFE

ACREAGE 1. T TG ggr BiR 18, « e
:QLt FRICE $250. Py
SOLD T DAYID THDNHSDN ‘
STREET F O BOX 626

-CITY,—STATE 210 . . ARCADIA, - CA 91Q&6 —. . ..

‘TAX LoT NUMBER ?g@é 833@@ @18@@ @@@ -
~ LOCATION FFE
- LEGAL DESCRIRTION Lt &R, Blk 12, Sycan Unit KFFE
T ACREAGE 9. 86
- bQLE~PHICva»~~u»m-M~$ COQ-Q@- - s R
SOLD TO DQUIg THDMPSDN

B0
STQTE ZTP QRCQDIQ CQ 91@66

S TAX-LOT-NUMBER- ... R
“KEY

TAX LOT NUMBEK

. KEY

S LOCATION o . e S
LEGHL DESCRIPTIDN ’ by an Unlt KFFE

S0LD. AT. AUCTION




SON
912&6

o D W
Qo<

D el
whdel gy

TAX LDT NUNBbR

KEY

LOCATION

CEGAL -DESCRIFTION
ACREAGE

SALE FRICE

SoLD _TO

STREET - .
CITY, STATE ZIF

TAX- LOT NUMBER {3-Q3300-D4800-QAR-2D
HEY 2849
LOCATION (FFE

CEGAL DESCRIFTION L% 9B, 7, Sycan Unit KFFE
ACREAGE- - 9. : T P
SALE RPRICE

SOLD TU

STREET

BITYy-STQTE~ZIP

HE
LGCATION FFE
--PEAL  DESCRIFTION Lt 9C, Blk 7, Syean Unit KFFE
" AEREAGE 3. &t
TbQLEﬂPRICE_w“4

‘TQX LOT NUMBER R @@ @49@@ @@@ @@

CITY, Tyrate z1P

Blk 1@, Sycan an Unit t KFFE

S "B
IPTIDN 1
$

25. 00

_DRVID. THGMPSGNM_#”NW___N#.ANJWH_,Mﬂﬂm
P O BOX 626

ARCADIA, CA 91@86

TQX LOT NUMBER RgBl%;@uéﬂm—ﬂuuﬁm —QAY~—2

T;LDLQTION KFFE
. LEGRAL- DESLRIPTIGNHLt»liﬁ,_Blk~1®r~8ycanmUnit_HFFEJ~mm-

ACREAGE 9. 86

BQLE PFRICE $7Q@. @

- S0LD TO ROPR GARROSS

T.STREET Ce 1322 FERALTR---

- CITY, STATE ZIF BERKELEY, CA

SOlLD. AT. AUCTION




Jéx LUT NUMBER ? AI4QQ-BIEDO-20R—01a
LOCATIUN :

LEGQL DESCRIPTIDN Lt Blk 19, Syecan Unit KFFE
ACRE . o

DHLE PRICE " $500. a@

SOLD TU UB GARROSS

STREET S FERALTA

CiTy, sT1ATE 721m B&RH&L&¥ Ca

;Q¢ LOT NUMBER -Q340a- ®u9@@—mw@—m@

13-

134
LDCQTIDN E
LEGRL DESCRIFTION Lt lgﬂ Blk 1@, Sycan Urnit KrFrg

"BCREAGE
R 2740 v, T, S DR
DQUID THDMPSDN
F 0 BuXx &g
STATE ZIiR ARCADIA, Cﬂ 91@66

TRAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION oo
-LEGAL DESCRIFTION
ACREAGE
SALE ERICE $10, 0aQ, e
- SOLD-To - : UQMPLER LOGBING Co. Inc.
© STREET F g
:-CITY, STATE zIp LHILDDUIN *or 97634

WSS@@—@@S@@—B@@—@@
B

R331
1731
Sl

FE
554 SE4SH4 Sec. 25 Sycdn. Qecess?

TAX LOUT NUMBER R3437- @LBQ@ @14@@ @@@ @@
HKEY 196@1“
S LBCATION ST CHILOGUIN
*“SEEQE—DESLRIPTION NLNE4SN4NE4 SEC“"Br“QCCESS?“TMpROVrM_””””
S E T @

~ STREET———
SCITY, STATE z1p

WQX“EDT~NUMBER-~~—Rﬁg%?-@aQCD-@SI@@—@@@—@@~~m--w~~—~~»
{ =g =
.LOCATIUN CHILOQUIN

EggéL DESCRIFTION L78 68 & 69 bplnks Add. Chiloquin

SALE PRICE

SULD TO CDRNLLIUS

STREET by AVILAN RD

EFTY-STATE--Z I IS““LQ 9LQ/@“““M“W““‘“‘*“””““‘““‘

-TAX LOT NUMBER RZad7-034CD-032 00~ ~0ea-ga
Ky e 220061 -
~LoCATION EHICORUTN

SULD. AT. AUCTION




LEGAL DESCRIFTIUN LUTS 7@ & 71, Spinks Add. Chiloquin

600, Q@ - -
WHRhLN CORNEL IUS
STRE 1708 GAVILAN RD
CITY, STATE ZIF  FERRIS, CA 2370

ACREAGE
SALE ERICE

TH>\ LOT NUMBEKR S700-Q0Q—-Q@
I\E ¢
LOCATIUN- - ! - S - . -
LEGAL DESCRIFTION : Blk 5, 1st add. Chiloguin
ACRERGE

"SALE PRICE

-B0LD-TO-

STREET .

CITY, STATE ZIig

Iex Lot NUMEBER RaéiaS@h1c® T e

11344
LUCQIIUN HEFE
~LEGAL- DESCRIFTION -NZ SW4NH4SH4 SEC- 21, 5YCAN
. ACREAGE S
SALE FRICE $_,®@@ 2
"SOLD To GEORGE FONDELLA
STREET--- - ~- 296 RIVER- BEND- ROAD -
LCITY, RTQTE ZIK CHILOQUIN, OR 976=4

iwigé-LDT~NUMBER~ Ragag POIAR-DES AP~ QDD DG — e
,--_/\ e T

- Locarron ) CHILOGUIN

LEGAL GRESCRIFTION LOUT 13, BLOCK 3, 415 Ash St., Chilequin, IMEROV.

ACREAGE —— - e T T e DT D O CAEER, SPHROV.

$. @@

~~;2X LOT NUMBER S27-0Q3IAA-BE6DR-0RR-20
IHKEY—— S e
. LOCATION CHILDDUIN
'..LEuQL DESCRIFTION Lts i-3, BIlk 9, Chiloquin
-~ ACREAGE
SALE-FRICE - . $3, 400000 oo
- 30LD TO FRQNK T HEADLEY
I STREET F O BOX S5
CITY, STATE z1Ip LHILODUIN OR 97

= TAX LOT NUMBER R35Q7-0@3AC-21 100-202—aa
T KEY SEE547
L LOCATION-— - COTLGGUIN-—— -
" LEGAL DESCRIFTION 6@3 Thinrd Av., Chiloguin, IMFROV.
- ACREAGE
$.

“NO-BID-- -

SFPEEI

SULD. AT. AUCTION




City, sTaTte zip

TQX LoT NUNB:R k?—QZuQC @1¢®@-@@@—@@
HEY i S38

LOCATIUN LOGUIN

LEGAL _DESCRIfT CION - 9. Fonderosa Fk
ACREAGE

SALE FRICE $.Q0Q

SOLD TO NO RID
,aFREET

CITY, STATE ZIR

«s-Chiloguin

Dy i oy

MTQX»LUT~NUMBER4 uHC—DL9BD-0®®—@®
LGCQTIUN

GUIN
-LEGAL DtSLRIHTIuN 80. Chiloqguin
SACREAGE 7 T Y e ant
: SALE PRICE
.~ S0LD TO
"STREE
CITYFASTQTE ZIE..

= s e AR R e

TQX LOT NUNBER

—KE N o

LDCQTIDN ) .
'LEGAL gtSCRIPTIDN Chiloquin Drive

- TAX LOT NUMBER
S HEY

oRoCaTIoN-—.. .. ~SHORES-—— . ... ___
LEGQL T B

1k 1a, Oregon bhores

300, 2@
HUDL~WEIﬂERw—~——~~«-—‘v»~~~n—~~w

P 0 _BOX 151

MERRILL, OR 9773

=
o

2 Tax LOT NUMBER 83&@7 ~OR6AC- 255000 a—on
T LOCATIUN GREGO
-~ LEGAL—DESCRIFTION-Lb
. ACREAGE

SALE FRICE

SOLD TGO
S~STREET-— —o . _

CITY, STATE z1m

N SHORES
23,—BlK—} @,—0Oregon ~Shoreg— ..

$E§“t0T~NUMBER @7 @EDQD —@L700-200-ag—_

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




LOCATION DREGON SHDRES
LEGARL DESCRIFTION Lt 1@, Blk 1%, Oregon Shores
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE Sa. @@

SOLD TO PQTh;CK BRUN
STREZET 7844 SE LINCULN ST
CITY, 5TATE I PDRTLQND OR 97

TEX LOT NUMEBER R3IG@
KEY : 284
LOCATION OREG
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt &5

ACREAG

SALE BRICE 2, 80w, g
LLIAN B WALTERS
R

?—G@&Dﬁ—@39®@—@®@—@@
92
ON SHORES

k]

CSULD TG
‘@ GARY WAy
1ICHQLL LQ 95 c@B

-$
WI
14
Cq

>;§§ LUT NUMBER 8';@7 @@6DB—@EB@@~@@@—@®
LOCATION - EREGDN -SHORES - e e

. LEGAL utbCRIPTIC Lt 7, Bik 3, TraeL 1®b3, Draqon HhowesA

ACREAGE
6@, 0@
S bEDLGEuPDNDELLQ -
286 KRIVERS BEND RD
CHILOGUIN, OR 97624

Ruu®7 @@/CD 1;1@w—®@@—@@

231332
LDLQFIUN OMIE SHDRES
LEGAL-DESERIFTION- Lt—12--Rlk- w2y Latakomie— Shores-
ZACREAGE
“SALE FRICE $. 2@
-S0LD TO ND BID
TTSTREEF — e T P -
*‘CITY, STATE Z1iR

TJJQX—&DT«NUMBER-~~R35@7—®@7CD—LEE@@—@@@-@@~~-~«—~w~~

KEY 127
LOCATION LQTQKDMIE SHORES

- LEGAL DESCRIPTIDN Lt u, Blk u, Latakomle Hhowes
— ACREAGE - - - e
‘;DQLE PRICE

.S0LD TO

T STREET

CITYr—STQT&—tlﬁu—_»mm-» B

- TAX LOT NUMBER R3S@7- @g?CD @16@@ @@@ @0
CUKEY- e '49@9;~-

SLoCATIuN HILQQUIN QREH

LEGAL DESCRIFTION HLST 6Q' SESEMSWG Sec. a7

. ACRERGE

"SALE ERICE .00 .

"SULD TOo NO BID

SOLD. AT. AUCTION

Blk 16, Tract 125Z, Oregon Shores




TAXx LOT NUMBER R2S1@- —-13R0- —@R2 Q- 0RB— -

HKEY 57126

LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lt 1,Blk 19, HWFFE

ACREAGE

SALE FPRICE $ 700, 2@

Solb_T0 - DAVID: ThDhPSON

STREET P 0 BOX &2

CITY, STATE ZIF QRLQDIQ, CQ 31066

Q) LDT NUMBER R qu @14&w—@42®®—@@@—@@
V EY 2538
ALDCHTIU“ KLQMQTH FALLS FOREST EaTQTES
LEGRL: DbSCRIPTIDN Lt pik 16, KFF FE - C s
QLREQGE
" gALE PRICE $673
-gpiD 1O DF\U ib THDMF‘bDN
*'DTREEF e BUX- 626
LCITY, DTQTE ZIP QRLQDIQ, ch 31@66

-§2§ALOTwNUMBER~— R9§1@ —@1SAR-TE300-2oe—2d

I LOCATION ) HLQMQFH FQLLb FOREST ESTATES

- LEGAL DESCRlPTIDN Lt 3 KFFE

"L ACREAGE — - : Bl o BT e
SALE FRICE $502, 22

“IgoLp TO RONALD S FREEMAN
STREET 4 ¥ MCLAREN AVE

T BETY -STATES . GANOGA-PRARKy -CA—973E7

X R39 1'2\—|2\1q1:\\d—®_8@@~&1®l21 @@
LREY— -2eRie3 e
_LDLQTIUN o EMATH FALLS FOREST ESTATES
LOCR | *DESCRIFTION Lt 46, Blk 4, KFFE
- ACREAGE
-mSQtE“PRIEE-*~-"*“”%q@@ @@ T
< 50LD_TO RONALD S ‘REEMQN
STREET ___ 2118 MCLAREN AVE
sTATE ZIF  CANOGA FARK, CA 91307

AWQX LOT NUMBER Z51@-a15Spa- @ac@@—@@@—@@

2149
- HEeariu ~~~’—KLQMQTH FALLS: FOREST- CEGTRTES
LEGAL UNCCRIFTION Lt 51, Bik & KFFE

$600, 22

- RONAED=S
7118 MC
CANOGA PARK,

1-TH) LOT NUMBER R3IS1@- @1900—019@0—@U~—00




LEY
LocaTIgn i C . _
Etgahu SCRIPTI Zec. -19, Tract Sk4, Undiv. 371& interest
L«P«LE FRICE
SOLD _TO
HTRCET :
CITY, ‘TQTE LLP

TAxX -wUT NUMBER - '“51@ —-QEsDhd— ~QEZ0A—-2R—Bd-

KEY = “*HZ
LOCATION H FALLS FOREST ESTATEY
LEDQL DCSLRIFTIDN i Blk u@ KrFL
ACHREAGE-- -~ - i
:QLL PRICE $QW@
soLp TO NALD B rREtMQN
GTREET “CLQR;N AVE
21TV, -STATE- ZIF- GA-FARR, CA-91327~ ~== "

fﬁ¢ LOT NUMB:R 4 -2 3Da- —QZ7 00— —-QRnAa-Ra
H S 5
LDCQTIUQ H FWLL: FOREST TESTATES
~CEGAL DESCRIFTION LT i KFFE

- ACREAGE

A LE BRIGE— —— o 3E B
50LD 10 i OMESON

 STREET =

CITY STATE ZIF 1na, CA 917366

CTAY LOT NUMBER R Q26 EO-0SS02-002~00

CKEY
LOCAT-IOM- e oK TH-FARLLS- FDREbT—E&TQTE:~~~'—-~m
FLEGAL DEQLRIPTIDN L Bik 41, 1st add, WKFFE
" ACREAGE
-~ 5ALE PRICE 350, 0d
,~:DLn—TDf~~-WJw -~ RONALD- S-FREEMAN --———— " T
- STREET 7118 MCLAREN AVE
-—CIIY STATE Z1iF CANOGA FARK, cA 913@7

Tnx X LOT NUMBER 8§5é€3®”45® _20600-222-22

HeeaTIu RFFE

fALEGQLvDEQCRIPYIOK & B lic-51, 18T Addsy KFFE-=777
ACREAGE

. sALE RRICE 3, 300, Q@

‘- SoLD _TO DAILD THDMPbDN

- STREET_— e —F—0-BOX—6E2E-

“217TY, STATE ZIF .“Ch 91uee

IQX -LOT  NUMBER i 0@@@—@54@@—@@@—@k*4~~

LDCHTIUN 3 rORESF ESTATES
EEGQL DESLRIFVIDN
SQLt PRICE

SOLD. AT. AUCTIU ON




S0LD TO ORENACHES INC
STREET . F C BOX 361
CITY, STATE ZIF  CHILOGUIN, Ok 97

IHX LOT NUMbLR : 21 2@a- wou@@ ~QIRQ—-Qz
-y :

LULQ:ION
LEGAL DESCRIFTIUN NE4NW4 Sec. 1
ACREAGE 4Q. @@
BALE PRILE $. 00
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

STATE ZIR

TAX LOT NUMEEK RE511-0@1 0o—-00 420 —g@ga— —-Qag
Y

274214
LOCQTIUN—~ - R
LEGQL DESCRIPTIUN NW4NH4 Sec. 1
ACREAGE 4. 2@
"SQLE FRICE $. QG
~-SQLD— =T0-—---v . __ . NO BID.-..
__.STREET
SCITY, STATE zIp

-*Eé LOUT NUMEEK  R3 qll @@1@@—@@&@@ -Q20-ag.

274

CLOCATION
- -kEGAL-DESCRIFTION- QE4NW4—Secr~l—‘~~~~“~~—~—~mm~~~~~~w~w -

ACREAGE 4. QR

SALE FRICE

30LD 1O

&FREET—~~—~— e —

CITY, STATE zIF

#~39k"LDT~NUMBER~M~"R§211 LU=t A T
T KE Vi
LOCATION GREGON FINES
LEGAL DESCRIFTION For, Sec.2. 7
~ ACREAGE——- 33081

NO BID
‘EITY;»STQTE—ZID~~—~~~w~~w~-«~—ww~—~~——~vmnwmvmmm——mn——m«~~

—JaX LOT NUMBER R3511-00Z02-0Q6 00— 220-00
REY— . rETAS od---w-w~~—m~-~_«—-——_n~~_m—*_mmw~~
LOCATION REGON PINE
LEGAL DESCRIFTION PQP W Sec. 2, Tsp 35
ACREAGE 41, 42
SQEE—FRIC&-~~“~~-~$4 te@e0Q—r—oo
SOLD JERKY A ENMAN
bTFEET 15343 CHEYNE ROAD

“CITY STATE 21 KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

SOLD.AT. AUCTION




Tax LOUT NUMBER N3G @®_@@ ~Q1 2QE-Gaa—-9Q
REY z

LOCaTIUN

LEGAL D:SLRIFTIDN For. BEE Sec. &, Tsp 35
HtRCQb 41.65

SALE FRICE $, J0A. 23

auLD TO JERRY A ENMAN

STRE 15345 CHEYNE RD

CITr, STQTE ZIf KLAMATH FRALLS, UR 97603

IQY LOT NUMBER % QU9 DA-DZ920-2QA -2
LDCQTIUN CUN FINES

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lt 1@, Blk &, Uregon Pines
ACRERGE

SALE PRICE S, a@

SCLD TD CHARLES W HAGUOD

STREET =338 DELTA FRIR BLVD #174 -
CITY, STQ1E 1R ANTIOCH, CA 94529

1-23DA-@4 1 Q2—2RA—-QB

1 —_
6o
GON PINES
i ’ Blk B, Oregon Fines

TAX -LOT NUMBER R3S
H Y =76
LOLQTIUN GRE
LEGAL DESLRIPTIDN Lt

1

et

ACREABE - ST T
. SALE pRICE $u®m @@
. S0LD TO CHARLES W_HAGOQOD
~ STREET £938 DELTA FAIR BLUD # 174
- CITY,-STATE ZIF - ANTIOCH, - CA 94505

TRAX LOT NUMBER R2511-049D@- @4Lw® ~@ag— @@

AHEY e e BT RE T L o S

~LOCATIOUN DREGUN FINES
-LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lt 13, Blk 8, Oregon Fines
ACREAGE
CBALE-FRICE o oo $5Q@0 Q@ -
30LDh TO CHARLES W HAGOOD
- 8TREET =938 DELTA FARIR BLVD # 174
TCITY, STQTE LIP QNTIDCH LQ 9+q@9

1QX LOT NUMBER 351%—@@9DD—@4@®@—@@@—@@
KE 276613

VVLDLRFIUV - - - OREGUN -PINES - .- e

~LEGHL Ut:CHIDTION Lt 11, Blk 8, Oreqon Pxnes
- ACREAGE
"SALE FPRICE $S0A. Q@

30D T 0 -~ CHARLES- W.- HAGOOD
T STREET 2938 DELTA FAIR BLUD # 174
:~CITY, STATE ZIF  ANTIOCH, CA 945@9

TAX LOT NUMEEK  R3511-010C0-04500-000-00
KEY 277104
LOCATION FINES

S LEGAL - DESCRIFTION - Blk- 14, Oregen-Fines- -
ACREAGE

SULD. AT. AUCTION




SALE FRICE
S0LD _TU

2155 TsTATE 21P

TaX. LOT. NUMBER @1@CG S, heged et lv bl
e s

LUCHTIUN 2¢) pINES

LEGAL DEbLHIPTIOh ,, Blk 5, Uregon Rines
ACRERGE- - - . . .

SALE PRICE

3uLD TO

S5TREET

ciTY, STATE ZIF

llelZ‘\CU—Q\__-tZ\E\ IZ\Q\IZW —-Qaa

N F‘INE
pik 5, Oregon Fines

TAX LOT NUMBER (3
KEY.- - : 7
LOCATIU RE

LEGRL DESCRIPTIUN t
- ACREAGE

. SALE -FRICE .0
S0LD _TO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE

o]
77

1-
84
D

i
EG
sz

,ggé LOT NUMBER :@1@CU—®48@@—@@@—@@
- LDCAT-IUN PINES - -
* LEGAL DE&CRIF‘TIUN Blk 14, Oregon Fines
».QCREQBE
-"SALE FRICE
Ll 80LD-TO—
- STREET
CITY, STATE ZIF

< rax LOT T NUMEBER R‘ull Z210D0-01ERa—-pae-22
L IUREY 27

LOCATION DREGDN PINES
~7LEGQE-DEabRIPTIDN« O Blk_1A,—Oregon-Pines —————"""""""
© ACREAGE

SALE FRICE

. 3ULD TO

STREET e roe o =

C1Ty, STATE ZIF

'-—l TAY¥—LOT-NUMBER~ ~»—»——R35'1~1 A 11 C0—057AR—-QR@—@Q - T
TTHEY z7811&
: . LOCATIUN DREC—:UN FINES
“'LEGQL DLSCRIF‘TION Lt .._4, Blk \_:@ Dr*egon Fines
_AEREABGE--——— T T e e e T
: SALE FPRICE
-S0LD _TO NO
TSTREET
- t.-I “FY5—STATE-Z IR




TAX LOT NUMBERK 1
EY =1

K
K =
LULQTIUN ju} N FINES
LEGAL DESCRIFTION L Blk 2@, Uregon Pines
ACREARGE
SALE RRICE $. Q.
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

—A110CD-BE8GEG—-Q0a—Qa

TAX LUT NUMBER R 11-011C0-05500-002-20

{EY 27885
-LOCATION - IREGON- FINES .
CEGAL  DESCRIFTION 22, Blk 23, Oreg
ACREAGE

_ SALE FRICE $. 0@

o SOLD-T —m NOBID.

. STREET
= CITY, STATE ZIR

35
78
RE
Lt

_TRX LOT NUMEER 1-011C0-05600-200-00

KEY 276
TLOCATION FINES
LEGQLMDESLRIDTION ~£3, Bik-32, Oregon Bines
- ACREAGE ,
SALE PRICE

"SOLD_TO

T-STREET - —--

- CITY, STATE ZIR

f‘TQX—LDT”NUmBER“""Bé
=7

E%l P Rev e Bl T il B, T B B, Ty O

~d

. LDCQTIUN OREGGON HINES

(LEGAL DESCRIFTION SE4NW4 See. 13, Oregon Fines
-ABREAGE - —-—— o~ 4@ Q@ . -
SALE FRICE $4, 10Q. a@

- 8S0LD TO DAN’ HERNER

STREET 727 MADRONE
~LITYY-5TQTE»ZIpwm—QUNNYUQLErncﬁﬁgéaab

T TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-G13A0-085Q2—~ 200~
CKEY- ,~-7Mwnm-~a79_®m~ﬁ--¢“~—~m-~u*
- LDCATION REGON P INES
- CEGAL DESCRIFTION Lp 3, Blk 4&, Oregon Fines
" ACREAGE
=600

CCITY, STATE ZIF

TARX LOT NUMBER

. KEY

~LBOEATIU - S e e
LEGQL DhSCRIPTIuN i S Dregon Pxnes

SUOLD.AT.RUCTION




ACREAGE
SALE FRICE
SPRBefo

CIiTy, STATE zip

X LUT WUMBER ; Eéﬁ@—@@@—@@
KEY
LocaTIun .
LEGQLﬁDESCRIPTL’N X = Uregon Fines
ACREAGE
- SALE FRICE
BULD TO
JnSTREETﬁ“_WV»VWH
C STATE z1p

ggé-Lor,NUMBER . R3: A14B2-04900-ppp-pg
. LOCATIUN N BINES
RECAL DESCRIFTION CRE! + Bik ig,

: Oregon Fines
- ACREAGE e

T TAX LoT NUMBER R3S
e REY T

S LOCATION O
1+ LEGAL gESCRIPTIUN Pgr

11—0148@—@68@@—@00—@@

B = = = e o]

REGON FINEs

Lt s8¢, Blk 18, Oregon Finesg, RCCESS?

4
;.,m‘m‘_,_‘_m_____hk*\_~ﬂm“.

.
5

"CITY, STATE zip

..TAX Lot NUMBER
TKEY

~LOGQIIDN-~-—~_w—D = T e
LEGAL gESCRIPTIDN Lt 17, Oregon Fines

$5Q0. a@
»-~m~EDWQRD-F~KRDUSE-JR~~---m—m~-
1loa nqu gTReErs
STATE zip REDDING, £n

STRX LoT NUMBER R3511—@14C@—@39®®—@®@—@®

- KEY 285733

“LOCATION OREGON FINEG
~L§GQE~DESGRIQTIDNALthG,wBlkA19,~Dﬁegon~pine&~—~

$3Qa. ai
EDWARD F KROUSE JR
~110®-‘Q*-STREET - -

REDDING, (3]




fﬁ¢ LUT NUMBEK R351 1 -y —@710@-@@0—@@
LOCATION ]
'éggQL DEbCRIDTIHN Oregon Fines
SALE PPILE

S0LD TO

STREET

CITY,--5TATE IIR

CTAX LOT NUMBEK
- KEY- e

T LOCATIUN
LEGAL DESCRIFTION
‘QCNE C
RICE-- - R 2.2 B -
D

CITY STQTE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER RE511-p15Cce~ ~0R4Qd-DQE-
fHEY c847-@
LOEATIUN -~ OR CU P INES -
HVLEGQL DESCRIFTION (t 18, Blk S, Oregon plnﬂs
- ACREAGE
. SALE PRICE $. 0Q
—~bDLD“TD -------- T NO-BID- L
Z STREET
CITY STATE zIp

RESii WluC@ @11@@ @@@ @@
thﬂl—
LOCATION OREGUM FINES
~EES?L DESCRIFTION- L& ~11, Blk -5 <y-Oregon-Fines._
SALE pRICE $. a2
‘.HULD TO NG EID
STREET—wo e
‘f CI TY, STATE zip

—iTQX—LOTmNUMBER-w— Rguli ~a15D@a- —O3Z0a-0RR-@a. .
) SOO4

LDCQTIUN DREGUN PINES

LEGAL DESCRIDTIDN Lt 3&, Blk u, Oregon Fines

$500. g

EDWARD F KRISF JR
liap "o g7
CIIY,QSTQTEMZIP~~»REDDING,WCQ~

3TQ§ LUT NUMREK WluDG 0«%00 ODG 00
\E - R
- LOCATION 3 DINbb

S0LD. AT. AUCTION




LEGAL DESCRIFPTION Lt 3%, Blk g5, Oregon Fines

EDWARD EY KRUSD JR
Tioa a0
REDDING, oA

TAX LOT NUMBER D311 -Q16RE~-21 1 20—QR—-0
REY S3637:

LOCATION- : DREbDN FINES

LEGQL DESCRIP“IDN Lt &, Blk 8, Dregon Pxnes
QDR: .

NO BID

FQY LUT NUMBER Ruuil @1690 QST AR~ EAB QR
KEY Z86274
. LOCATIUN OREGUN FINES
~LEGAL - DESCRIFTION Lt_EGfMBIH~6r~Dreg0nupines~
. ACREAGE
SALE FRICE 5. 00
TSULD TO D
TETREET— o
.CITY, STATE ZIR

~*§é¢_LDT NUMBER - - R3 Clé G16RA-OSIDD—QBA~QT - -

TR 286283

 LOCATION DREGDN FINES
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt =35, Blk &, Oregon Fines
ACREAGE — - - =01 Blk €, Oregon :
SALE FRICE $.2Q

o 80LD TO NO BID

< STREET

'“CITY7"STQTE“ZIP

TQX LOT NUMBER R3511-ai6n0- 34@@ @@@ @0
i :Bt!i_.gu.'_‘
: OREGON FINES
*LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt &4, Blk 6, Oregon Pines
ACREAGE

SALE~FRIGE-~-- —ommn — b P -
SULD TO NO BID

- STREET

CITY STQTE LIP

~fI2§ LOT NUMBER 51% Q1902 -22623-20A-Q@
2753
L LOBAFION - - - GREGON-FINES -AREA - e
(LEGAL DESCRIFTION ESNZESWESENE4 Sec, 19, ACCESS?
* ACREAGE S. @Q
. SALE FRICE .00
(SOED-TH-~ -~ - . .NO BID s

SULD. AT. AUCTION




CITY, STATE ZIp

Tﬁx LDT NDMBcH RgSél @19@@—@34@@—@@@—@@
a6

LDDQTIUN DREGUN FINES

thQL Db CRIFPTION S35z Lt 4, Seec. 19

RCRE 9.47

bQLE DRIC& $. Q1

HDLD TO NO BID

STREET - :

CITy, bTQTE LIP

TQXfLGT-NUMBER "'WRgu%l PEZBO-QQSan- ~QQB-Q -
EY ;/ld_‘

LUCHTIGN REBDN FINES

LEGAL DcSChIFTIuN LL u, Ureqon Pines

—QLREQ e e B T
- SALE PRIL&

- SULD TO

- CITY,-STATE ZIF-

TTRY LUT NUMBER 'égll 0;9@@—OGDQ‘IE\—-®@@—E\Q\
- KEY S 3 = o F -
- LOCATIUN OREGON pINES .
.“LEEEL DESCRIFTION ?b4NW4Nw4 Sec. & ACCEsS 2
/C
rmeLE»PRICE~~M - ‘$. 09 -
‘ESDL D
bTRELT
:TQTE ZIf

TQX LOT NUMBERK R3511—®_9@®-@@7@@—®@B—®@
‘KE Z87674
: LDCQTIUN ~OREGON-BINES . — e e
;_LLGQL DthRIPTIDN For. SWANWANW4 sec. &9, QCCb"s ?
ACREAGE 9.@2
:SRLE PRICE =A@, @
—~bDLD~Tu—~——«~-~~~~R NbY—L SHAW -
C8BSTREET S2@E LAVERNE
- CITY, STATE ZIF KLABMATH FALLs, Or 97603

S Tax Lot NUMBER  R3511- T T e —
KEY _88®q8
LOCATION OREGUN FINES
LEGQE_D:QCRIPFIDwa EWCNW4QW4 Sec.—3@—
ACREAGE 4.79

- SALE FRICE $. 0
SOLD TO

-~ STREETF- -
CITY, STQTL LiP

;éé LOT NUMBER | a3100- —RO52Q-GRQ—@Q — e




LOCATIuN OREGUN LInEs
LEGAL DESCRIFTIgN ESSWANES "SUZSWAaNE 4
“REAGE @ T TETERANES
$. 0@
NO BID

CITY, STATE. 71

TRX LOoT NUMEBER : 35@@*@19@@—@@@—@@
KEY-~ : S

LOCATION OREGON FINES
- LEGAL DESCRIFTION EENE4SE4SI4 Sec. 35
S ACREAGE J. 2R
SALE-FRICE... U S 1
SS0LD T@ NGO BID
- BTREET
E1Ty, STATE z1p
- TAX LOT NUMBER RBG@S—@@EQQ—@SB@@—@@@~@@
T KEY 2864z
-~LOCATI ON— —-ROCKY- FOQINT_ e R
~LEGAL DESCRIFTIO; For. Tract "AY, Lt + Harrinanp Fk.
;o ACREAGE 25
"TBALE FRICE
~oSOLD_TQL T
L8TREET
= CITY, sTaTE ZIR

= TAX LOT NUMEER Rse@a—amaca-@43@@—m@@-a@

C TKEY 211488

T LOCATION SFORTSMAN FaRk
«*LEGQE-QESGRJPTIDN-Lb~53r—1stmﬂddr~to~8povtsman~£%r-~—~‘-

E
5600, o
GERALD p ORNDOFF
—~1883-CUNNJ NGHAM-aye. I T
MEDFDRD, OR

iifg§“bDT—NUMBERﬁ-~R36@6—@@9DQ-@6E@@—@@@—@@————‘~-~“~»~‘—»_—~-‘-~
KES 312771

1 LOCATION ROCKY FOINT
= KEGAL DESCRIFTION ¢ 283, Frontier Tracte
~AEREAGE - TIC — o

$500. op
S STEVEN D BLum
T STREET E525 PATTERSON g7
~C&TY;~STQTE«ZIP~W~KEQMQTH»FQLbS;‘DRw976®3‘~-~~“

CTax Lot NUMBER ~08 300-2aa-ag
KEY T E76E— S ;

KEY-—— . "7 58 e
LLOCATION
-~ LEGAL DESCRIF‘TIDN cRaz Frontier Tracts
. ACREAGE
" BALE-FRICE .. Rt 1% [ J Ty S
~80LD 1O STEVEN D BLUM

SULD. AT. RUCTION




ZIR

1Hk LOT NUMBEN
gY

LDCQTIUN

LEGAL DESCRIPFTION
ACREAGE

SALE FRICE

S50LD TO

STREET

CityY, STRATE ZIF

TQA LUT NUMELR

LEGAL-DESCRIATION
. ACREAGE

SALE FRICE

SULD TO
- STREET—- = = o -
__CITY, STATE ZIF

TAX-LOT -NUMBER -
lKEY

-LOCATION

"LEGAL. DESLRIPTIDN
- -ACREAGE--

. SALE PRILE
--80LD TU

CSTREET

’"Dl1¥r~STQTE~ZJP»W-HLRMQFH FALLS,—-OR 97681— — -

TTAX LOT NUMBER

SKEY, aTTon T ralasean

ILOCATION
: LEGAL DESCRIFTION
ACREAGE

S BALEFRICE - - $ 1y SOE B e

SOLD TO
S STREET
CITY, STQTE ZIF

TQX LOT NUMBER
TKEY

=523 FATTERSON ST
KLAl QTH FQLL:, UR 97603

Hub@ﬁ Q2 1RCA-@46RAG-A0A~-1A
”DCKY BOINT
For. NSNE4SW4 Sec 1
. Qe

5409, Q@
HARVEY BEENEY
0D BOX 1164
HKLAMATH FRLLS, OR 976@1

Yi@& @1@Cﬂ @47@@ ~2EA-2R

) u-‘

ROCKY FOINT

Zor. E‘NENE‘fSL«M Sc. 1@ - IMPROV. -

$\.: Ld@@ Qag
GREG STOUT
~HE- 34-BOX 7957 -— - - -
KLAMATH FALLS3, UR 97621

R3626-0100A~04BRR-PAB-QR- - <+ e
RDLKY POINF
P0P1 NE4bH4 bEL. 1a, IMPROU LIQEILITY

QE@. 2Q
HQROEY BEENEY
= ux 11864

R36@6-010CA-2492Q~ @@@*U@

OCKY FOINT .
POPI NZNE4SH4 See. 1@, IMPROV. LIARILITY
&

GREG STOUT
HC 34 BOX 7957
KLQMQTH FALLS, OR 9/6@1

Ge-R1ACR-Q4700—2Q@—d

- LOGAT-I0ON
" LEGAL DESCRIFTION
ACREAGE
" SALE PRICE
~--80LD--TO-
I STREET
- CITY, STATE ZIP

Tax LT NUMBER

SOLD.AT. AUCTION

858
14, Frontier Tracts

$.2Q

=
1

“NO-BID- - -

RI6D6-Q14CE—Q3700-B00—-@




nEY 15738

LOCATION ODESSA SUMMER HOME SITES
EGE —uE:CRIPTIDN t 4%, Odessa Sites R
ACRER

SALE PRICE $9 . Q@

SoLD 710 HARVEY REENEY
STREET - o0 o - F.0 . BOX-1164 - -
cITY, STATE ZIF HLAMATH FALLS, UOR 27801

vggé»LDT~NUNBER R36$3;614CB— RAZEQQ~ DDA~
LOCATIUN ODESSA SUMMER HOME SITES
LEGRL DEbCRIPTIDN Lt 49, Ddessa Slt
ACREAGE - -
SALE FRICE $1 152, 0@
SOLD TO GERQLD D ORNDOFF
CSTREET 1885 CUNNINGHAM QU&
LCITY,-STATE-Z1F --MEDFORD, - GR -

*&eé LOT NUMBER  R3606-014CR-03300-020- -0
- LOCATIO EDESSA SUMMER HOMES SITES
LR O ScRIFTION Lt 50, Odessa Sites
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE——— - bl 150, @@ e
“.50LD TO GERALD D ORNDOFF

... STREET 1663 CUNNINGHAM AVE

= @1TY, STATE ZIF  MEDFORD, OR

“TAX LOT NUMBER R36Q6—014CC-D6 00— 2Q0-22

TKEY 316866

2 LGEATION R L T o L S —

C CEGAL DESCRIFTION Lt 14, Blk 8, UOdessa

= ACREAGE
SALE PRICE 0@, 2@
-:DLD—TD~—w~ﬂ-""-GEthD~D ~ORNDOFF-
STREET 1862 CUNNINGHAM AVE
CITY, STATE ZIF  MEDFORD, OR

'TQX LOT NUMBER RS&@G -@ai16Ca- —Q8300-2EQ~-08

=6
LOCQTIU RDCKY FOINT
LEGQthESCRIPTIDN“Lt“ 55— Blk -3, --Mtns Lks—Homes————-—"
. ACREAGE
SALE FRICE S0, 0@
i":OLD TO NQRhtN CORNEL IUS
-STFREETF 217 - BAVIEAN—RD— e e e s
, STATE ZIF PERRIS, CA 92372

:KE 9 44

LOCAT RDCKY FQINT

" LEGAL DESCRIPTIDN Lt u? Blk 1, Mtn. Lk Homes
AGREAGE———— — T T T [ S
SALE FRICE $u, 3@, ak

SOLD. AT. AUCTION




S7al3

TAX LOT NUMBER Hugmg @17D0- @1b®@ @@@ @@
HEY- - - - Sedzdl -

LOCATION ROCKY FOINT

LEGAL DESCRIFPTION Lt 45, Blk o, Mon. Lk. Homes
ACREAGE

SALE--PRICE --- $3, 70A, QA -

SULD TO ROB GARROSS

STREET 1328 PERALTA

LITY STRTE ZIF BERKELEY, €A

‘ 332410
S LDCATION——— e -m - -~SERABUE -RIVER oo v o
_LEGAL DESCRIFTIUN Lt 15, Blk 8, Sprague R.
" ACREAGE
“5ALE PRICE
S BOED-- T e
 STREET
S CITY, STATE ZIF

:HX LOT NUMBER RI61Q—-214BB-A22QQ—-QOa—A@R
EY

TAx LOT NUMBER R36 12-001A0—21900-QQ0—0a
KEY 354565
TLLOCATION SFERAGUE RIVER
L EGAL-DESCRIPTION- Lt 12, — BLH -7y —IMEROV . oo oo
ACREAGE
- SALE PRICE $. @A
SO0LD TO NO BID
L STREET
= CITY, STATE ZIF

fﬁkwLGW_NUMBER-~~Re&l-—@l4b@—® AQA—BRAR= P e
356956 .
BERTTY

th &9, YSec. 14, Beatty

o~
$2, SO, DR
TONY M KLDBUCRR
BITY, ~STATE Z1E - BEATTY, OR-976& 1 - e e

TAX LOT NUMBER R36 12-014C0-02502-000-02
LOCATION - BEATTY
LEBQEGEESCRIPTIDN For. Lot 29 IMFROV.

5 45 QOB O
TONY P KLOBUCAR

STREET PO _BOX 335
CITY, STATE ZIF  BEATTY, UR 97&&1

S0LD.AT. AUCT ION




T@x LuT

DtSC RIFTI
QCREQ&ﬁ

SALE FRICE
SOLD. Ty .
STREET

CITY, STATE zim

TARAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

T LOCATION

- LEGAL -DESCRIR
L RCREAGE

SALE FRICE
SOLD Ty

S STREET ...
CIFY STQTE ZIP

TI

EQX»LDF NUMBER ..

LOCATION
LEGAL uEbCHlPTI
ACREAGE -~ ... __
SALE I"RICE

aDLD TO

- STATE - Z1p

:RX LOT

LDCQTION
- LEGAL DESCRIFTI
(RCREAGE
SALE-PRICE. ...
.80LD TO
- STREET

“;CITY, STATE Z1IR

T:Tnx LUT NUMBER

LUCQTIUNm-m»
~ LEGAL DEaCHIP
- RCREAGE
U EALE ERICE
- SOLED-T G e
S STREET
CIiTY, sTtATE ZIp

NUMEBER

TIG

LaoT NUMBER

_'1fmxA
P T REY
-ALDCQIIUN

LEGQ&mDESCRIPTI

- ACREAGE

0
N
fur

g0k
=i

ON

LT s

*ZD

ey
Z<

=z
C
1]
—

RE61E-03200-aa300- -QUi-a@

353851

BtQTFY

ON - Blk oec. - Tract. For. UND INT 4L

-
g =)

Rg?é;I@l490—@@3@@~@@@—@@-~~
KEFE ‘#1
ON Lt Blk

- - -

3500, o0
RONALD 5 FREEMAN
718 MCLAREN AUE

CANUGA-FARK, -CA 91307

Hw

y_14@, KFFE

@14HD @llw@ BOW—@@

ON Hwy 140, Keeg

Ra?il—@l480—@€’@@—@@®—®@
385614
-KEFE -#1 -

V Lt ;H Blik /B Hwy 1

L—l l_k
v

sip 2%

4@

N -

qCD auuma @3@ @@

KFFE %1
Bkt Oy —Hwy—140,—-KEEE

ON-Lt-3
2. Eh

————




iLE FRICE
oLD T
REET
Y,

TRATE ZIF

TAX- LOT NUMBER
HEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIFTIUN
ACREAGE -

SALE FRICE

SOLD TU

STREE

EIiTY, STQTE ZiF

iﬂé LUT NUME&R
;LULQTIUN
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
. ACREAGE

SALE- FRICE -

SULD TO

STREET

‘CITY, STATE ZIF

- TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION-——---
' LEGAL DESCRIFTION
- ACREAGE
“SALE PRICE
SELD Tl e
'STREET

CITY, STATE ZIR

TAX L.DT NUMBLF’
HEY

- LOCATION
< LEGAL—DESCRIFRTION-
" ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SULD _TO

S STREET-——- - -
"CITY, STATE zZIF

~TAX-LUT--NUMBER- -
TKEY

- LOCATIUN

CLEGAL DtbCRIPTIDN
ACREAGE - e
SALE ERIC

~50LD TO

CSTREET
CITY,-STATE- Z1pP

SULD.AT. AUCTION

‘RE7 11 -Q34BE—~-QQ7 20— Q00 ~Qg

$3ad. va
DAVID THUMRSON
- O BOX 826
ARCADIA, CA 921uee

o

M X
[ ot T )

—@Z1DE-2 1 aQ—-2QA—an - -

&8, KFFE

SEER~ Q10

Hwy 14@, KFFE

saLuma o8 -
JEFIE STANFFORD
F O RDX 7383

KLAMATH FALLS UR 976@1

Z6ERO-D300A—-2QA-AR

| KFFE

CXeD
rier Moy
Aﬂbﬂ

$q@@ 721
{ONALD-S -FREEMAN — -
118 MCLAREN AVE
ANOGA FARK, CA 91307

| R3711-028D0-004G0-0ad—a

39859@
KEFE #1
Lt 19, - Blh S1y—Hwy- 148, ~KFFE— e

I—l s_‘la
$. 20
NGO BID

41269

KFFE 1

Lt 36, Blk &3, Hwy 14@ KFFE

L.4® e o - B -
$65Q. Q@

DRVID THDNPSDN

0 BOX &&6

ARCADIA.- CA -91066




18X LOT NUMEER ~ SEE-05500-000-0

E'EQTIUN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACRENGE

SALE PRICE .-
SOLD TU AM B WALTERS
STREET c@ GARY WAY

-1TY, STATE Zip ICHAEL, LA 3Seme

436356
LCATION - . .. HKLAMATH- LAKE ADDITICN - -
LEGAL DESCRIMTION Lts 1@ & 11, Blk 2, MCLEAN St., IMPROV.
ACREAGE
SAL - $3, 9Q@. GQ

TAX LOT NUMBER RSB@9—@19DB-@@9®@—@@G~®@
KEY S63E

WOLTER -L. MODEN . . .
13580 SFRING LAKE RD
STATE z1Ip KLAMATH FALLS, UR 97ca3

- TAX LOT NUMBEK RBS@?—@EBDC—194®@—®@@—@®
OREY 3769
CLOCATIUN KLAMATH FALLS
~~LEGHEMDESCRIPTIDN~889»GRQNT“ST.,wIMPROUr
- ACREAGE
-+ 8ALE PRICE $. 0@
"SULD TO

BTREET--- ... .
ICITY, STATE zIF

,-¢9x~t0r~NUMBERw~—~R3ea9—wssaq—aevma—a@a—aa—m—~~
CKEY 416525
< LOCATIUN KLAMATH FALLS
ZTLEGQEGEFSCRIPTIDN Lt 18, Blk 17, E. Main st.
$3, 600, 0@
JIM MCCLELLAN
231 EAST MAIN
Ktﬂmn?H—FRttS;~UR~976@1~——w——~~———«—~»~-—~~-

S TAX LOT NUMBER R38®9-®3393-@41®@—®@@~@@
CREY T T4 SRR e
LocAaTIuN HLAMATH FALLS

- LEGAL DESCRIFPTIUN 221 Commercial S%.

| ACREAGE
SAEEERIEE——— 52 geipo—

80LD TO JUDY URBACK

- STREET 1724 CARLSON DR

. » STATE zir  KLAMATH FALLS, UR 97e@3

} 450489
LUCRTJUNv~»~~—-"~-KtQMQTH-FRLLS~-»~w~f~v“w—-w~
LEGAL DESCRIFTION 1650 Homedals Rd, IMFROV.

‘T@X LOT NUMBRER R38®9~®35DC—@13@@—@@@~@@
=Y

SULD. AT. AUCTION




.E )
376wy

EQX Lor NUMBER 35 :@@4D@“®E9@@*@@@—®®
EY g
TIUN KFFE #&
i DESCRIPTIUN t 7, Blk
T. QA
$3, 600, pp
HN R

- 1n 0 RT-1 . Rpk
STATE z1p BONANZA,

'~TQX<LDT»NUMBERV~ wﬂaa14—@@950~@44@@~@@@—m@»mm~w-
KEY 46457
- LacaTron KFFE #z
TLEGAL DESCRIETION [ 48, Bik 37,
—ACREAGE. " IERRE— . Y T
= $1, 700, g
DAVIDH THOMES O
F o 626
»~QRBQDIHr~GQ~91@66~-W~~
Trex Lot NUMBE R3811—®®9D®-D47Z®-@®®~®®
(REY-.o . TRTRER »463144-»~m~m~n~»»~mn
CILOCATION KFFE ‘az
= LEGAL DESCRIpTIgN Lt 33, "1k 48y Hiwy 140, krpp
.. ACREAGE 2.39
{,SQEE~DRIGE-~~~~W~-»mw$sm@;@a— N T e
SUS0LD Tg RONALD &
S STREET 7118
CITY, s1aTE ZIF  Canog
NUMBER R3511—@1350—®18@@—@@m~@@
467444
»LDEQF&GN~-~~~~~-HFFE~#3 - : »m«w»~-—-—~-“~m~--
LEGAL DESCRIFTION [F 9é Wy 140, Kprg
CREAGE 2.5

- IBX LOT NOmpeg
- _KEY

CLOCATION

RESAL DESCRIRT IOy
- ACREAGE

SULD.QT.QUCTIUN




EBY LUT NuMBER —QUZHO~ R A—-aQ- -
LOCATIUN
LEGAL GDESCRIFTIUN
ACREAGE .

SALE FRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp.

T
T

rxiex
nick Mg
SENS

Hwy 149, KFFE

I

- TAX LOT NUMBbR RUQGS ~QA8CIA~— m@qmm @w@—w@
REY— T TT 49114 . e
LOCATIuN nDUND LAPE
LEGAL DEDLRIPTION Round Lake Road
ACRERG 1.44

leLc‘PwipE—~~»~~—- AL
SOLD TO NU BID

- STREET

TCITY, STATE ZIip

TAX LOT NUMBEK R;‘B?E\g@ Z8CC-11800~-apng—~ ]
Y ol
LDCF)TIUN e KLAMATH- FFILLS—~-»--~»-~-—» B it S,
_LEGAL DESL.RI!—TIUN 1403 Main St, CamML.  ImMERQy,
-- ACREAGE
"TBALE PRICE $. 00
SULD-TO— ~NUJ-~ BIDV-———»—"w-A-w—- e
I STREET
“CITY, STATE ZIp

- Iox LOT NUMBER Ru9@9—®®1DB—ElE@®—®GB—®®
KEY S1Qa5s

LOCATION KLAMATH FALLg
<. LEGAL- DESLRIPTIDN_Unrty«StTT-EmL-st»ip
__QCREQCE

SALE ERICE $.00

.SOLD TD NO BID

—STREET— e
-CITY, STATE zIp

TQRmLUT NUMBER-- - - R3909-p@i3cA— it B
\.h_.L 8‘

LDCQTIUN ALTAMONT FIRST ADDITION

TLEGAL uESCRIPTIDN 3247 Cannon Ave. IMPROY.
-- AEREAGE T T e ST
. SALE F'RIC,E 2Qa, ag

-SulDh Tg Gcohut M_MURGA

- STREET 245 SUMMERS LANE #3o
~7CIT%——QTQTE~ZIDWH-KLRMQTH ~FALES,—~UR 57603

ll-}k LOT NUMBEF\ 9@38@QIQCQ @4_-00—006—00
K S PN
LUCQTIUN 6@ CANNON QUENUE




LEGAL DESCRIFTICON W@ Cannon RAve. IMEROVY,
=

E, Q. GG
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STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH: sS.

Filed for record at request of Klamath County the 25th day
of July ADL19_ 91  a__9:15_  oelock —A_M., and duly recorded in Vol. _M97] .
of Deeds on Page __14435_ |

Evelyn Biehn ~ County Clerk
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