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" SHERIFF'S RETURN OF SALE

The following parc:°1s‘:(see adienﬂ’ s were sold at public
~‘auctilon, held in thé:Commissioner’'s Hearing Room, Court-
house Annex, on,S . :

Total sales amogated to -

Cbaf\i’,R:}'E;nrkhart, Sheriff
Y Kla_math Cbunty, Oregon

oAl B 4, ot

Noxinan W Mocyee/ /Depﬁty

NWM/hc -
~ "Addendum

"To Prote( t and To Serva The ccmm nlty




168507
CHEMULT .=

'LEGAL’ DESCRIPTION Chemult, Lot 10,
ACREAGE =
SALE PRICE Tt $1,000.00 ~ ‘
.SOLD TO .~ GIL ERNST-CRESCENT DIL co.
STREEF P O BOX 617
CITY, STATE z:p VGILCHRIST, OR 97737

TAX LOT NUMBER R2708-02LCB-02700-000—00
“KEY . .. 168614 L ,
‘LOCATION S CHEMULT f‘ R '
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Chemult, The Northe ly;40 feet of lots 8 & 9, Block 1
ACREAGE SilEe T : .
. SALE PRICE . = - 8750, )0 E : ‘
SOLD . TO - v GIL. ERNST—CRESCENT OIL co.
STREET FECRES P O BOX 517
- CITY,. STATE ZIP GILCHRIST, OR 97737

TAX LOT NUMBER - R2808-0238ﬂ-00600 000-00
- KEYS Lo 87943 f

LOCATION o777 NORTH BF\V’R KARSH - ‘ :
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION North Beav*r Marsn Addltlon, et 2, Block 1
. ACREAGE i : ; ' S
SALE PRICE = 7. 7 $1 250 30 :

“SOLD.TO Sl SHIRLEY BEWLEY

STREET * e .'HC 30 'BOX 114

‘CITY,kSTATE ZIP : CHEMULT, OP 97731

TAX LOT NUMBER : R3208-01900—01600*060 00
KEY 89950 7

 LOCATION 6 MI S. SLVR LK RD '

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2NWiSW4: NEANWASW4 of sectlon 19, Township 32 South, Rang
ACREAGE 29.55

SALE PRICE $7,000.00

'SOLD TO ~  LANCASTER & HOPKINS LDGGING

'STREET ~ HC 63 BOX 404

L;CITY, STATE'ZIP CHILOQUIN OR 97524

© TAX LOT NUMBER R3208 01900—01300-000-63
KEY : o 89969 | :
: LOCATION 3 6MI. S. SILVER LK RD :
LEGAL - DESCRIPTION The N2$W48w4 of Sectcn 19, Tewnshlp 32 South Range 8 East
‘ACREAGE 19.86. | ; :
'SALE PRICE - - $5, 000,00 :
SOLD-TO - ff ~,LANCASTER {HOPKINS | LGGGING
 STREET 07 'HC 63 BOK 404
CITY,: STATE ZIP CHILOQUIN, OR 97624




‘R3313-00300-00520-00
181136 . - P

, . KFFE . ... . :

 LEGAL nsscnxpmzon Lt 20A, Blk 2, Sycav Unit, FFFE

ACREAGE o 9.85 5 ,

‘SALE_PRICE £ ' G

-SoLD TO . NO BID U

CITY, STATE ZIP

“TAX 10T NUMBER R3313-02¢00«03300-000—00

KEY o : 177506 ‘

" LOCATION . 16+MI. Nk OF BEATTY : :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath: Ialls Forest Estates Sycan Unit, T%e W252 Gf Lot 11,JB"
ACREAGE { 9. 86 - .

'SALE PRICE S g;y,;.

‘SOLD . TO ~,j",NO,BID i

'STREET. - SR IR

CITY, STATE ZIP

L

TAX LOT NUMBER 3R3313-02700“06000 000-00
KEY LD 179390 , ,
‘LOCATION : 16+MI. NE OF: BEATTY =
-LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates Sycan Uﬁit Por S2W2 of Lot 16,/B
_ACRERGE -’ o 10.35 S !
 SALE PRICE
“8OLD TO- - = ,',NO~BID
' STREET : o i :
CITY STATE ZIP

‘TAX LOT NUMBER R3313 028)0~01600 000-00

: 179675

'LOCATION . ; 16+MI. NE OF BEATTY :

LEGAL | DESCRIPTION Klamath Fdlls Forest Estates Sycan Unit, The 5282 of Lot 2,/B1
P 9.86 S

;~NQ,BIDT,,7;

R3313-02800~D3?00-000»00
1179595 ; ‘
G 16+MI. NE.OF BEATTY s '
- LEGAL . DESCRIPTION Klamath FellsiForest Pstates 8ycan Unit, The E2W2 of Lot 20,/B
“ACREAGE . ' ‘9 18 3 : :
SALE PRICE. ', ‘
| SOLD..TO ;{gfe; }, NO BID
STREET - B
"CITY STATE ZIP




}TAx LOT NUMBER
KEY.
LOCATION

U LEGAL. DESCRIPTION
. ACREAGE "

- SALE PRICE
“.SOLD ‘'TO

"STREET' i
”CITY, STATE ZIP

'LOCATION :
- LEGAL: DESCRIPWION
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
'SOLD TO
'STREET .
CITY, aTATE zxp

TAX LOT NUMBER
"KEY
'LOCATION =
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
" ACREAGE = -

SALE PRICE
‘SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUHBER
'KEY

:LOCATION L
‘LEGAL DESCRIP“ION

'CITY, uTATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER =

{ LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
'ACREAGE =

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET =~ = ...
'CITY, STATE ZIP :

R3313~028 0*04000-000-00

179951

16+MI. ‘NE OF .BEATTY = :
Klamath Falls Forest astatea Sycan Unit, The 52E2 of Lct 17,/
9.86 Gt

jNG;BID_ T

'R3313 ozsnon01200‘ooa-oo
180057

16+MI. NE OF BEATTY
Klamath Fdlla Foresu dstatea Sycan Unit, The E2E2 of Lot 3,J81

- 10. 92

 NO BID

R3313 02900 03800-000h00

180397 ! Lo

16+MI. NE'OF BEATTY Cd

Klamath F&lla Forest ?states Sycan Unit The H2viz of Lot 18,JB
0.86 . .

1$300. oo :
LYNN WESTVOOD
P O BOX S&1

~KLAMATH FALLO; OR 976“1

R3313 029(0~05500-000h00

180262 it

16+MI. NE.OF BEATTY :

Klamath Fzlls Forest Pstates Sycan Unlt The £2¥W2 of lot 1,/Bl
9. 86 iy

'NO BID

R3313-03000-00600-000~00

180830 - i~

16+MI. NE OF BEATTY v ) :

Klamath Falls Forest Estates Sycan Unit, The W2w2 of Lot 2,/Rl
10.92

'NO/BID<'




< STREET

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE -

SOLD TO .

STREET

7R3313-03000~05200~000
181136

‘16+MI. NE OF BEATTY &
Klamath Falls Forest Estates s“can Unxt, The N2W2 of Lot 20,/
9 86 ) = :

'NO_BID

CITY, STATE zIp

TAx LOT NUMBER =
KEY :
‘LOCATION ‘
'LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE
"SALE PRICE

SOLD To

- STREET O
CITY, STATE ZIP

' LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
‘KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL - DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

. SOLD TO -
 STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX Lot NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION
'LEGAL DESCRIPTION
'ACREAGE -~
'SALE PRICE g
.SOLD'TO

R3313-031)O~00080-000-00

181653 3 i

16+MI. NE OF BEATTY B , ‘ :

Klamath Falls Forest Estatgs;syCan_Unit,'The B2E2 of lot 12,/8
9.86 A B =
$2,500. on 4 i':

GEORGE POHDELLA JR. .

286 RIVERS R Sty

,CHILOQUIN,£OR‘97624 {

R3313- 031C0-00900-000~00
181742 Iy
16+MI. NE OF BEATTY v o
Klamath Falls Forest Fstates S8ycan Unit, The N2E2 of Lot 11,/8
9.86 ) : :
$2,000.00

i

“GEORGE PONDELLA JR.

286 :RIVERS RD

"CHILOQUIN,'OR,97624

AR3313-03100-D4900—000 GO
181669 - . o

- 154MI. NE uF SPRAGUE , ‘
Klamath Fatlo Forest\L:tates Sycan Unlt The Nz of Lot 6, Bloc

$2 500. oo

,i GEORGE PONDELLA JR.

286 RIVERS RD ,
CHILOQUIN OR 97624

‘R3507 OOOOC-00400~000 00
. 219392

3.5MI. 8. OF CHILOQ [ B
852SW4sSw4 of Section 22 Tawnship 35 South, Range 7 East of the

©20.00

“lNO‘BID

ey, STATE 1P ijkﬂy




TAX LOT NUMBER 7»‘R3507-003nB—0 600-000—00
KEY 222011 " P
LOCATION : CHILOQUIN ; : :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION South Chlluquin, Lot 1 Block 5
- ACREAGE : i
- SALE PRICE ;'4 81, 500.00 |
SOLD- TO ! "“GRACE CAMPB"LL
STREET . : P 0. B 636 :;' S
CITY, STATFE ZIP : CHILOQUIN OR‘97624

: 7'R3507-006AC-06200-000—00
: Dt 224974 .
LOCATION . "3 'MI. W OF. PHILOQUIN o :
LEGAIL, DESCRIPTION Oregon Shorus Tract 1053 Lot 7, Block 8-
ACREAGE : L D
SALE PRICE ; : ;
SOLD TO . Ty ,‘No BID
- STREET }. ' S
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX 1OT NUMBER R3507 OOGAD-OQIOO-OOO 00

KEY  * ~‘>226160 e

,LOCATION "3 MI. W OF CHILOQUIN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Oregon Shores Tract 1053, Lot 5, Block 16
- ACREAGE - i - o .

SALE PRICE $z,aoo.oo

SOLD TO @ - .- JAMES : V. MORRIS

STREET . . -+ 5538 REEDER ‘RD’ -

CITY, STATE ZIP 7KLAMATH FALLS - OR 97603

TAX LOT NUMBER ;R3507 OOGBD—OO400-OOO~OG

KEY. ,H~22723o SN

LOCATION o 3 MI. W OF CiILOQUIN L

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Oregon Shore‘ ract 1053 Lot 9, Block 1
ACREAGE : S S S :

‘SALE PRICE T

SOLD TO ! '1_ " :NO BID

'STREET = . '@

’CITY STATE ZIP

‘TAx LOT NUMBER R3507-0068D-H1400-000-00
KEY : :'226963 o
LOCATION . '3 MI. W OF CHILOQUIN R
LEGAL DESCRIPTION,Oregon Shoreu Tract 1053 Lot 2, Block 2
ACREAGE ' . SRS R R DT R
SALE PRICE : i : '

SOLD TO - 27 NO BID 5
STREET = e
~ CITY, STATE 2IP .




. 3 MI. W OF CHILOQUIH : :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Oregon <hores Tract 1053, Lat a 'Block 3
ACREAGE ; S T : v A
SALE PRICE ' ‘;?;f '
SOLD TO = Cann NO BID 1
STREET - T
CITY, STATE zIp

R3507- oosan—oaxoo~oao—on
227123
3 MI. W OF CHILOQUIN , :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Oregon snores Tract 1053, Lot 23, Block 5

ACREAGE , , . el :

' SALE PRICE SRR

sorb o NO BID e

' STREET v R

cITyY, STATE 21D

TAX LOT NUMBER : R3507—OOUCA~00800-000-00

-KEY . e 227935 i :
LOCATION R 3 MI. W OF CHILOQUIN

- LEGAL DESCRIPTIONvOregon Shoras Tract 1053, Lot 17,
SALE PRICE SR

SOLD TO  ~ ;'{] NO: BID

“STREET." - ‘ L :

VCITY STATE ZIP

4VTAX LOT NUMBER R3507—007CD—05700~000 00
“KEY o 0231467 0

- LOCATION ~° 3.5MI. W OF CHILOQ

‘LEGAL: DESCRIPTION Latakomlu‘stores, Lot 41 Block 5
ACREAGE o : N e

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO :

STREET :
v CITY, STATE ZIP

;'TAX LOT NUMBBR R3507 007WD~10700 006~OG
KEY : 231207 e

"LOCATION : ‘3.5MI. W nF CHILOQ.;

“LEGAL DESCRIPTION Latakomle Shores, Lot 17 Block 2
ACREAGE = :

SALE PRICE ..

~8SOLD TO - =

- STREET .

QCITY,;STATE ZIP




,-TAX LOT NUMBER "33507-01 B 1000 ao eo Il_'5'°‘:i
KEY , : L
, LOCATION B 3+MI. SW- oF CHILOQ . :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Tract 1184 Oregon Shares Unit 2 First Addition, Lot 29, Blockj

“ ACREAGE ; :

' SALE PRICE gt
sooTo Notaxn~
'STREET = Ll

| CITY, STATE zxp

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-02100-00100 ooo oo
KEY © 261415 o v
LOCATION 5MI. NW OF SFRAGUE L eSS :
" LEGAL DESCFIPTION The NE4NE4' E2NW4NE4 of Section 21, Township 35 South, Range 1
ACREAGE b 60.00 : :

SALE PRICE $61,000. 00
SOLD TO ',; JOHN ' BATZER I

STREET : BOX 4460

CITY, STATE Z1p MEDFORD, oR e7501

R3510-023BU-05900—900~OO
: L 265281 : .

LOCATION IR 44MI. N.OF SPRAGUE o

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Forest Estatesp Lot 21, Bluck i3

ACREAGE

SALE,PRICE‘ Fa $2 000 00 L

SOLD TO S “Re-E. WERDIMMI

STREET = -~ P .O-BOX 321 -

CITY STATE ZIP SPRAGUE RIVER OR 9763°

R3512—035AO-05100 000~00
293569 . :
: 4+ MI. N OF BEATTY ;
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Sprague Rlver Valley A¢res, Lot 4, Block 5
ACREAGE: " : : . : ; .
SALE PRICE: A ‘ : ‘§;
SOLD TO ‘I, 2o NO BID_‘,,Q
STREET. S e R e
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX ILOT NUMBER '”R3610 01488 0:400 000 00

KEY : 332642 e

LOCATION ', : SPRAGUE RLVLR ‘ i '
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Sprague Rqur, ‘Lots 13 14 & 15 Block 6
© ACREAGE ' o L S : :
'SALE PRICE

SOLD TQ : - : NO BID, :

STREET . T T

CIT STATE ZIP




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE = ~

| SALE PRICE

- SOLD TO - ,
 STREET .
CITY, STATE ZIP

R3611—001L0—04700-000"60
339137 o
: : 6+MI, E OI @?RAGUE Pl
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fifth Addit;on to Nimrcd Rivet Park, ot 37, Block 64
| ACREAGE = : : : U . '
§ SALE PRICE
SOLD TO
STREET
N'CITY, STATE ZIP

R3611-001A0»04800-009“90
L : , ,i,‘k339146 ST o
z*LOCATION ;j , 6+MI. E OI,QWRAGUE "'b
# LEGAL DESCRIPTION Flfth Additlon to Niwr&d River Park Lot 38, Block 64
M ACREAGE =~
- "SALE PRICEf
- .SOLD TO =~
STREET =~ :
CITY, STATE ZIP

8 TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-001P0 05400 000~00
§ KEY 00337683 i il :
LOCATION : L 3+4MI. NE CF. SPRAGUE { ; ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Flfth Additlon to Nlmrod River Park, Lot 44, Block 64
~-ACREAGE (R . : o
"SALE PRICE"
. SOLD TO -
STREET ENe
”CITY, STATE ZIP
TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-001IO—05600-000~00
REY . : 338325 EW
-LOCATION f ‘ 6+MI. E OF SPRAGUE P
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fifth. Addition to Nlmrod River Park Lot 96, Block 66
ACREAGE ‘ : : :
SALE PRICE:
SOLD -TO .
STREET . - : Lok
gCIT!, STATE ZIP S




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

- TAX LOT NUMBER R3611—00180 03206~00
KEY = 338227
kIDCATI ON 6+MI. E.C ‘VPRAGUE . &
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fifth Ad on ta Ninrod River Patk, Lot 49, Bleck 64
| ACREAGE E : o
8@ SALE PRICE o ;
.~ SOLD TO ) T NOCBID
_STREET : :
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER - ”R3611-0 lC 405000*060*60 ’
S 338361 S o :
LDCATION o 6+MI. E. 0OF. SPRAGUE . i [ R R ;
LEGAL' DESCRIPTION Second‘kgdition to NlmronRiver;Park, Lot 2, Block 16
. ACREAGE ' : Dy “ : , -
. SALE PRICE B
soLb TO .~ NO BID
8 STREET i : RIS R TS L e T T v ; ,
' 'CcITY, STATE ZIP : SR TR ) T D S R R

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611—001€0—0:100—000 no
KEY | . o 338691 ' L
QLOCATION : ‘6+MI. E: OF SPRAGUE i . . X

"1LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fifth Ac« iﬂicn to mercd RiverfPark, Lot 9, Block 65
"ACREAGE N o A

- SALE PRICE :

SOLD TO v
“STREET : T
CITY, STATE ZIP

~TAX LOT NUMBER R3611—00200—00906~003—00
'KEY 339627 | ,
LOCATION 5iMI. E OF SPRAGUE
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fifth Addltlcn to
ACREAGE = i e
 SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET -
CITY, STATE ZIP

iﬁroq_nﬁver'park, Lot 36, Block 66

R3611-002L0-01300*QDO-00
.339663

 LOCATION . - S5+MI. E OF SPRAGUE ‘ v
~LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fifth ;gdltlon to ﬂlmrod Rlver Park, Lot 40, Block 66




soLDaATf;AvcrIoN, |

- TAX LOT NUHBERH“
~KEY: =

LOCATION

- LEGAL. DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE By
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO ,

.. STREET

CITY STATE ZIP

. TAX IOT NUHBER
KEY i .
IOCATION .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE -
SALE PRICE
- SOLD TO .

-STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

“TAX LOT NUMBER :
KEY i f
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

. "ACREAGE

"SALE PRICE
8SOLD TO.
‘STREET ' - - -
‘,CITY STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
 KEY
- LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
- ACREAGE :
SALE PRICE’
SOLD TO
 STREET
 CITY, STATE ZIP .

TAX LoT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATICN = -
“LEGAL DESCRIPTION
'ACREAGE
SALE PRICE

SOLD TO.
_STREET

R3611-00386v01900-000-00
340768 5

4+MI. E OF SPRAGUE

Fifth Additlon to Ninrod River Park Lot 3, Block 55

NO BIDT,J

R3611-003“0 01500 000'00

341491 o : . -
4+HI. E 0?»“PRAGUE ;v
Fifth Addltion to Nimrod River Park Lot 86, Block 70

NO,BID o

R3611—00300"01600-000~00
341507

C44MI. E OTJ°DRAGUE

Flfth Additlnn to Himroﬂ River Park Lot 85, Block 70

R3611-003C ‘01700-000“0G

5+MI. NE CF SPRAGUE
Flfth Addition to Nlmro& Rivar Park, Lot 84, Block 70

e NolaID“

R3611-00300—04300*000 00

341883
- 4+MI. E OF SFRAGUE

Fifth Addition to Nimiod Rlver'Park Lot 129, Block 70

'NO BID‘TV"

fCITY STATE ZIP ‘




'TAX LOT NUMBER : R3511—00300~05000-004 00 .

KEY - 10341703 .

aLOCATION ' o S+MI. NE OF SPRAGUE

‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Flfth Addition to Nxxrcd River Park, Lc* 108, Biock 70
“ACREAGE . = . - 1 50 L

~SALE PRICE [N

. SOLD ‘TO : NO,BID e

STREET . =

k CITY,;STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUHBER ; R3611-003C0~07400 oue—ou S
KEY S 331384 j '
LOCATION .  5+MI. NE OF SPRAGUE == :

LEGAL’ DESCRIPTION Second Addition to Nimred Eivez Park, Lot 14, alocx zz

_ACREAGE i.51 S ~
SALE PRICE =~

'SOLD TO T NO BID
STREET : L
CITY,‘STATE ZIP ;

TAX LGT NUMBER vR3611~00390 0G900—083-00
: , 342230 : :
v 5+MI. NE JF SPRAGUE i ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTIOV Flfth Ad&xtion to. Ni&rod szer Park, Lot 11, Blcck 56
ACREAGE =~ ' ; : , :
SALE -PRICE
~SOLD TO
STREET =~ . & &0
CITY, STATE ZIP

“w ;

TAX LOT NUMBE? ,  R3611~00:)0~03500-000 00 f

- KEY o 34”481 iy ’

kLOCATION s 5+MI. NE QV SPRAGUE

‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Flfth Addttion tc Nlmrod River ?ark, Lot 68, Block 70
"'ACREAGE =~ e " , _

SALE PRICE = . R E%“

sowb 10 No BID
: STREET : s Sl PN

,CITY, STATE ZIP s

‘TAX LOT NUMBER > R3611 004P0~01100n003~00 e

KEY . 342784 ¢ ]
'LOCATION : 5+MI. NE OF SPRAGUE e ‘

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fourth Addltlon to Himrod Rlvar Park, Ict 9, Bleock 50
“ACREAGE " ; . Dol

‘SALE PRICE

“SOLD TO -
. STREET . " - N

iCITY, STATE ZIP i




j"m\x LOT NUHBER ; ‘33611-00 00‘027

343257 :
g : : "5MI. KNE OF QPRAGUE .
LEGAL’ DESCRIPTION Fourth Adiition to Nxmrod River Park, Lot 13, Block 52
ACREAGE - Lo 5 50 R .
SALE PRICE S0 HIER TN R S S :
SOLD TO - ;_,.“ NO BID
“STREET . L
~CITY,‘STATE ZIP

TAX 10T NUMBER R3611 OOSCO 00900*000-00

CKEY e 343649 :

LOCATION : 5 MICNE OF ciPRAt’.«‘JJ}S: ;

_LEGAL. DESCRIPTION “The: SEdNWQSi4 of Section 5, Tcwnshlp 36 South, Ranges 11 East o
S ~10 00 .|

_NO BID

,CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUHBER o R3511-005C0 02100—90&—09‘

KEY i S 343738 0

“LOCATION 4 MI NE OF CPRAGUE -
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fourth Addltion to Nimrod vaer Park, Lot 1, Block 46
" ACREAGE o .3.81 j » .

SALE ‘PRICE ; e gRs} : : SRR o8
SOLD TO };I" NO~BID

STREET = i EEEHe

CITY, STATE ZIP

"TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-OOSDO 02500-000*00

: 344176 2
, 4 MI NE CF SPRAGUE .
~LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fourth Addltlon to Nlmrcd River Park, Lot 16, Block 49
‘ACREAGE ‘ :

SALE PRICE : 'i
-.SOLD.TO NO BID .

STREET: E ey
:CITY, STATE ZIP

- TAX: LOT NUMBER R3611—006C0—01800—006-00

_KBEY L 344443

,zLOCATION N 3. MI-NE CF SPRA’UE :

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Fourth Addltlon to N:mrod River Park, Lct 98, Block 31
- ACREAGE | 1.17

“SALE 'PRICE , S

. SOLD TO - po NO BID .

STREET ..~ ' PR

ECITY, STATE ZIP




'g,33511~oo 7A0-00300 00#00
385193 $

2 MI NE OF SPRAGU& : :
81xth Adultxon to! Nimrod River Park, Lot 6, Block 74
1. 59

‘rno BIDﬂg

HCITY, STATE ZIP

 TaX ror NUMBER

- KEY

LOCATION -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
' ACREAGE =

SALE PRICE -

SOLD TO

'STREET

cITyY, ~ STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
“KEY
LOCATION =
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE |

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO
STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUHBER
KEY
LOCATION . :
© LEGAL- DESCRIPTION
 ACREAGE = .

" SALE PRICE

" SOLD TO
 STREET . =
cITY, STATE ZIP

Tax 10T NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

~ LEGAL DESCRIPTIGN
ACREAGE =
SALE PRICE .

' SOLD TO .~

STREET

R3611—007A0 00400 000‘00

345200

3+MI. HE OF SPRAGU& : . o
Sixth i icn to Wlmrod River Park Lot 5, Biock 74

 ,R3611*(Ozﬁ0-91500 000—00
344751
2'MI NE OF S?RAGUE

Third: ﬁddltion to Nimrod River Park Lot 4, Block 21

i 50

NO BIng

jgR3611 00780-01000~000*00
345629

2MI. NE QF SPRAGUE

Third Addztlon to himrod szer Park Lot 17, Block 24

1. 55

fino BID fﬁ‘ﬁ~

,R3611 03750-03000-000—00 R

345727
2 MI. NL QF SPRAGUE L ’
Thlrd Addition to Nlmrod Rlver Park Lot 13, Block 26

,Novain'}f;‘

- CITY, STATE ZIP o




8 R3511-003AQ 00509-000*59 L

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE - ..

'SALE PRICE

SOLD TO. '
STREET.

346281

3 MI. NE OF SFRAGUE

Fourth. Additlcn to Nimfod Rivar Park, Lot 25, Block 49

cITy, STATE‘ZIP R

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

. SALE PRICE

S0LD TO’
STREET .

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE @ - .=
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LoT NUMBER
KEY. = ,
- LOCATION

' LEGAL DESCRIPTIDN

ACREAGE
SALE PRICE -
SOLD TO'
STREET - =
CITY, STATE ZIP.

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY ‘
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE =
_SALE PRICE

~SOLD TO !

 STREET = -

CITY, STATE zxp

’R3611-008Ao-oosoo—ooo—eo
(346192

3 MI. NE of SPRAGUE

'Fourth Additicn to N1mfod River Park Lot 15, Block 4%

~ No BID

R3611‘008Aﬁ‘06400-000 00

: 346851

3 MI. NE OF SPRAGUE |
Elghth Addlhlan te Nlmrod River Park, Lot 31, Block 78
2,07 .

'NO BID

, R3611-OOSBO 00100-000-00
347066

3 MI. NE OF SPRAGUE
Fourth: AdditiOﬂ to Nimrmd River Park, Lot 135, Block 31
1.50 fhaiod : . oo

':NO'BID:,’

RI6ils oosao-oo"oo—ooo-ou
347057

3 MI. NE OF SPRAGUE =
Fourth Addltlon to Nlmrod Rlver Park - Lot 134, Block 31

~1.50

ﬁ
i

'NO BID




'TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION

LEGAL’ DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

,CITY STATE ZIP '
«TAX Lot NUMBER'
KEY -

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO =~

STREET -
CITY, STATE ZIP

‘TAX LOT'NVMBER~
o PER.

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE ;
SALE PRICE

" SOLD TO -

' STREET :
CITY, STATE zIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY ;
LOCATION ‘
'LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO v
STREET

(CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER .
KEY ~
LOCATION :

LEGAL DESCRIPTIOH
ACREAGE

- SALE‘PRICE

' SOLD . TO

STREET o
- CITY, STATE ZIP

';Rssii;éoauo~04600¥ood~oo

3 MI. NE (F SPRAGUE ‘
Fourth Addition to Ninrod Rivar Park 1ot 20 Block 48
0

R3611-009A3-01100-000~00 ol

347841 ,

4 MI NE OF SPRAGUE St :

Second Addxtlon to Ninrod River Park Lot 10, Block 23

“5N0 BID

R3611-00930~OO700—000°C0
34840 : :
4 MI. NE OF SPRACUE ;
Fourth Addltion to Nlmrod Rlver Park, Lot 32 Block 49
1.50

~ NG BID

‘ R3611-00980-01500 000—00

349037 ;
4 MI. NE OF: SPRAGUE -
Seventh Addltlon to Nlmrod RiVer Park Lot 7, Block 75

/NO BID

R3611~00930~02°00~000-00

3490 91
MI. NE OF: SPR&GUE

ISeventh Addi*lﬂﬁ to Nimrnd szer Fark Lot 13, Block 75
L 50 ) :




. TAX LOT NUMBER R3611—00 BG—02300~000~90 e
KEY 349108 : .
CIOCATION -~ .+ . 4 MI. NE OF SPRAGUE P
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Seventh !d&wtion te Himrod River Park, ynt 14, Block 75

- ACREAGE = 1.50 :
“SALE PRICE L
SOLD TO NO'BID AN

_STREETY ‘ o Coa
" CITY, STATE ZIP

- TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-00°BO"03800—OGQ"30‘“"

KEY 7349251
;IOCATION : 4 MI NE CF SPRAGUE b :
‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Seventh Iddltion to Nlmroa River rark, Lot 34, Block 76
" ACREAGE 1 50 -
fSALE‘PRICE ﬁ
' 8OLD . TO : ,NO BID s
- STREET : :
‘CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER - R3611-00°BD«03900—000—00
'KEY : 349260 ! ,
‘LOCATION . - 4 'MI NE: UF SPRAGUE. !
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Seventh Addltlon to Himrod River Park, Lot 35, Block 76
. 'ACREAGE ' s ‘ S ,
SALE PRICE. : L ﬂ?vv'
~SOLD. TO ‘.o NO BID
. STREET " s L ,
‘CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER ' /R3611 06“80—04000-000-00
KEY . 349279 e

LOCAWION : 4 :MI. NE OF SPRAGUE ;

LEGAL: DESCRIPTION Seventh Addzt;cn to Wlmrod River Park Lot 36, Block 76
'ACREAGE = ; ,

- SALE. PRICE .. : o

SOLD :TO RO NO;BID

STREET . o . :

‘CITY; STATEfZIP

TAX. LoT NUMBER R3611~DOGBG~04200—060~00

KEY » %349340 ST :

LOCATION - 4 MI. NE OF SPRAGUE i vxjt e

LEGAL: DESCRIPTION Seventh44dd1tlon to Nimrod River Park, Lot 38, Block 76
ACREAGE > SR e TR ﬂ"g;i ST B L B ] :
SALE,PRICE

SOLD TO N

STREET . - L

CITY, STATE ZIP ,f'“




LOCATION

‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION
'ACREAGE =~
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET ‘
CITY, 'STATE ZIP

CLEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE ‘
{SALE PRICE .

- 8O0LD ‘TO

| STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUHBER
KEY .
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE =

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO -

'STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

YLEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE =~ -

" SALE PRICE

.SOLD TO

STREET - :
VCITY, STATE Z1IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
'LOCATION -
‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE =~
SALE PRICE

~ SOLD TO

. STREET

(CITY, STATE z:p

;R3511-00983-04300—0ﬂ0 00
349297

4 MI. NI} OF SPRAGUE
Seventh Adiit1on to Nlmrod River Park 1ot 1, Block 76

R3611~- 00981-04700-0ﬂ0 00

349331

4 MI. NE OF SPRAGUE -

Seventh A&ditlon tavﬂimrod River Fark Lot 5, Block 76

NojBIp,g_

R3611 009BO-07700*006*00
348546 ;
4:MI. HF 0? SPRAGUE. .. 0 '
Nlmrod Eivor Park, Lot 17 & Por of Lct 27

ﬁo gID’“

;R3611-00 D0-00300—ODO—00
349581

4 MI NE OF SPRAGUE E'
Por:of. Qovernment Lot 17 and Por NE4 of Sectlon 9, Township 36
5 50 i : :

NO BID &

R3611- OJOAO 00300—000—00

349894

4 MI. NE OF S?RAGUE

Second Additlon to Hlmrod River ?ark Lot 16 ‘Block 11

~'1.45

: NOVBID‘:




TAX LOT NUMBER iR3611—0105{ 04900-000*00

KEY .°380792

LOCATIOV : 4 MI, NE O ¢ ?RAGUE ;

LEGAL . DESCRIPTION Second . Add.tlon to Ninrod River Park, Lot 8, Block 8
1 - ACREAGE : g 1 OO e

- SALE PRICE B :

SOLD TO ,.%'}'~¢&NO BID,

STREET I R

CITY, TATV ZEP

FE R3611—01180—80500-000~00

' S0 351416 , ,
LOCATION R 6 MI NE OF: SPQAGUE i ) ; -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Second Add:tion to Nimrod River Park, Lot 10, Biock 13
ACREAGE - 7 1.50 - PR : :
SALE-PRICE . - ‘
SOLD TO o 3;NO BID
STREET: : o R
CITY STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER ; jR3511-01900—00800-ooo~00
KEY 337201

LOCATICN = 2+MI. SE OF SPRAGUE.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Tract #1164, Lot 12, BLOCR 1
ACREAGE - 23.67

SALE PRICE = T

SOLD TO . .jNo,ani"

 STREET A L
: CITY,;STATE zxp‘

TAX LOT NUMBER : R3611-o19oc~oosoo-ooo-no:
KEY = . 337282 .
LOCATION =~ 2+MI. SE OF SPRAGUE
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Tract #1164 Lot 13, Block 1
ACREAGE. . 23.48
SALE PRICE e L

'sop TO. NO. BID,i;"
STREET =~ ' e
cITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER ) R3711“01SBO-00200—000 CO -
= KBY v cr 1384033 .+ . L
- LOCATION o .6MI SE OF SPRAGUE L ST ‘ §
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Ettates Blghway 66 Unit Plat $1, ILot 12,J
ACREAGE . * s : L
SALE PRICE ' S ,gz ?
SOLD TO: ha~{ NO BID~,
STREET. @ . . Sy
CITY, STATE ZIP




-’R3711—015CO-02700~000-00
‘;385069
: ‘6 MI. SE. OF SPRAGUE
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls FQrEﬁt Estates nghway 66 Unit Plat #1, 1ot 12,7
ACREAGE .
- SALE: PRICE ,: 81, 000 00
7‘T GEORGE 'SCHIMMEL
: : P .0 BOX. 60466
: CITY, STATE ZIP PALO ALPO CA 94305

TAX LOT NUMBER ,R3711-0LGBO-OOZOO—OOO-OO

‘KEY : .38574

TLorATION 5+ MI SE OF SPRAGUh

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Unit Plat #1, Lot 30,/
. ACREAGE “2.30 .

SALE PRICE | '$1,000,00
"~ 'SOLD To o MICHAEL ' KENYON KILEGURNE

‘STREET - 13546 S.W. PETERS RD...
CCITY, STATE ZIP LAKE OSWEGO OR 970 35

TAX LOT NUMBER »R3711-016B0—02400 occ -00
- KEY - : '385899 ! :
 IOCATION
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
 ACREAGE 5
;SALE_PRICE o
© SOLD TO = -
STREET = =
- CITY, STATE 2IP

R3711-01(CQ—00506—000-00
S '1386978 i .
ILOCATION L 5+ MI, SE: CF PRAGUE
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falis Forest Estates Highway 66 Unlt Plat #1, Lot 69,/
ACREAGE ~ 22,00
. SALE PRICE B $7,500. 00 ‘ ',.
SOLD TO . ,ROBERT V. WETHERN SR.@
STREET RT 2 BOX 323 R =
'CITY STATE ZIP BONANZA DR 97623

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711~ 02000—02200-000~00
KEY . ,388217 o

" LOCATION: - 7+ MI. SE OF SPRAGUE
LEGAL. DESCRIPTION Klamath Fnlls Forest Fstates Highway 66 Unit plat #1, Lot 38,J.
ACREAGE ..

'SALE:PRICE,

"~ SOLD TO . i NO BID

'STREET =~ - :

~CITY STATE ZIP




'VITAX LOT NUMBER R3711-02000 02300—000—00
- KEY 383226 . - :
‘LOCATION g 6MI. SE OF QPRAGUE .

" LEGAL: DESCRIPTION Klamath Ealls Farest Estates Elghway £6 Dﬁlt Plat #1, Lot 39,j
_ACREAGE . : .

| SALE PRICE ‘ . ; i :

“'SOLD TO NO BID i o R !

. STREET & ‘

] ACITY,,STATE 1P

R3711—026A0 04100—00C—00
394237 .
: 8 MI SE OF SPRAGUE 'i
4 LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat #4, Lot S,JB
ACREAGE ‘ 2.29 g L
_SALE PRICE . $750.00
%84 SOLD TO ael DICK M. ANUNDSON
2 STREET - : RT 2. BOX 226
2 ,CITY, STATE ZIP BONANZA,,OR 97623

;~fTAX LOT NUMBER : ;R3711-027Bo oosoo-ooo-oo
§ key . - 396510 5
~LOCATION : . ’ 8 MI. SE ‘OF SPRAGUE ' )
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Unlt Plat #1, Lot 6,JB
"ACREAGE " G 202T e _
kSALE_PRICE 21 81,500,000 .J~'if
''SOLD TO =~ DAVID E. POWELL
"STREET. e - “RT -2 'BOX 294 °
CITY STATE ZIP BONANZA,iOR 97623 r

“TAX LOT NUMBER : 'R3711-027BO~01900—000 00

KEY - ; 396397 o

_LOCATION 8. MI. SE.OF SPRAGUE e ' ‘
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Eal?s Forest Estates nghway 66 Unlt Plat $1, Lot 11,/
ACREAGE = i 2 40 - :
. SALE PRICE- .
- 8OLD TO - - ' :NO BID

STREET - o :

CITY, STATE ZIP

- TAX LOT NUMBER ‘,R3711—028A0-01900—000-00
CKEY . . 398395 i w ,

. LOCATION 8 MI SE CF SPRAGUE - : ' ‘ :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Unlt Plat #1, sot 41,J'
-ACREAGE o 20200

. :SALE PRICE - - :.$1,000.€0 -

'SOLD TO =~ . 'WALTER WADDELL

STREET ' “RT 2 BOX: 240"

Q‘CITY, STATE ZIP 'BONANZA, OR 97623




STAX oT NUHBER ]'~R3711-02830-01500 000—00
XKEY .. - ) ‘5397555 L .

~LOCATION 8. MI SE OF SPRFGUE S

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat $1, Lot 1,/B
ACREAGE - 2.48 L : ;

SALE PRICE ~  $1,000.00 '

SOLD TO - AT RODNEY FREITAG o

STREET ‘ /3426 ‘ANDERSCN AVE ~

'CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALIS, OR 97603

"TAX LOT NUMBER ~'R3711-02880-01900-000—00

KEY B 1397591 : :

LOCATION -8 MI. SE OF SP?AGUE g e i . : :

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Fallis Forest ‘Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat #1, Lot 2,J/8
ACREAGE , T s R - : , B '
SALE PRICE B

SOLD TO. ~,§fr ;KO ‘BID- - -

STREET . : B :

'CITY, STATE ZIP

’ TAX 1LOT NUHBER R3711-02800-00100-000-00
KEY 398563 | :
IOCATION : : 8 MI SE OF aPRAGUE A ' . ; : ) :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION K Klamath Falls Forest Estates quhway 66 Unit Plat #1, Lot 16,/

- 'ACREAGE . - 2.29 ~ S S B
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO: : NO;BID“
STREET - .
CITY, STATE ZIP.

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711- 036A0 02400 000-00

KEY = 401979 R :

LOCATION - 9-MI. SE OF SPRAGUE V?' SIS

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat #4, Lot 39,/
ACREAGE v 3.30 'fk;;, : EE L RS
SALE PRICE. = LR S if A SR S : ' )
soLp TO. ~  NO BID SR A AR X ‘ o '
STREET Tov

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX IOT NUMBER ‘R3711-03GCC—00600—000 00
KEY ; 402825 - = EE
LOCATION 9 MI SE OF. SFRAGUE | ‘
“LEGAL DESCRIPTION Klamath' Falls Forest E tates nghway 66 Unit Plat #4 Lot 7,JB’
{ ' ACREAGE ‘ : 2.25- 0 . .
.- SALE PRICE R .$800.00 : ;
- SOLD TO ’k";; WAI&ER WADIELu ,'
"STREET TR ‘RT 2. 'BOX. 240 :
CITY, STATE ZIP BONANZA, OL 97523




ITAX LOT NUHBER R3809—0 C0—03500-OGO~00

KEY - ,429673 3 S

'LOCATION ,ki KLAMATH | FALLS S :
'LEGAL DESCRIPTION Por of QZSW4 of Section 7 Tcwnship 38" SQuth, Range 7 East oL/
‘ACREAGE. : "1 00 o ‘
SALE! PRICE ' : 5

'SOLD TO 5:f NOo BID '

‘STREET S i v

'CITY_ ’ STATE ZIP

‘TAX - LOT NUMBER R3809—01700-00700°000-00

KEY o 430670

‘LOCATION .  KLAMATH FALLS il [ :

LEGAL DESCRIPTION E2N2SW4NW4 of Sectlon 17, . Tanship 38 South, Range 9 East of/t
- ACREAGE ' 10.00 . o v ,

'SALE PRICE = '$2,500. 00 -

E DONALD J: & SUZANNE HOPERICH

: 1400 LAFEVIEW AVE
CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH ' FALLS, OR: 97601

TAX LOT NUMBER ,Cnssoe OJQAB—OOGOO-OOO -00

KEY = 432464 ; :
LOCATION ' KLAMATH FALLS : RO ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Pelican city, Lots 1, 2 & 3, Block 2
ACREAGE : T L B E R N A O R R

' SALE PRICE el ‘

soLb TO NO BID

- STREET : :

CITY, STATE zxp

TAX LOT NUMBER ‘,R3809—0&8DC-05700—000-00
CKEY : 374972
LOCATION 2o - KLAMATH FALLS
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Dixon Addltion to the C1ty of Klamah Falls, Lot 6, Block 6
'ACREAGE !
.SALE PRICE :$4,200.00 -
SOLD: TO. SET KATHY NILSON:
' STREET: ‘ ‘P O BOX 883 ; :
- CITY, STATE. ZIP .KLAMATHTFALLS,'OR 97601,

~TAX LOT NUMBER : R3809-029€D—18900 000-00‘
BN KeEY : 368845 «
~ LOCATION 'KLAMATH FALLS L
N  1LEGAL DESCRIPTION Flrst Addition to »he City of Klamath Fails, Lot 7 & the/South
“"ACREAGE . . . o SR
'SALE PRICE = L
- SOLD TO EE "NO -BID .= .
STREET ' e Ry
CITY, STATE 21p




' SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUHBER ' R3809 029DC-20100~000-0u

"KEY | . .370583

TOCATION .~ KLAMATH FALLS ' :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Nichols Addition to the City of Klamath Falls, Pcr of Lot 2,/B
ACREAGE ;

SALE PRICE - i

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET . i

CITY, STATE Z1P

TAX LOT*NUMBER R3809—032CB-02800-000—00
KEY . 610645 . .
LOCATION . KLAMATH FALIS :“.‘r , o
~LEGAL DESCRIPTION Rlver51de Addition, Lotjl,‘Blcck 13
ACREAGE . o i RN R
' SALE PRICE' SN $3,000.00
~SOLDTO ¢ . KATHY NELSON
: STREET ' .= P O.BOX 883 '
CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALIS, OR 97601

TAX 'LOT :NUMBER kR3809 03203-03600 000—00
KEY . 610814 '
LOCATION ‘ KLAMATH FALLS SRE I
* LEGAL DESCRIPTION Riverside Acdition, Lots 1, 2 & 3, Block 17 -

ACREAGE

. SALE PRICE RO R

.- SOLD . TO i - NO BID
STREET : B
CITY, STATE z1p

TAX LoT NUHBER <R3809—033BA-09900~000—00
KEY: . L . .415839 -~ : .
i LOCATION : - KLAMATH FALLS : : .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Industrlal Addltion, Lor 58, Block 2
" ACREAGE - . ,
SALEkPRICE . :
~. SOLD -TO . NO BID,
" STREET et
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER': R3809-03338-08100~000~00
KEY c oL 1415107 ;
. LOCATION KLAMATH F?JJS
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION Rallraod Addltlon Supplvmental Plat, lot SB, ‘Block S -
.. ACREAGE : . v
‘- SALE -PRICE - .  “
- SOLD:TO : : _"5 NO. BID ::
"'STREET .| ‘ R T
; CITY, STATE ZIP




SOLD;ATxAﬁCTION .i, g

_TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY '
LOCATIO

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE.

SOLD TO.

STREET

ciTY, SWATE ZIP

‘-R3811—009D0"03400—0U1-0"
463199 :

BLY MTN CU@)F? : , B

Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat #2, Lots 24

No BID

"R3907-025CU-07100-000—00

LOCATIO
'LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO '
STREET

CITY, STATE 7IP

A LDT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATI N
LEGAL DESCRIP”ION
ACREAGE
_SALE PRICE -
~ SOLD TO
| STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
“KEY S
'LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE .

SALE PRICE

+SOLD TO

STREET SRpCE
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER',’
KEY
LOCATION

. LEGAL DESCRIPTION

'STREET
fCITY, STATE 2IP

487681

KENO : S
First Addirion to Kxamath River'Acrgs, Lot 5, Block 1l

NO'BID"

',Rié08-007DA705300—000L90“

494325

ROUND LAKE e REE N R I o e o
Por. SZNE4SE4 of Section~7L'Tcwnship 39 South, Range 7 East of/
21.00 R : , v

88, 000. 00

NORMA V.. NORTHCUTT
1930 ROUND. LAKE ©
KLAMATH F%LLS, OR 97601

R3908 013DA-00400-030—00

496396 ,

KLAMATH FALLS e , ; :

Por NE4SE4 of Section 13,'Tcwnshipr39 South, Range 8 East of/t

$4 550 CO

- THOMAS MGNSGOR

P O BOX &
CHILOQUIH, DR 97624

R3908-01!DA-00500—OOO~00

- 496403

KLAMATH FALLS _ ' IRLIRE o '
Por NE45E4 of Sectlan 13, qunship 16 south, Range 8 Ea;trcht

s8, 800.00 ﬂ~

THOMAS nousbon

P O BOX 232

'CHILDQUIN, OR 97624




'SOLD.AT.AUCTION

‘,'h3908é036n -01600-000-00
503173 L ol
'MIDLAND

T.EGAL - DESCRIPTION Second Addition to Midland, lots 7 & 8, Block 2
ACREAGE , ‘ s e s

-SALE PRICE"

'SOLD TO .

- STREET

_CITY, STATE ZIP

33909—007’3—04300-009—00 :
538109 . |
. STEWART IENOX

TON ' ST
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION Stewart Lots 22 & 4‘“'

ACREAGE ~

SALE PRICE‘?gf $2,600.00

SOLD TO  MICHAEL W. REILLY
STREET ' P O BOX 454

cITy, STATE ”IP (KLAMATH rALLs, OR 97001

, TAX
~ KBY -

LOT NUMBER i R3911-01‘)CA—04400—000-—00
o 6062130 . ,

IOCATION SRS ‘BONANZA [ ; e
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Flrst Adiitlon to Bcnanza, Lot‘lz, Block 14

ACREAGE i

‘SALE PRICE - $1 500. oo %,‘ '
SOLD. TO - BONANZA AscEMBLY OF GOD
STREET i 31897 MISSION ST
CITY,'STATE‘ZIP '.BONANZA, OR 97623

TAX ! LOT NUMBER . R3911-—0] 0CB—01900-000 00

-KEY !

606801 = iE 37

. LOCATION ‘ BONANZA |

‘LEGAL DES»RIPTION Grandvxnw Addltlon to Bonanza, Lots 5 & 6, Biock 60 -

ACREAGE

GALE PRICE

SOLD TO. = no BIDf}'

' STREET.
‘«CITY, STA‘I‘E ZIP

STATE OF OREGON COUNTY OF KLAMATH ssd v

‘ j:Flled for record at request of i :" i Klamath County ' ___ the 23rd
of _Sept. - U __‘J._._ at12:82 oclock B M, and duly recorded in Vol. . MIl

of ngeds S - on Page . 19
: ) Evelyn Biehn - Couxm Clerk

day:




