	Volmg2Page 287
. 3	9489
1 2 3 4 5 6 7 8 9 10 11 12 13 14 15 16 17 18 19 20 21 22 22 22 22 22 22 22 2	IN THE CIRCUIT COURT OF THE STATE OF OREGON FOR THE COUNTY OF KLAMATH In the Matter of the Marriage of NO. 90-3487 CV CARY NOLLINS, NOTICE OF CLAIM OF and ATTORNEYS LIEN ATTORNEYS LIEN The undersigned, Enver Bozgoz, hereinafter called "Claimant" of the law firm of Enver Bozgoz, hereinafter called "Claimant" Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601, gives notice of and claims the fol- lowing attorney's lien pursuant to ORS 87.445 in the sum of \$4,275.00. This lien arises out of services rendered to GARY ROLLINS, in the above captioned suit in the Circuit Court of the State of Oregon for the County of Klamath. The undersigned claims a lien in the amount set forth above upon the attached Itemized Statement and upon the real property which was awarded to the Petitioner by the Judgment and Decree of Dissolution of Marriage more particularly described as follows: Lot 12, Block 2, BelAire Gardens, in the County of Klamath, State of Oregon

chy3

I further certify that I sent a true copy of the within Lien, certified by me to be such, to my client, Gary Rollins, at 5787 1 2 BelAire Drive, Klamath Falls, Oregon 97603. 3 annan, 1992. 6 day of DATED this 4 5 6 7 ENVER BOZGOZ Claimant 8 STATE OF OREGON 9) 55. County of Klamath 10 I, ENVER BOZGOZ, being first duly sworn, depose and say that the above lien claim contains a true statement of my demand 11 12 and the amount due my law firm as I verily believe. 13 14 ENVER BOZGOZ, Claiman 15 16 SUBSCRIBED AND SWORN to before me this 6 day of 17 ى ئارتىققىمتىشۇخىمىت توھىتە، مەر 18 1992 ... 105 101 101 100AL 105 101 102 102 102 NOTARY PUBLIC FOR OREGO ST DOBLIG - OREGON 19 NG My Commission Expires /- 22-42 1910 (SEP) 1, 12, 14H, 72, 1952 20 AFTER RECORDING RETURN TO: 21 Enver Bozgoz Attorney at Law 1135 Pine Street, Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601 ŝ 22 ž 23 24 NOTICE OF CLAIM OF ATTORNEY'S LIEN -Page 2 25 26

ENVER BOZGOZ ATTORNEY AT LAW 1135 PINE STREET KLAMATH FALLS, OREGON 97601

Gary Rollins 5787 Bel Aire Drive Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601

Re: Rollins and Rollins Dissolution

1/6/92

1/6/92	OF AUTORNEY FEES	
	ITEMIZED STATEMENT OF ATTORNEY FEES	TIME
	ITEM	TIME
DATE	Office consultation with client	1.00
10/3/90	Office consultation with client	1.00
10/8/90	Office consultation with client	2.50
10/10/90	Office consultation with client Preparation of Property Settlement Agreement	
	Office consultation and note taking	1.50
10/11/90	a patition Affidavit,	2.00
10/16/90	Preparation of Petition, Mersonal Motion and Order Awarding Personal Property	
10/17/90	Respondent served, filing of return with Court	.50
10/17/90	Preparation of Show Cause why she should not cooperate with realtor	1.00
	Preparation of Writ of Assistance	1.00
10/17/90	ith alient & parents	3.00
10/22/90	Consultation with Clience a prod- re: trying for custody & grand- parent visitation Review of Respondent's Affidavit, Motion, Order to Show Cause & Citation for Show Cause hearing scheduled for 10/29/90, preparation of Counter-Affidavit, Motion and Order to Show Cause re: support	

289

ş.,

Page 2 Itemized state	ment: Rollins	
10/26/90	Letter to client re: change in date of show cause hearing	.25
10/31/90	Delivery of check for \$1,800 to Les Klein's secretary	.25
11/5/90	Office consultation preparation for show cause hearing and show cause hearing hearing	3.00
11/28/90	Review of Temporary Judgment, Support Calculations, Affidavit for Attorneys fees of opposing counsel letter of opposing counsel	.75
11/30/90	Preparation and transmittal of Petitioner's Uniform Support Affidavit	.50
	Preparation of Objection to Respon- dent's Support calculations, Objection to Attorneys fees and Memorandum	1.00
	Preparation of Affidavit, Motion and Order to Withdraw funds from savings for payment of house payment, trans- mittal to opposing attorney	1.00
12/6/90	Review of Judge's decision re: child support and attorneys fees	.25
12/7/90	Review of At Issue Memorandum	.25
12/10/90	Review of Temporary Judgment Prepared by Respondent's attorney	.50
12/19/90	Preparation and transmittal of Motion for Refund of Bail	.50
1/2/91	Phone call from Diane Rollins, wife's boyfriend broke Gary's glasses, how long can Gary go without paying support. Discussion with attorney and call back	.25
12/20/90	Affidavit, Motion and Order to withdraw funds for house payments	.50

Page 3 Itemized Statem	ent: Rollins	
Itemized Studen	a nature of Judgment	.25
1/7/91	Review of Notice of Entry of Judgment Preparation of Affidavit, Motion and for withdrawal of funds for	.50
2/5/91	house payment, transmittal to opposing	
2/8/91	Review of opposing attorneys objection review of Judge	.25
	Advise client by letter of settlement	.25
4/7/91	hearing date	.25
	Review Respondent's Response	
4/24/91	Office consultation with client, preparation for settlement hearing	3.00
4/24/91	Settlement Hearing	2.00
5/4/91	Office consultation with client, review of photographs and documents preparation for trial, review of authorities	
5/6/91	Preparation of Trial Memorandum Preparation and copying of Exhibits review of loans from parents, bank accounts, income tax returns	3.00
	office consultation with client and	8.00
5/7/91	+rial	1.00
5/14/91	Office consultation with client	.50
5/15/91	Review of letter of opposing attorney re: Diane Rollins illness and request for documents	.50
5/30/91	Review of Judge's letter regarding	.50
6/4/91	Letter to client re: completion of trial	. 2 3

291

#

292

Page 4 Itemized Statement: Rollins

6/12/91	Office consultation with client and finish trial	5.00
10/15/91	Review of Judge's decision, call to client to pick up decision	.50
10/21/91	Research of authorities, preparation of Objections to Court's findings, office consultation with client	1.00
11/15/91	Research and preparation for argument on Objections, argument	1.00
11/26/91	Preparation of Judgment and Decree of Dissolution of Marriage, transmittal to Court and opposing attorney	3.00
TOTAL HOURS		52.75

52.75 hours x \$100.00 per hour= \$5,275.00 Less Retainer -1,000.00 10/18/90

TOTAL AMOUNT OWING

5

\$4,275.00

STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH: ss.

Ellad fo	r record at request of	Enver Bozgoz the day	y
rited to	Jan.	D., 19 92 at 3:47 o'clock P.M., and duly recorded in Vol. M92	.,
01	of	Co. Lien Docket on Page287	
		Evelyn Biehn County Clerk	
FEE	\$30.00	By Qaulon Mullendere	-