CARLR. BURKHART, SHERIFF S
mvma&mm-—nmm FALLS, 0REGON97501—(5W)8835130—FAX(503) 8834271

- May26,1994

The parcels as listed in the attach d. addendum w re sold at public auction held at
the Klamath Coumy Faxrgmupds on’ May 12 1994 Jat:10;00 a. m.

“To Protect and To Serve The Comfﬁunity” ,




NORTH OF GILCHRI
lock 22, Tract 1082 Th:.rd Add:.t:.on to River Plne./Estat

$4 500 00
JAMES . H. & LINDA A. JONES
HC 61 BOX 41
1A PINE, OR!| 97739

LPRX LOT NUMBER R2310-03600~08400-000—00
. KBY T ) 142081
.| LOCATION - SOUTH | OF I.APINE OFF HWY 31
~LEGAL DBSCRIPTIOH Lot 4, Block 11, Tract 1060 Sun Forest Estates
-ACRBAGE . |- ' :
SALE PRICE $3 500 .00 /i
SOLD TO" DONALD G. LII.LIAN PERKINS ,
O ! P.O,. BOX 404, ‘ , -

‘CITY, STATE IIP LA PINE, OR 97739

R2409—03008-07900-000—00

155575 .

- TOWN- OF CRESCENT ) Ceton ‘
12, Block 31, Touwn of Crescent

1691 Asvonn
I.O‘I.‘IS, OR 97368

R3313~03300-01600—000-00
: - as2705 L |
mcunou | SYCAN. UNI T
IEB&L DBSCRIPTION The le 415' m/l of the le ¢035' m/1l of Lot 7, Block~10,JKlaﬂ

9. 85
$2,600.00/
DENNIS, SMITH
STREET P.O0. BOX 5327 o
crTY, s'ra-rs 2IP u.oaa, OR 97006

R3407-0158A—02200—000-00
191697

PION Lot 2, Block 5, Woodlvand park
$12; ooo.oo , g
| CECELIA' DURBIN -

. .. P.o. BOX 67
, STATE ZIP cmmqum, on 97624




'?nocmwxou
‘iIEGAL»DESCRIPTION

 ACREAGE

~ SALE PRICE
. SOLDTO

;s'mm-:‘r

,*c1!!. 'STATE z:p
max Lar uunasn
jIOCNTI

" LEGAL DBSCRIPTION
. ACREAGE

[SBLS ‘PRICE

- SOLD TO "

uLSﬂRBET
STATE ZIP

83407-01588-00400-000—00

191161 - :
CHILOQUIN AREA & S
Lot 2, Block' 7,; »oodland park

R3408-019C0-00300-000-00

206985 . ; : ;

BRAYMILL AREA | Co

An 80 toot st:ip of 1and adjacent to & parallel with the Wly./p: .
.72 . s e

NO BID

5?,'nssov—oozaavoosoo-ooo-oo

220335

- CHILOQUIN ' '
, Lot 9, Block 7, Chiloquin Drxve

$850 .00 i

pIMM BURR, INC.

325 MAIN STREET #203

;KLAHATK FALLS, OR 97601 o

33507~oosac-oosoo-ooo-oo )
228402

- AGENCY LAKE AREA

Lot 2, Block 15, Tract 1053 oregon Shores

$3,450.00 | ‘
LESLIE A. & VALERIE wasou
HC 76 BOX 1007 =

;LA PINB, OR 97739

R3507~0065C‘05000-000-00 :
224858 :
AGENCY "LAKE AREA

,Iot 22, Block 7, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores

S4, 000 00

- FRANK & "MELBA canaxzs

2617 CIMMARON AYENUE '
IHI VALEEY, CA 93065




;’R3507-006C&-O4600-000-00
228051
AGENCY LAKE AREA
t 8, Block 4, Tract 1053 Oregon shores

woBm

83507—006DA-00800-000-00

228275 .

AGERCY LAKE _AREA

Lot 4,,Block 11, Tract 1053 oregon Shores

NO BID

R3507—006DA~02000-000-00
_ R 228408 ' :
LOCATION : AGENCY - LARKE AREA :
| LEGAL. DESCRIPTION Lot 16, Block 11, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores
i, SALE PRICB o , ' :
SOLD TO -  No onf

1 STRERT.
CITY. STATE ZIP

R3507—006DB—01400-000-00
228729 0
~ AGENCY LAKE AREA ' ‘
~Lot 18.‘Block 6, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores
sz 750 00 -
SYLVIA PEABODY
P.O. - BOX 7172 L
’RLAHATH FALLS, “OR 97602

R3507-006DB-03400-000~00

228952

AGENCY LAKE AREA

;Lot 18, Block 9, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores

. wo 31D11 &




Vrmx Lor'nuuaan
:nczzzon L
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION
' ACREAGE

|| SALE PRICE

‘g SOLD TO

§ | STREET o
|| CITY, STATE zIP

| LEGAL uzscn:prxou
ACREAGE !

S ISALE: ERICEV
& SOLD TO

NO BID

; R3507°00608~05900~000~00

229194
AGENCY LAKE AREA
Lot 38, Block 16, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores

$3,650.00
RICHARD M. & CAROLYN L. DAVIS
37407 LAKELAND ROAD
CBILOQUIN, OR 97624

R3507-007CD-09000-000-00

231573 °

AGENCY - LAKE AREA

Lot 14, Block 6, Latakomie shores

NO BID

R3507-017BD~03300—000—00

234696

AGENCY LARB AREA ’

Lot‘zo, Block 36, Tract 1184 Oregon Shores Unit 2 1st Addltlon

J

b

R3507—017CB—01500-000-00
237781 B .
AGENCY LAKE AREA ‘ .
Iot 7, Block 30, Tract 1184 Oregon Shores Unit 2 1st Addltlon

Lot 17 Bloc‘ 4, Tract 1021 Wllllamson River Knoll
.28
$4,250.; 00

fTIHH BURR,

325 MAIN STREET $203  °

, KLAHATK FALLS, OR 97601




“1R3507~018DA,03100-000-00

1245513 |
, : AGENCY LAKE AREA '
- LEGALs DBSCRIPTION Lot 10 Block 24, Tract 1113 Oregon Shores Unit 2
- ACRERGE
.- SALE PRICB : $5,000.0Q
" SOLD TO . WM. A. & GERTRUDE N. ROLLAND
- STREET . 34374 CLOUTIER DRIVE
- CYXTY, STATE: ZIP CHILDQUIN;;OR 97624

o TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-015A0—03600-000—00
o L 259570 »
. "NW: OF SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 22, Block 4, Klamath Forest Estates
3,000
$1,200.00
JAMES WALKER"
2272 #1 BROWN STREET
NAPA;VCA“94558

R3510—01580-02400 -000~00
259909 - ,
NW OF SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 40, Block 4, Klamath. Porest Estates
2900,
-'$900.00
AIMORN A. BRACKETT
P.O.: BOX 345
SPRAGUE RIVBR, OR 97639

R3510-01580—03700—000—00
260130 .
.NW:OF: SPRAGUE RIVER o
-Lot S0, Block 4, Klamath Forest Estates
1.3.40
$1,200.00
ANDREW A, PATTERSON
' P.0, BOX 591
- KLAHRTH,FALLS,’OR 97601“

R3510~02400-01100-000—00
256485
NW OF SPRAGUE RIVER i ‘
The 81/2NW1/4SW1/4 of Section 24 Township 35 South, Range 10/
20.00.
$s5, 500 00 ‘
GORDON NEWELL

ELES, CA 90068




,‘R3511—009Do 1600-000—00 -

| LEGAL" onscnxprxcn
' /ACREAGE -
|ISALE PRICE

STREET f[f‘ :
| |/cTTY, STATE ZIP

' NO BID

276418 H
."NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 52, Block 6, Oregon Pineskj

R3511-009D0—05000—000—00
276365 - :
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 96, Block 5,,Oregon,91hes

NO BID

R3511-010C0-00400-000-00
276891

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVBR ‘
Lot 2, Block 12, Oregon Pines

i

R3511~010C0-00600-000-00

276775

'NE OF spnasuz RIVER

Lot 5, Block 11, Oregon Pines¢

NO a:n}‘

33511-01330-01400-000-00

279415
" 'NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

5Lot‘3»?Block345, Oregon Plnes‘}f




| LEGAL nxscnxprxox Lot 4, Block 47, Oregon Pines
| ACREAGE ; v .
|| SALE PRICE
d ‘sopTO V
' /STREET
@~crr¥,;srarz1zrp

‘] mmx UOT NUHBBR R3511’015A0-01200-000-00

| KBY S . 283990

= IDCBIIOR "~ HE OF. SPRAGUB RIVER : : :
S LBGAL DEQRIPTIOH I.ot_S&, ‘Block 18, Oregon.Pines
“1ISALE PRICE ‘ I ECTIT O S

lsolpTO . RO BID

| STREET .
CITY, STATE ZIP

- 'TRX LOT NUMBER R3511—015A0~01400-000-00

UKBY e 284007 :

} ' rocaTiOoN NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 57 Block 18, Oregon Pines

NO BIb“‘

R3511-015A0—03800—000-00
283623 . '

NE OF. SPRAGUE ‘RIVER '
Lot 1, Block 16, Oregon Pines

No BID

: R3512-00800~01500-000-00
291428

Beginning at the NW corner - of E2E2W2NW4SE4 that lays Northr
1.00
$1,000:01
¢IMM BURR, INC.
325 MAIN STREET $203
v_,KLAHATH FALLS, OR 97601




?';SALB'PRICB
i;;SOLD TO
| STREET

_KEY
| LOCATION

- R3512-02500 'oeoo-ooo-oo'

‘}‘LDCAEION i
|LEGAL nxscaxprxou

‘f~crrz, STATE ZIP

max LOT NUHSBR

xEY
| LOCATION

i LEGAL: BESCRIP?IOR
- ACREAGE

!SALE PRICE.

|SOLD TO

STREET

(ffgrgz,fsramnjzzp

‘t&x LOT uuquR
XEY :

:*;xnmmmtoa

- ' LEGAL DESCRIPTION
'ACREAGE = -

CITY, STATE ZIP
TAX 10T NUMBER

LEGAL. DESCRIPTIOH
}'QCRBLGE s
;'fShLE;PRICB:‘

L1 SOLD TO i
 sTReer .

: EIZY,:STATE ZIP,

g Tﬁx LO@ NUHBER
{KBY.

: DOCATIOH o

- LEGAL DBSCRIPTION

/CITY, STATE zIP

All’tha portion of the wzsn4uw¢ and all of that portlon of th [
“$7,500.00

TIMM BURR, Iuc;
325 MAIN STREET #203
xnauamg~ranms, OR 97601

R3512—02500~01000~000—00
292720

All that portion of the- EZSE4NW4 and the E2NE4SW4 Section 25,/
22.60 -
$8, soo 00 S
RALFH & ALICIA T. BEHISDARFER
P.O. BOX 11 : e

- BEATTY, -OR 97521

i

R3513—033A0-D3700-000—00

- 297066

NORTH OF BEATTY :
Lot 29, Block 15, Tract 1010 Flrst Addition to Ferguson/Mounta

'NO,BIDﬁf:

R3513~ 033A0-04900-000-00

- 296968

NORTH OF BEATTY
Lot 17, Block 19, Tract 1010 Flrst Addltlon to FergusonJMounta

ALMO} &
P.O. BOX 345

~ SPRAGUE n:vna. OR 97639




R351 u033 103200—000-001
297903 ‘
NORTH . OF BEATTY v
lot 6, Block 23, Tract 1010 First Addition to Ferguson Mountai

$1,100.00
; ALMORN A. BRACKETT
|| STREET : - P.O. BOX 345 =
'icrrv,'srama zxr~ ,spnhsuz vaaa, OR 97639

Tax nor NUMBER stos—oosaa-oasoo-ooo-oo

: , 308438 |

-%zoczmxox ‘ ROCKY POINT
| LEGAL nzscnxpmxox Lot 5. Block 9, Arrowhead Village
| ACREAGE
§ | SALE PRICE $1, sso 00

| soLD TO ' JAMES F. & LORETTA J. SNOOK

: - 27226 ROCKY POINT ROAD

- STREET .
1+ CITY, STATE ZIP  KLAMATH FAL;S, OR - 97601

R3606-0090A—05400—000-00

312593
ROCKY: POINT : ‘ :
]:.ot 180 of. the Sly portion of Tracts B & ¢, Frontier Tracts

$1 300 00 :

CLYDE. 'SEVERSON

2817  E. MCANDREWS
' HBDPORD, OR 97504

R3613—00580-01000-000-00
359873 3

NORTH OF BEATTY

Lot 3. Block 6, Ferguson uountain Pines

fuo;aipf

: 33613-00580-01100-000—00
KBY. 9 359864 i ;
hOCATIOR : NORTH OF BEATTY ~
LEGAL DSSCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 6, Ferguson Mountain Pines

*‘O’ B_iD”




R3711-01680-01700-000-00
385826 .

BLY MOUNTAIN. CUT—OFF S B -
Lot 6,;Block 5, Klamath Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat No .

$2, 100. 00

ALMORN ‘A. 'BRACKETT

P.O. BOX 345 ,
pnacng nzvgn, OR 97639

R3711-020A0—02100-000—00
387815 1
BLY MOUNTAIN CUT-OFF

, Lot 26, Block 16, Klam&th Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit PlatJ

STREET
czxz, smamsszxr

xo,stn

‘ 23809-0190A-01100-ooo-oo

;.zocamxau =
 LEGAL DESCRIPTION
. ACREAGE

- SALE PRICE

~ sob TOo

' STREET L

| CITY, STATE ZIP

~ TAX LOT NUMBER
' KBY ,

; IOCATION
| LEGAL nescnxpmzox

' ACREAGE

' SALE PRICE
! SOLD. TO
[ STREET
“CITY. STNTB ZIP

max zoT uuusxn

| KBY ,
LOCATION
nzsan,nzscnxprron
(ACREAGE =

CITY. STATB ZIP

436102 o
PELICAN CITY . i
Baap' in the NE4SE4 Sec. 19, Twshp 38 S, Rng 9 EWM, which lies/ |
1135 :
$9, 500 00
WILLIAM BLLIS ADAMS
2545 CALIFORNIA AVENUE

xzauaxn FALLS,;OR 97601

R3809-02908—01800—000-00

300267

KLAMATH FALLS
Lot 2, Block 115, Buena Vista Addition to the City of Klamath/

s4,1oo,oo,
JAMES L. & CHERICE F. TREASURE
238 FULTON STREET ‘
KLAMATH PALLS, ‘OR 97601

R3809-02900—13100-000—00

368863 L

KLAMATH PALLS

Lot 1. Block 31, First Addition to Klamath Falls
$4 200 00!

GOECO, Inc.,
P.O. BOX 357

7,xnauamn FALLS, OR 97601




R3809-033BD~00800~-000-00

478968 f

KLAMATH FALLS:

Lot 9, Block 14, Industrial Addition

4 SALE PRICB 5750.00 :
g | SOLD TO DONALD WM. ECK & JASON A. ECK
-1 STREET 2320 WHITE AVENUE

' CXTY, STATE ZIP RlAHATH FALLS, OR 97601

_TAX LOT NUMBER aseos-oaznn—ooeoo—ooo-oo

KEY , 478959 ,

LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS

 LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 14, Industrial Addition

$750.00\‘
DONALD WM. ECK & JASON A. ECK
2320 WHITE AVENUE
KLAHATHfFALLS, OR 97601

' vR3810-02500—00900-000-00
455331 !
15 MI. E. OF KF ’ . .
- A portion of the NE4SE4 of Sectlon 25, Twshp 38 S, Rnge 10 EWM i
4.82: F
- $4,600.00
JIMMIE D. HUGGINS, SR.
STREET C e 2517 CALCAGNO!
CITY,'S&ATE ZIP ,CERES, CA 195307

5} ' R3811~00330-00100—000-00

| KBY. S 459471

T IDCAIIOR : BLY MOUNTAIN CUT-OFF

! LBGAL DBSCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 65, Klamath Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit Plat #
| ACREAGE L

' 'SALE PRICE $3,400.00

SOLD TO - . EAST CASCADE PROPERTY, INC.

SSTREET - = & . P.O. BOX 214 ‘ '

.'CITY,;STIIB531P 'KLRHBIB FALLS, OR 97601

RSSOS‘OIBABPOlBOO-OOO—OO
495912
" 'S. OF STEWART. LENNOX
Lot 5, Block 5, Fairhaven Haights




»23909-00563—00500-000-00

833729 ..

RIVERSIDE ADDITION B

A port:ion of the SWASW4 of Sectzon 5, Township 39 South, Range

NO BID

R3909-007CB—04700—000-00;

Lot 24, Block ‘7, Stewart

$1,100 00 it
_DWAYNE T. CLEHENTS
P. O.,BOX 792 |
KENO, OR 97627

33909-00708—04900-000-00
538118, :

STEWART LENNOX ,
Lot 21, Block 7, Stewart

$3,100. 00 >
ROBERT D. & MICHELLE L. BAUMGART, JR.
3832 CREST STREET
KLAH&TE_?ALLS, OR 97603

R3911-0108C-01800-000-00
605768
. BONANZA S ~ ,
The Ely 16. 66 feet of Lot 9 and all of Lot 10, Block 32,/Grand ' B

L 92, 000 00 :

" DAVID HC'KBY‘
P.0. BOX 271
BORANZA, OR 97623

R3911~010CA—00300—000—00
606035 ,
 BONANZA - : ,
A parcel of land in the NE4SW4 of Section 10, Twsp 39 S, Rnge/
Y 11 E R . : ‘
7 §7,500. 00
_RICHARD & DONNA WESTSTEYN
S P.O.jBOX 715 2694 -LOST- ST.
»‘BOHAHZA, OR 97623 i




R4008-01700—00900—000-00
623819 |
- KENO'

1!.86&!: DESCRIP'.‘PION The szwzsmsm of Section 17, Township 40 South, Range 8 East,/

. WILLIAM' GUY POSTER IIT
; - S 22141 SALTER ROAD
{/CITY, STATE ZIP pmxs cA 92570

. STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH:  ss.

i Filed for record st mqucst \ .- Klamath County the 2nd day
June AD, 19 94 a__3:22  ogclock _B_M., and duly recorded in Vol. __M9%
; - Deeds - on Page 17431 .
. Evelyn Biehn = . County Clerk
By

. Return:’ Co’@ni'ssione'r‘s‘ Office




