Klamarh County Sheriff’s O

CARL R. BURKHART, SHERIFF
808 50, STH ST. — KLAMATH FALLS, OREGON 57601 — (503) 883-5130 — FAX (503) 883-4271

Rage207£8 -
ice

August 03, 1995

Sheriff's Return of Sale

The parcels listed in the attached addendum were sold at public auction held at the
Klamath County Fairgrounds on June 29, 1995 a¢ 10:00a.m.

The total revenue for the sale amounted to $173,100,00,

Carl R. Burkhart
Sheriff

By ffa)bQOCOL

Rebecca Dailey, Deputy.

“To Protect and To Serve The Community”




2!)72&3y4

SOLD. AT . AUCTION 08-07-95P02:41 RCVD

TAX LOT NUMBER R2310-036C0-10900-000-00

KEY 140911
LOCATION SE OF LA PINE, OR
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 9, Block 7, Tract 1060~Sun Forest Estates
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE $3,600.00
‘ SCLD TO CAROLYN GLOISTEIN
g STREET 129 EDMEADES COURT

CITY, STATE ZIP OAKLEY, CA 94561

TAX LOT NUMBER R2316-036C0-11000-000-00

KEY 140902

LOCATION SE OF IA PINE, OR

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, Block 7, Tract 1060-Sun Forest Estates
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE $3,600.00

SOLD TO CAROLYN GLOISTEIN

STREET 129 EDMEADES COURT

CITY, STATE ZIP OAKLEY, CA 94561

TAX LOT NUMBER R2409~030CA-06800-000-00

KEY 154059

LOCATION CRESCENT

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6, Block 38, Crescent
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIPp

TAX LOT NUMBER R2607~001C0~-08900-000-00

KEY 164823

LOCATION HWY 58

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 8, Tract 1069
B8 ACREAGE
@l SALE PRICE

SOLD To NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-00120~04800-000~00

KEY 80035

LOCATION SAND CREEK

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block 2, Tract No. 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow
ACREAGE 1.03

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET 5
CITY, STATE ZIP .




&

<0789

SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-001D0-08600-000~00

KEY 81583

LOCATION SAND CREEK AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 25, Block 11, Tract No. 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow o
ACREAGE el
SALE PRICE o
SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-001D0-08700-000-00

KEY 81618

LOCATION SAND CREEK AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 24, Block 11, Tract No. 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow

ACREAGE :

SALE PRICE :
SOLD TO NO BID e
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX IOT NUMBER R3107-012A0-02900-000~-00

§ KEY 82038
il LOCATION SAND CREEK AREA
: LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 17, Tract No. 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-012A0~03000-000-00

KEY 82270

LOCATION SAND CREEK AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 17, Tract 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow

ACREAGE 1.10

SALE PRICE b
SOLD TO NO BID 5
STREET < )

CITY, STATE ZIP

5 TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-012A0-04100-000-00

Ny KEY 82528

H LOCATION SAND CREEK AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block 17, Tract 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow
ACREAGE . 1.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

1OCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

<0730

R3107~-012A0-09400-000-00

82430

SAND CREEK AREA

Lot 4, Block 16, Tract 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow
1.00

NO BID

R3207-03400-01600-000-00

84651

NORTH OF CHILOQUIN

The E1/2 NW1/4 SW1/4 SE1/4 of Section 34, Township 32 South,«R
5.00

$14,500.00

CARL B. THORNTON

4212 HOMEDALE

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

R3313-00000-00800-000-00
174947

The N1/2N1/2SW1/4 situated in Section 1, Township 33 Southk,«Ra
40.00

NO BID

R3313-01300-04800-000-00
175937

The North 415’ LESS 1000’ of Lot 19,.Block 18, Klamath Falls«F
5.74

NO BID

R3313-03000-05900-000-00
181252

All that certain lot, piece or parcel of land described as the
9.86
$5,650.00

D. ROSIER & P. STUTHEIT

4024 DONALD DRIVE

MARISVILLE, CA 95901




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD 10

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY; STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

<0791

R3313~03100-01000-000-00
181751

The S1/2E1/2 of Lot 11, Block 2, Klamath Falls Forest Estates«
9.86
$4,000.00

D. BAILEY & G. PONDELIA, JR.

5082 ANKENY

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

R3313-03200-02800-000-00
182251

The 81/2 W1l/2 of Lot 12, Block 5, Klamath Falls Forest Estates
9.86

NO BID

R3313-03200-02%900-000-00
182304

The N1/2Wl1/2 of Lot 11, Block 5, Klamath Falls Forest Estates«
9.86

NO BID

R3313-03300-03600~000-00

182723

SYCAN UNIT

The S51/2 of Lot 13, Block 7, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Syca
4.93
$6,600.00

ANGELA DAWSON

P.O. BOX 673

RIO VISTA, CA 94571-0673

R3407-027B0-01500-000~00

193953

NORTH OF CHILOQUIN

The N1/2SE1/4NW1/4 of Section 27, Township 34 South, Range 7«E
20.00

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CiTY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

20792

R3407-034CA~-03500-000-00

198752

CHILOQUIN

Lot 122, Spinks Addition, being a portion of Government Lot 6

NO BID

R3407-034CA-03600~000-00

198761

CHILOQUIN

Lot 123, Spinks Addition, being a portion of Government Lot 6.

NO BID

R3407-034CD-00100~000-00

200080

CHILOQUIN

Lots 1 & 2, Block 7, West Chiloquin.

NO BID

R3407-034DA~02200~-000-00

201524

CHILOQUIN

Lot 11, Block 5, First Addition to Chiloquin.

NO BID
R3407-034DA-02400-000-00
201542

CHILOQUIN
The N1/2 of Lot 12, Block 5, First Addition to the City of«Chi

NO BID




20733

SOLD.AT.AUCTION

8l TAX LOT NUMBER R3413-021C0-00700~-000-00
¥ KEY 113629

Bl LOCATION
| LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S1/2SE1/4NW1/4SW1/4 Section 21, Township 34 South, Range 1 =
ACREAGE 5.00
SALE PRICE $5,750.00
SOLD TO CARL B. THORNTON
STREET 4212 HOMEDALE

CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507-006AC-02800-000~00

KEY 224625

LOCATION AGENCY LAKE AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block 2, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507-006DB-04500~000-00

KEY 229087

LOCATION AGENCY LAKE AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 15, Block 4, Tract 1053 Oregon Shores
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX 1OT NUMBER R3507-007CD-02900~000~00

KEY 230707

LOCATION AGENCY LAKE AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 13, Block 5, Latakomie Shores
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE $5,000.00

SOLD TO WM. & ROSEMARY FIGUEROA

STREET 234 ODESSA AVENUE

CITY, STATE ZIP PITTSBURG, CA 94565

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507-007CD-10600~-000~-00

KEY 231252

IOCATION AGENCY ILAKE AREA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 16, Block 2, Latakomie Shores
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

soLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

soLD TO

STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CcITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

R3507-017CB—05900-000—00

236809

AGENCY LAKE AREA

Lot 41, Block 29, Tract 1113-Oregon shores-Unit 2

NoO BID

R3507—021BD—00700-000-00

248510

WILLIAMSON RIVER

Lot &, Block 1, Williamson River Estates

$2,500.00
RAY K. POTEET

200 WILLIAMSON RIVER DRIVE
CHILOQUIN, OR 97624

R3510—02100-00100—000-00

261415

NW OF SPRAGUE RIVER

The NE4NE4; E2NW4ANE4 of section 21, Township 35 South, Range 1
60.00

$60,000.00

ELLEN SUING

1924 NE VARNISH

REDMOND, OR 97756

R3511-00000-02700-000-00

275632

NE OF BEATTY

The SW1/4NWi/4 of Section 21, Township 35 South, Range 11 East
40.00

NO BID

R3511—014C0-08000—000—00
282982

NE OF SPRAGUE

Lot 6, Block 22, Ooregon Pines

NO BID




20795

SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-015A0—05200-000-00

KEY 283268
i LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE
8 | rGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 32, Block 17, Oregon Pines B
: ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511—02230-03700-000—00

KEY 286639
LOCATION NE OF BEATTY
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 11, Block 2, oregon Pines
ACREAGE
% SALE PRICE
gl  SoLD TO NO BID
" STREET

cITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3512-00100-00200-000~00

KEY 288888

LOCATION NORTH OF BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Beginning at the NW corner of said Section 1, Township 35«Sout
ACREAGE 20.07

SALE PRICE $13,900.00

SOLD TO JELD-WEN, INC.

STREET P.O. BOX 5079

CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

TAX IOT NUMBER R3610—014BB—00200-000-00 =

KEY 332223
i LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER
5 LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 16 - 19 inclusive, Block 4, Plat of Sprague River, Oregon
; ACREAGE
> SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3610—014BB—07000—000—00

KEY 332900
LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, Block 11, plat of Sprague River, Oregon.
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
= SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R3610-014BB-07100-000-00

KEY 332919

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 8 & 9, Block 11, Plat of Sprague River, Oregon.
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO' NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-002C0-02900-000-00

KEY 339823

LOCATION NE OF SPRAUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 32, Block 66, Fifth Addition to Nimrod River Park
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO HO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3611-002C0-04000-000-00
339896
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 50, Block 31, Fifth Addition to Nimrod River Park
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

R3611-003C0-00300-000-00
341810
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 74, Block 70, Fifth Addition to Nimrod River Park
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-003C0-00400-000~-00

KEY 341570

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 75, Block 70, Fifth Addition to Nimrod River Park
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SoiDh TO NO BID

STREET

CIiTY, STATE ZIP




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIFTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX IOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

<0797

R3611-004D0-03400-000-00

343239

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 52, Fourth Addition to Nimrod River Park
4.78

NO BID

R3611~005C0~00500-000-00
343587

The N1/2NE1/4NW1/4SW1/4 Section 5, Township 36 South, Range 11
5.00

NO BID

R3611-006A0-00100~000-00

335765

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Government Lots 1 & 2 and the S1/2NE1/4 of Section 6, Township
44.35

NO BID

R3611-007B0-05600-000-00
346003

Lot 9, Block 3, First Addition to Nimrod River Park
1.51

NO BID

R3611~008A0-02400-000-00

346557

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 17, Block 48, Fourth Addition to Nimrod River Park
1.52

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX IOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 21IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

" LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3614~00000-00200-000-00

760331

NORTH THE BLY

The NE1/4SW1/4 of Section 1, Township 36 South, Range 14 Eastc«
40.00

$19,000.00

JELD-WEN, INC.

P.O. BOX 5079

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3614-034DC-00800-000-00

365303

BLY

That portion of Tract I of North Bly, Klamath County, Oregon, «

NO BID

R3711-015C0~01700-000-00

385461

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 34, Block 10, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
2.23

NO BID

R3711-017A0-01600-000~00

387058

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 19, Block 5, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit«
2.02

NO BID

R3711-020D0-01300~000-00

388075

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 29, Block 15, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
2.29

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-021A0-01800-000-00
KEY 388645

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 39, Block 12, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 15.22

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-021B0-00200-000-~00

KEY 388609

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The E1/2 of Lot 36, Block 12, Klamath Falls Forest Estates«Hig
ACREAGE 7.48

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-033D0-00400-000-00

KEY 400649

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 63, Klamath Falls Forest Estate Highway 66 Unit«P
ACREAGE 9.50

SALE PRICE . $8,480.00
SOLD TO ANNE P. SUNDAY
STREET 1115 EAST MAIN STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-033D0-01700-000-00

KEY 400738

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 62, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit«
ACREAGE 2.26

SALE PRICE $4,000.00
SOLD TO BILL MIDDLEBROOKS
STREET P.O. BOX 95

CITY, STATE ZIP MERRILL, OR 97633

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-033D0-02100-000-00

KEY 400818

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Iot 11, Block 62, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.85

SALE PRICE $2,470.00
SOLD TO GARY S. LONG
STREET 21065 NW KAY ROAD

CITY, STATE ZIP HILLSBORO, OR 97124



SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SCLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3711-033D0-02200-000-00

400836

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 12, Block 62, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
2.99
$2,470.00

GARY S. LONG

21065 NW KAY ROAD

HILLSBORO, OR 97124

R3711-034C0~00900~000-00

401149

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 5, Block 64, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit«

NO BID

R3711~036A0-02600-000~00

401997

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 41, Block 108, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Uni
2.32
$2,290.00

GARY S. LONG

21065 NW KAY ROAD

HILLSBORO, OR 97124

R3711-036A0-02700~000-00

402004

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 42, Block 108, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Uni
2.18
$2,290.00

GARY S. LONG

21065 NW KAY ROAD

HILLSBORO, OR 97124

R3711-036A0-04600~000-00

402601

BLY MTN. CUT-~OFF

Lot 31, Block 111, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Uni
2.29
$4,000.00

GARY S. LONG

21065 NW KAY ROAD

HILLSBORO, OR 97124




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION

B
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD To

STREET

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD To

STREET

CITY, STATE z1p

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LocaTIon

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD To

STREET

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD ToO

STREET

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

SALE PRICE
SOLD ToO

STREET
CITY, STATE zZIp

[r—

R3711~O36A0-04700-000-00
402610

GARY S. LONG
21065 NW KAY ROAD
HILLSBORO, OR 97124

R3711-036C0-01400-000-00
403156
BLY MTN. CUT~-OFF

Lot 18, Block 112, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 uni
2.43

R3711-03GCO-01500-000-00

403147

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 19, Block 112, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 uUni
43

R3809-007CO-02800-000-00

429575

N. orF KLAMATH FALLS

A parcel of land located in the SE1/4SW1/4 of Section 7, «Towns
1

R3809-0188C-02700-000-00
431991



SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET )

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

soLb TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CcITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3809—020DD-00100—000—00

172510

KLAMATH FALLS

A portion of Lot 1, Block 5, Mountain View Addition

NO BID

R3809-029AA—08200-000—00

187149

KILAMATH FALLS

Lot 1, Block 21, Hillside Addition to Kilamath Falls

NO BiD

R3809“029AD-05400-000—00

KLAMATH FALLS
Lot 7, Bleck 19 1/2, Hot Springs Addition

NO BID

R3809-029CD-08100-000—00

367418

KLAMATH FALLS

1ot 1, Block 2, First Addition to the city of Klamath

NO BID
R3809—029CD—11900—000—00
369014

KLAMATH FALLS
fots 9 & 10, Block 32, First Addition to the city of Klamath«F

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD To

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX ILOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

<0803

R3809-029CD-12200-000-00

369032

KLAMATH FALLS

All of Block 33, First Addition to the City of Klamath Falls

NO BID

R3809-032BA-08500~000-00

409980

KLAMATH FALLS

Lot 1, Block 11, First Addition to the City of Klamath Falls

NO BID

R3809~032BA-09900~-000-00

410479

KLAMATH FALLS

Lots 1 & 2, Block 28, First Addition to the City of Klamath«Fa

NO BID

R3809-036CD-00100-000-00

453093

KLAMATH FALLS

Lot 11, Block 7, Tract 1003 (Third Addition teo Moyina)

NO BID

R3811-001D0-02000-000-00

457883

BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

Lot 1, Block 131, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
2.22

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-003CO—01500—000—00

KEY 459266

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION 1ot 5, Block 67, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit«
ACREAGE 1.90 i

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811—01100—00900-000—00

KEY 466757

LOCATION BLY MTN. CUT-OFF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S1/2 of Lot 7, Block 119, Klamath Falls Forest Estates«Hig
ACREAGE 12.07

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3815—00000-00400—000-00
KEY 118492

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The W1/2NW1l/4 Section 3, Township 38 south, Range 15 East of«t
ACREAGE 82.36

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3909-005CD~ -

KEY

LOCATION RIVERSIDE ADDITION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION A parcel of land located in Section 5, Townshp 39 South, Range
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

cITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3909-007CB-02700-000-00
KEY 538001

LOCATION STEWART LENNOX

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 19, Block 8, stewart
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH : ss.

Filed for record at request of __Klamath County Sher iff's Office the 7th day

of August AD,19_95 at__ 2:41 o'clock P__ M., and duly recorded in Vol. ___M95 S
of Deeds on Page 2Q788

o Bernethy clséh. ounty Clerk
FEE  No Fee B;{‘/,z 27 . & ,7['{.%‘ 29




