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Shen\ft’s Return of,Sale

The parcels listed in the attached
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<

The total revenue for the ﬁi\%

After Recording Return:
Linda Seater Property Sales

“To Protect and To Serve The Community”




/“SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICB

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

3y

STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL: DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R2310-036B0-00200-000-00

139905

SE OF LA PINE

Lot 20, Block 1, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates, KlamathvCoun
1.01
$4, 000.00

MATTHEW A. & JUDITH THORBURN

5555 N. DETROIT

PORTLAND, OR 97217

R2310-036C0-05100-000-00

141475

SE OF LA PINE

Lot 6, Block 8, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Bstates, KlamathvCount
1.00 :

§3,600,00
1AL L M) e,

R2310-036D0-02000-000-00

141821

SE OF LA PINE

Lot 4, Block 10, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates, KlamathvCoun
1.00
$3,800.00

MICHAEL S. CAULFIELD

10117 SE SUNNYSIDE ROAD #F1163

CLACKAMAS, OR . 97015

R2310-036D0-04100-000-00

14148~

SE OF LA PINR

Lot S, Block 8, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates, KlamathvVCount
1.00 .
$2,150.00

BONNIE ARNOLD & HELEN DANKBR

HC 61 BOX 1264

LA PINEB, OR 97739

R3107-001D0-04700-000-00
81208
SAND CREEK

Lot 8, Block 10, Tract No. 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow, KlamathyCoun
1.00 ~

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3308-01300-00900-000-00
90751

APPLEGATE BUTTE

The SE1/4 SW1/4 SE1/4 of Section 13, Township 33 South, Range
10.00

$15,000.00

CROWN PACIFIC LIMITED PRT.

805 ‘SW INDUSTRIAL WAY

BEND, OR 97702

R3313-03100-02800-000-00
181671
N. OF BLY

The S1/2 EB1/2 of Lot 9, Block 2, Klamath Falls Forest Estatesy
9.86 ~ ,

NO BID

R3313-03100-02900-000-00
181724
N. OF BLY

The North 415 feet of the East 1035 feet of Lot 10, Block 2,VK
9.86

NO BID

R3313-03300-03600-000-00
182723
N. OF BLY

The South 207.50 feet and the Wly 1020' of the N2W2 of Lot 13,
4.93

NO BID

R3407-022CC-00500-000-00

193481

CHILOQUIN _

Lot 5, Block 6, Rainbow Park on the Williamson, Klamath County
1.82
$4,970.00

MATTHEW A. & JUDITH THORBURN

5555 N. DETROIT

PORTLAND, OR 97217




TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 21p

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2Z1P

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

‘ R3407 O34DA-03200 000~ 00

201276
CHILOQUIN ,
Lots 1 & 2, Block 1, First Addition To Chiloquin, KlamathvCoun

NO BID

R3407-034DR-03700-000-00

201285

CHILOQUIN

Lots 1 & 2, Block 4, Chiloquin Heights, Klamath County, Oregon

NO BID

R3407-034DB-04600-000-00

201864

CHILOQUIN

Lots 9 & 10, Block 4, Second Addition To Chiloquin, Oregon, vkl

NO BID

R3507- 00000 00400-000-00
219392
S. OF CHILOQUIN

The S1/2 SW1/4 SW1/4 of Section 22, Township 35 South, Range 7
20.00

NO BID

R3507-003AB-05100-000-00

221646

CHILOQUIN

Lots 11 & 12, Block 8, South Chiloquin, Oregon, Klamath County

NO BID




D.AT.AUCTION

R3507-017CB-05500-000-00
237050 ,'
AGENCY LAKE:
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 45, Block 29, Tract 1113 - Oregon Shores - Unit 2, Klamath
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507-018AA-06000-000-00

KEY 241759

LOCATION AGENCY LAKE

LEGAT, DESCRIPTION Lot 18, Block 42, Tract 1184 - Oregon Shores - Unit 2 - 1stvad
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STRERET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507-018AB-00200-000-00

KBY 239414

LOCATION AGENCY LAKE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, Block 45, Tract 1184 - Oregon Shores - Unit 2 - 1stvad
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE Z1P

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-014D0-01000-000-00

KEY 258946

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block 17, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County, YOreg
ACREAGE .8.27

SALE PRICE $3,750.00

SOLD TO JOHN E. & THERESA M. MANDER

STREET P. 0. BOX 122

CITY, STATE ZIP SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

R3510-014D0-01800-000-00
258544
SPRAGUE RIVER
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 44, Block 16, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County,Jbreg
ACREAGE 2.41
SALE PRICE )
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET .
CITY, STATE Z2IP




SOLD /AT .AUCTIO

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE :
SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

STk | <4131
R3510-015B0-03200-000-00
259892 ,
SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 39, Block 4, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County, YOrego
3.75
$900.00
RICHARD E. & STEVE WERDEMAN
P.0. BOX 321
SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

R3510-015C0-02900-000-00
260728
SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 26, Block 6, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County,Jbrego
3.08
$950.00
N. R. L. L., INC.
P.O. BOX 2209 :
NEWPORT BBACH, CA 92659-1509

R3510-015D0-03800-000-00
261077
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 7, Block 11, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County, YOrego
2.38

NO BID

R3510-01900-00400-000-00
261219
SPRAGUE RIVER

The SW1/4 NE1/4 NW1/4; W1/2 SE1/4 NE1/4 NW1/4 of Section 19, VT
15.00

NO BID

R3510-022A0-01500-000-00
262236
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 13, Block 12, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County, YOreg
2.38 .

NO BID '




LOCATION .

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE Z1IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZI1P

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

24132

R3510-022C0-03900-000~00
263761

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 15, Block 30, Pirst Addition To Klamath Forest Estates, VK1
2.38

$8,950.00

MICHAEL BENJAMINS

4015 CLINTON

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

R3510-023B0-01200-000-00
264289
SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 22, Block ‘15, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County,Jbreg
2.44
$950.00
N. R. L. L., INC.
P.O. BCX 2209 .
NEWPORT BEACH, CA 92659-1509

R3510-023C0-04200-000-00
266189
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 16, Block 31, First Addition To Klamath Porest Estates, VKl
2.95

NO BID

R3510-023D0-03000-000-00
265929
SPRAGURE RIVER

Lot 44, Block 26, First Addition To Klamath Forest Estates, VKl
2.37

NO BID

R3510-023D0-04500-000-00
266125
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 10, Block 31, First Addition To Klamath Forest Bstates, VK1
2.37 '

NO BID




TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

~ SALE PRICRE

SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3510-026B0-02500-000-00
9

<4133

26717
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 39, Block 32, First Addition To Klamath Forest Estates, v¥K1
2.37 ‘

NO BID

R3510-027D0-01700-000-00
270316
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 34, Block 42, Pirst Addition To Klamath Forest Estates, vK1
2.50

NO BID

R3510-028A0-02700-000-00
271869
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 3, Block 35, First Addition To Klamath Forest Estates,Kla
2.37

NO BID

R3510-034A0-04900-000-00
273215
SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 1, Block 2, Juniper Acres, Klamath County, Oregon.
4.99
$3,000.00
TROY R. & OUIDA M. CUNDIFF
24225 SPRAGUE RIVER ROAD
SPRAGUR RIVER, OR 97639

R3510-034D0-01000-000-00
273368
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 4, Juniper Acres, Klamath County, Oregon.
5.09

NO BID




LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3510-035A0-00100-000-00

274081

SPRAGUE RIVER :

Lot 6, Block 49, First Addition To Klamath Forest Bstates, YKla
3.61 '
$2,200.00

ELLEN SUING

P.0O. BOX 302

SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

R3510-035B0-03900-000-00
273901
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 9, Block 2, Juniper Acres, Klamath County, Oregon.
4.78

NO BID

R3510-035B0-04000-000-00

273910

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 10, Block 2, Juniper Acres, Klamath County, Oregon.
4.39 v

NO BID

R3510-035C0-00400~-000-00
274009
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 16, Block 2, Juniper Acres, Klamath County, Oregon.
3.74 :

NO BID

R3511-00000-02000-000-00
275605
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

The SE1/4 of Section 20, Township 35 South, Range 11 East ofvt
60.00 : ’

NO BID




TAX LOT NUMBER R3511- 00000 02600 000-00

KEY 275614 :

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The W1/2NW1/4NW1/4 of Section 21, Township 35 South, Range 11V
ACREAGE 20.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-009D0-04300-000-00

KEY 276640 ,

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block 8, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.58

NO BID
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-010C0-05900-000-00
KEY 276882
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6, Block 13, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.57

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATR Z1P

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-010C0-061.00-000-00

KEY 276864

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER ’

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 13, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.53

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-010C0-06200-000-00
KEY 276855
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 9, Block: 13, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.57 o .
SALE PRICE v
¥ SOLD TO NO BID
. CITY, STATE ZIP




'SOLD.AT.AU

<136

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511~-010C0-07500-000-00

KEY 277462

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 15, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.54

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZzZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011C0-01900-000-00
KEY 277925
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL, DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 27, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.51

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011C0-02000-000-00

KEY 277934

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Block 27, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.

1.54

NO BID

R3511-011C0-02500-000-00
KEY 277998
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER ,
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 26, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.59
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011C0-06700-000-00

KBY 278425

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER :

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 34, Block 30, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.62

SALE PRICE :
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET :
CITY, STATE ZIP -




' SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011D0-00500-000-00
KEY 278498 - :
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12, Block 29, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.52

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATER ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011D0-01600-000-00

KEY 278979

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 35, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.54

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011D0-03400-000-00

KEY 280449

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 22, Block 47, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregonm.
ACREAGE 1.60

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011D0-04000-000~-00

KEY 278853

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6, Block 34, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.50

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET '

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-011D0-05000-000-00

KRY 278782

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 13, Block 33, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.50

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CI1TY, STATE ZIP



TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE' PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zZIp

24135

R3511-011D0-05100-000-00

278808 : )

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 14, Block 33, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

NO BID

R3511-011D0-05200-000-00
278835
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 15, Block 33, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50
$600.00
N. R. L. L., INC.
P.O. BOX 2209
NEWPORT BEACH, Cca 92659-1509

R3511-011D0-05300-000-00

278826

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 1, Block 33, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

N. R. L. L., INC.
P.O. BOX 2209
NEWPORT BEACH, CA 92659-1509

R3511-013B0-00400-000-00

279870

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 3, Block 47, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.57 ‘

NO BID

R3511-013BO—06100—000-00
280092
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 9, Block 41, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.53

NO BID




SOLD'. AT . AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

~ KEY

LOCATION

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREBAGE

SALE PRICE

“SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3511 013BO 06200 000-00
280083
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 8, Block 41, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.53

NO BID

R3511-013B0-07500-000-00
280216
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 11, Block 40, Oregon Plnes, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.55

NO BID

R3511-013B0-07600-000-00
280190
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 44, Oregon Plnes, Kiamath County, Oregon.
1.52

NO BID

R3511-014A0-00100-000-00

280430

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER ‘

Lot 21, Block 47, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.57 ‘

NO BID

R3511-014B0-01100-000-00
281509 .
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 5, Block 30, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1,50

NO BID




TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

- LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

. CITY, STATE ZIP

R3511-014B0- 01200 000-00
281518
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 6, Block 30, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.52

NO BID

R3511-014B0- 02000-000-00
281821
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 6, Block 25, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.51

NO BID

R3511-014B0-02400-000-00
281563
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 13, Block 24, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

NO BID

R3511-014B0-02500-000-00
281572
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 14, Block 24, Oregon Plnes, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50 '

NO BID

k3511-014C0- 08000 000-00
282982 ’
NE OF SPRAGUB

Lot 6, Block 22, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.60

NO BID




' TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGR
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL. DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

- LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

'LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE |

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

~ STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3511 015A0- 01000 ~000- 00

283785
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 60, Block 18, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.73 ' ) :

NO BID

R3511-015A0-05200-000-00
283268
NE OF SPRAGUE

Lot 32, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.60 ‘ ’

NO BID

R3511- 015A0 -05900-000-00
283491
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 39, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.73

NO BID

R3511- 015A0 -06100- 000 00
283730
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 41, Block 17, Oregon Plnes, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.74

NO BID

R3511-015A0- 06700 000 00
283678
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 47, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.52 L T

NO BID




LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KBY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

R3511-015A0-06800-000-00

283641 -

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 1, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

NO BID

R3511-015A0-06900-000-00

283650

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.53

NO BID

R3511-015B0-00400-000-00
284249
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 35, Block 14, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.69 ' ’

NO BID

R3511-015B0-01500-000-00

284481 .

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 10, Block 16, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.53 . ' :

NO BID

R3511-015B0-01700-000-00

284515

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lotse,‘Blockrls, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.64 s

NO BID




TAX' LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE: PRICE

SOLD TO

~ STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

24143

R3511 01580 03700 000 00
284258
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 81, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.51

NO BID

R3511-015B0-07100-000-00
284392
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 22, Block 6, Oregon Pineg, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

NO BID

R3511-015C0-00200-000-00
284917
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 20, Block 5, Oregon Plnes, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.65

NO BID

R3511-015C0-01300-000-00
285033
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 9, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.61

NO BID

R3511-015C0-01900-000-00
284882
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 3, Block 5, Oregon Pine, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.60

NO BID




KEY
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
“ACREAGE--

" SALE PRICE

SOLD TO
. STREET
' CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGR

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LREGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

. SALE PRICE
- SOLD TO

' " STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

24144

R3511-015C0-02600-000-00
284855
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 3, Block 6, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.54

NO BID

R3511-015D0-00200-000-00
285756 :
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 13, Block 19, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.57

NO BID

R3511-015D0-00700-000-00
285729
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 44, Block 18, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

NO BID

R3511-015D0-00800-000-00
285701
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 45, Block 18, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.69 Co . .

NO BID

R3511-015D0-02400-000-00

285550

NE OF SPRAGUE .RIVER

Lot 45, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.63. ) S )

NO BID




LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

. SOLD TO

" STREET

CITY, STATE Z1p

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

- CITY, STATE zIp

24145

R3511-015D0-02500-000-00
285541 -
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 44, Block s, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.51 .

NO BID

R3511-015D0—02900-000-00
285505 ’
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 40, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50

NO BID

R3511-015D0-03100?000-00
285471
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 38, Block 5, Oregon[Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.57

NO BID

R3511—015D0-05200-000-00
285355
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 15, Block 4, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.5

NO BID

R3511—016A0-01700-000-00
286238
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 31, Block 7, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.50




<414¢

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511- 016A0 02000 -000-00
KEY 286265

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Block 7, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.54

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-016A0-02100-000-00

KEY 286050

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 7, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.57

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STRERT

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-016A0- 05500 000-00

KEY 286309

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 23, Block 6, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.54

SALE PRICR

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-01700-00400-~ 000 00

KEY 275295

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The NE1/4SW1/4 of Section 17, Township 35 South, Range 11vEast
ACREAGE 39.19

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-01700-~01600-000-00

KEY 275348

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The W1/2SW1/4SW1/4 of Section 17, Township 35 South, Range 11V
ACREAGE 19.50

SALE PRICE $2,500.00

SOLD TO OLGA B. JOHNSON

STREET P.O. BOX 312

CITY, STATE ZIP MALIN, OR 97632




| TAX LOT NUMBER  R3511-01800 1000~ ooo 00

KEY 286540 '

LOCATION ' NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The N2S2S2NW4SE4 in Sectlon 18, Township 35 South, Range 11vRa
ACREAGE 5.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-022B0-00900~000~00

KEY 286997

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Block 4, Oregon Plnes, ‘Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.54

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3511-022B0-01200-000-00

286960

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 1, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.55
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-02900- 00800 000-00

KEY 287683 -

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The Wly 208.71' of the Sly 208.71' of the SW4ANW4NW4 in Section
ACREAGE 1.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-03100- 00100-000-00

KEY 288110

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The NE4NE4 in Section 31, Townshlp 35 South, Range 11 East ofV
ACREAGE 40.00- . ,

SALE PRICE $5, 250 00 : ' '

SOLD TO JERRY A. & JONNA C. ENMAN

STREET 15343 CHEYNE ROAD - '

CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603




' TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD' TO
- STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD. TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

'R3511 03500 01900 000 00

288771
NW OF BEATTY

The W2NE4SE4SW4 of Section 35, Township 35 South, Range 11 Ras
5.00-

NO BID

R3512-00000-03500-000-00
289388
NW OF BEATTY

The SE4SW4 in Section 19, Township 35 South, Range 12 East ofy
40.00

NO BID

R3512-00500-00800-000-00
290697
NW OF BEATTY

The S2N2SW4 in Section 5, Township 35 South, Range 12 Rast ofy
20.00

NO BID

R3512-00600-01600-000-00
290900
NW OF BEATTY

The SE4NB4SE4 in Section 6, Township 35 South, Range 12 Bast o
10.00
$1,050.00
N. R. L. L., INC.
P.0. BOX 2209
NEWPORT BEACH, CA 92659-1509

R3512-00700-01400-000-00
290982
NW OF BEATTY

The E2N2N2SWANE4 of Section 7, Township 35 South, Range 12 Eas
5.00 )

NO BID




- . STREET

TAX: LOT NUMBER R3512- 00700 01600 000-00
KEY 291080
LOCATION NW OF BEATTY
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2N2N2SE4NE4 of Section 7, Township 35 South, Range 12 Eas
ACREAGE 5.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3512-00800-00500-000-00

KEY 291295

LOCATION NW OF BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2N2NW4SW4ANW4 lying West of Sycan River in Section 8, VTown
ACREAGE 1.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3512-01700-02200-000-00

KEY . 292098

LOCATION NW OF BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2SWANWASW4; N2NW4SWASW4 in Section 17, Township 35 South,
ACREAGE 10.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD: TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3512-02SOO—01100-000-00
KEY 292739
LOCATION N OF BFATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION That portlon Of the SW4NE4 & the W2NW4SE4 lying N of thevcente
ACREAGE 37.00 ,

SALE PRICE $8,200.00
SOLD TO RALPH BEMISDARFER
STREET P.O. BOX 11

CITY, STATE 2IP BEATTY, OR 97621

TAX LOT NUMBER R3512-03000-00700-000-00
KEY 289976
LOCATION NW OF BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The E2B2SW4; W 165' of the SE4 in Section 30, Township 35VSout
ACREAGE 40.00 _ _

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID

CITY, STATE ZIP




. SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

sQoLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

-CITY, STATE ZIP

24150

R3512-035D0-01900-000-00 . .
294568 o .

N OF BEATTY

Lot 28, Block 8, Sprague River Valley Acres, Klamath County, YO
1.83 : o
$1,650.00

JOSEPHINE HECK

P.O. BOX 324

BEATTY, OR 97621

R3513-03200-01900-000-00

296619

NE OF BEATTY

The SWASWASE4 in Section 32, Township 35 South, Range 13 RastV
10.00

NO BID

R3513-033B0-04300-000-00
297459 ' .
NE OF BEATTY

Lot 4, Block 17, Tract No. 1010 First Addition To FergusonvMou
1.73

NO BID

R3513-033C0-05000-000-00
298074
NE OF BEATTY

Lot 24, Block 23, Tract No. 1010 First Addition To PergusonvMo
1.74

NO BID

R3513-033D0-00100-000-00

298546 .

NE OF BEATTY -

Lot 18, Block 19, Tract No. 1010 First Addition To FergusonvMo
3.58

NO BID




© R3513-033D0-02000-000-00

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACRRAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

‘SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

298350 "
NE OF BEATTY

Lot 7, Block 19, Tract No. 1010 First Addition To FergusonvyMou
1.41

NO BID

R3513-033D0-05000-000-00
298868
NE OF BEATTY

Lot 5, Block 22, Tract No. 1010 First Addition To FergusonvMou
1.51

NO BID

R3513-033D0-07000-000-00
299037 ‘
NE OF BEATTY

Lot 13, Block 21, Tract No. 1010 First Addition To FergusonvMo

2.02
NO BID

R3606-003AA-01900-000-00

308278

ROCKY POINT

Lot 1, Block 8, Arrowhead village, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID

R3606-003AB-01900~-000-00

308973

ROCKY POINT

Lot 39, Harriman Park, Klamath County, Oregon.

$4,700.00

JAY A. & NANCY K. BOCCHI
19164 SW CHESAPEAKE DRIVE
TUALATIN, OR 97062




KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

»2

R3606-010CA-00800-000-00 -
314831 :
ROCKY POINT

Beginning at the NE corner of Lot 18, Frontier Tracts; thence

$2,000.00
C. & MYRTLE E. CLAYTON
24720 RUNNELS LANE
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3606-010CA-06100-000-00
314653
ROCKY POINT

The W 100' of Lot 41, Frontier Tracts, Klamath County, Oregon

$1,200.00
H. MATTHEWS & R. MATTHEWS
642 PACIFIC TERRACE
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3606—010CA-06200-000-00

314680

ROCKY POINT

The W 100' of Lot 42, Frontier Tracts, Klamath County, Oregon.

$1,395.00
H. MATTHEWS & R. MATTHEWS
642 PACIFIC TERRACE
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3606-014CC—05900-000-00

316795

ROCKY POINT

Lot 7, Block 8, Fox Hollow, Klamath County, Oregon.

$1,575.00
LARUE SIENS & NANCY PIERSON
22625 ELK STREET

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3606-014CD-02700-000—00

317598

ROCKY POINT '

Lot 82, Odessa Summer Home Sites, Klamath County, Oregon.

$2,325.00
GERALD D & ELIZABETH ORNDOFF
1883 CUNNINGHAM
MEDFORD, OR' 97501




TAX: LOT NUMBER '
KEY ‘
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3606-017D0-00300-000-00
320307 -~
ODESSA

Lot 58, Block 6, Tract No. 1017 Mountain Lakes Homesites, vKlam
1.01 :

NO BID

R3606-017D0-01600-000-00

320281

ODESSA

Lot 45, Block 6, Tract No. 1017 Mountain Lakes Homesites, yKlam
2.08
$7,000.00

BILL W. & JANET M. BARNES

19101 60TH STREET

PLATTSMOUTH, NE 68048

R3610-001C0-01000-000-00
325847
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 62, Block 32, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.63

NO BID

R3610-001C0-01300-000-00

325810

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 59, Block 32, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.57

NO BID

R3610-001C0-05200-000-00
326258
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 1, Block 36, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
1.72

NO BID




KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DBSCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2ZIP

R3610- 001C0 06100 000-00
326150
NE OF SPRAGUB RIVER

Lot 70, Block 31, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.54 .

NO BID

R3610-001C0-06200-000-00
326169
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 71, Block 31, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.54

NO BID

R3610- 001C0 -06900-000-00
32624
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 75, Block 31, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
2.25 :

NO BID

R3610-001D0-00500-000-00 .
326338
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 6, Block 44, Pourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
2.96

NO BID

R3610-002D0-01000-000-00
327266
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 39, Block 32, Foutth‘Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.80 L

NO BID




KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 21IP

R3610- 012C0 01100 000 00
330715
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 28, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
1.52

$3,500.00
ALMORN A. & HELEN BRACKETT
P.0. BOX 345

SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

R3610-012C0-01300-000-00
815657
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

That portion of Government Lots 20 and 21 lying South of Fourt
5.42
$3,800.00

ALMORN A. & HELEN BRACKETT

P.0. BOX 345

SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

R3610 014AC-00300- 000 00

331153

SPRAGUE RIVER

A portion of Government Lot 10 in Section 14, Township 36vSout

NO BID

R3610-014BA-~02600-000-00
331554
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 6 & 7, Block 5, First Addition To Sprague River, Klamathy

NO BID

R3610-014BA-03200-000-00
331616
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 19 & 20, Block 5, First Addition To Sprague River, Klamat

NO BID




KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3610-011A0-05900-000-00
328229
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 35, Block 31, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.56

NO BID

R3610-012A0-01400-000-00

328862

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 76, Block 31, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.90
$1,000.00

FRANK A. & DIANE A. CORNELIUS

P.0. BOX 811

COLTON, CA 92324

R3610-012A0-05300-000-00
329460
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 43, Block 27, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.52

NO BID

R3610-012A0-06500-000-00
329406
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 31, Block 27, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.99

NO BID

R3610-012A0-07300-000-00
329139
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 23, Block 27, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
1.51

NO BID




- 'TAX LOT NUMBER R3610-014BA-07500-000-00
- KBY 332054 - o -

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12, Block 10, First Addition To Sprague River, KlamathvyCou

ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3610-014BA-08400-000-00

KEY 332143

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 12 - 15, Block 9, First Addition To Sprague River, Klamat
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3610-014BA-08800-000-00

KBY . 332152

LOCATION ’ SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 8 - 11, Block 9, First Addition To Sprague River, Klamath
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

ZSTRERET

LAAY, - STATE - Z2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3610-014BB~00400-000-00
KRY 332232 -

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 11 & 12, Block 4, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE .
SALE  PRICE -

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3610-014BB-01100-000-00

KEY 332321

LOCATION %, SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 9 - 14, Block 2, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE

" SALE PRICE $1,001.00

¢ SOLD TO : WILLIAM E. & CLARE HUDAK
STREET P.O. BOX 37 ‘

CITY, STATE ZIP BEATTY, OR 97621




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STRBET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KRY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

<4158

R3610- 01488-05600 000-00
332768
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 16 - 18, Block 12, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID

R3610-014BB-06100-000-00

332811

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 8 & 9, Block 12 Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID

R3610-014BB-06700-000-00

332875

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 14 & 15, Block 11, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

$275.00
ANTHONY J. STRONG
24990 MEADOW LANE
SPRAGUE RIVER, 97639

R3610-014BB-06800-000-00

332884

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 13, Block 11, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

$175.00
ANTHONY J. STRONG
24990 MEADOW LANE
SPRAGUE RIVER, 97639

R3610-014BB-08800-000-00
333080
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 22 & 23, Block 9, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID




-~ SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET '
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DBESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3610- 014BB 09000 -000- OO

24159

333106
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 17 - 20, Block 9, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID

R3610-014BC-00800-000-00
333222
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 4, Block 13, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID

R3610-014BC~-01100-000~00

333259

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lots 13 - 19, Block 14, Sprague River, Klamath County, Oregon.

NO BID

R3610-014BD-06900-000- 00

334374

SPRAGUE RIVER

Beginning at a point which is 1980' S and 2135' E of the WV/co

NO BID

R3610-014BD-09800~ 000 00
334668
SPRAGUE RIVER

A tract of land situated in Lot 14 in the SE4NW4 of Sec. 14, VT
.28

NO BID




- -SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DBESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

24160

R3611-002C0-02900-000-00
339823
NE OF SPRAUE RIVER

Lot 32, Block 66, Fifth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
1.57

NO BID

R3611-002C0-04000-000-00
339896
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 50, Block 70, Fifth Addition To Nimrod River Park, vKlamath
1.56 ‘

NO BID

R3611-003C0-00300-000-00
341810
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 74, Block 70, Fifth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
2.33

NO BID

R3611-003C0~00400-000-00
341570
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 75, Block 70, Fifth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
2.48

NO BID

R3611-004D0-03400-000-00
343239
NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 52, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamath
4.78 '

NO BID




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

24161

R3611-005C0-00500-000-00
KEY 343587 _
LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The N1/2NE1/4NW1/4SW1/4 Section 5, Township 36 South, Range 11
ACREAGE 5.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID
STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3612-001B0-04500-000-00

KEY 355118
LOCATION NE OF BEATTY
~ LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 27, Block 11, Sprague River Valley Acres, Klamath County, v
ACREAGE 1.52
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STRERT

CITY, STATE 21P

8 TAX LOT NUMBER R3612-001B0-06100-000-00

KEBY 355298

LOCATION NE OF BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 16, Block 13, Sprague River Valley Acre, Klamath County, Vo
ACREAGE 1.47

SALE PRICE

SOLD T0 NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3612-023BB-03700-000-00

KBY 357893

LOCATION BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 6 - 8, Block 8, Beatty, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE $18,300.00

SOLD TO CHUCK REED

STRERT P.0. BOX 55

CITY, STATE ZIP BEATTY, OR 97621

TAX LOT NUMBER R3613-006D0-03200-000-00

KEY 362217

LOCATION NE OF BEATTY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12, Block 12, Sprague River Valley Acres, Klamath County, ¥
ACREAGE 2.13

SALE PRICE $1,575.00

SOLD TO HAROLD E. & JEAN H. MCADOW

STREET BOX 305

CITY, STATE ZIP BEATTY, OR 97621




SOLD.AT.AUCTION = = . e B 24162 -

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-020D0-01400-000-00
KRY 388084
LOCATION BLY MTN.
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 30, Block 15, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
2.29
$2,000.00
REALVEST, INC.
HC 15 BOX 495 C
CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 8841

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-023D0-0J200-000-00
KBY 392079
LOCATION BLY MIN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 21, Block 87, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 1.84
SALE PRICE
DELETED 7/9/96

R3711-023D0-00800-000-00
KEY 392015
LOCATION BLY MTN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 15, Block 87, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29 » :
SALE PRICE $2,400.00
SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.
STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C
CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-027B0-00500-000-00

KEY 396510

LOCATION BLY MTIN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6, Block 19, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 UnityV
ACREAGE 2.27

SALE PRICE $3,000.00

SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.

STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C

CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

© TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-028A0-00900-000-00
KEY 398518
LOCATION BLY MIN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 11, Block 21, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29
SALE PRICE $1,775.00 .
SOLD TO REALVEST, INC. =
STRERT HC 15 BOX'495 C
CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

24163

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-033D0-02600-000-00

KEY 400863

LOCATION BLY MTN

LBGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 64, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unitv
ACREAGE 3.00

SALE PRICE $2,000.00

SOLD TO BILL MIDDLEBROOKS

STREET P.O. BOX 95

CITY, STATE ZIP MERRILL, OR 97633

R3711-034B0-00400-000-00
401096
BLY MIN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 33, Block 19, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 5.18
SALE PRICE $2,100.00
SOLD TO ALMORN A. & HELEN BRACKETT
STREET P.O. BOX 345
CITY, STATE ZIP SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-036A0-02500-000-00

KEY 401988

LOCATION BLY MTN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 40, Block 108, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Uni
ACREAGE 2.50

SALE PRICE $2,600.00

SOLD TO FRANK A. & DIANE A. CORNELIUS

STREET P.O. BOX 811 :

CITY, STATE ZIP COLTON, CA 92324

TAX LOT NUMBER R3809-006C0-00800~000-00

KEY 428488

LOCATION KFALLS

LEGAL DESCRIPTION All that portion of Lots 6 & 7, Block 2, Upper Lake GardenvAcr
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3809-007C0-02800-000-00

KEY 429575

LOCATION KFALLS

LEGAL DESCRIPTION A parcel of land located in the SE1/4SW1/4 of Section 7, /Towns
ACREAGE .41 _

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STRERT

CITY, STATE Z1p




- SOLD.AT.AUCTION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOoLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

CITY, STATE ZIP

24164

R3809-019DA-01200~-000-00

436111

KFALLS

A parcel of land situated in the NE1/4 SE1/4 of Section 19, VTo
1.00
$3,795.00

WILLIAM E. ADAMS

2545 CALIFORNIA AVE.

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3809-019DB-02900-000-00
436736
KFALLS

The N1/2 of Lot 10, Block 6, Klamath Lake Addition To The City

$1,750.00
CUOUHTEMOC AZAMAR
P.O0. BOX 905 .
TULELAKE, CA 96134

R3809-019DB-03000-000-00
436754
KFALLS

The S1/2 of Lot 10, Block 6, Klamath Lake Addition To The City

$8,775.00
RAY & LISA M. WEST
5911 HENLEY ROAD
KLAMATH FALL, OR 97603

R3809—020§C-02800-000-00
169506
KFALLS ’

Lot 14, Block 3, Resubdivision of a portion of McLoughlinvHeig

$22,000.00

LAUBENGAYER & WAYLAND'S
2301 MOUNTAIN VIEW BLVD
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3809-028AC-00100-000-00
441132
KFALLS

Lots 1 - 3, Block 35, Bast Klamath Falls, Klamath County, YOreg

$375.00
BILL W. & JANET M. BARNES
19101 60TH STREET
PLATTSMOUTH, NE 68048




TAX LOT’NUMBERW'
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
B

ACREAG!

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE. PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

1R3809 029AA—08200 000 00

187149
KFALLS
Lot 1, Block 21, Hillside Addition To Klamath Palls, KlamathvC

$1,100.00

FRANK & DIANE ROLLINS
P.O. BOX 918

KENO, OR 97627

R3809-029CA-00300-000-00
300383 :
KFALLS

The Sly 40' of Lot 2, Block 1, Fairview Add'n No. 2 To Klamath

$23,000.00 v
STANLRY BISHOP
P.O. BOX 1
MURPHY, OR 97533

R3809-029CD-08100-000-00

367418

KFALLS

Lot 1, Block 2, First Addition to the City of Klamath Falls, VK

NO BID

R3809-029CD-11900-000-00
369014
KFALLS

Lots 9 & 10, Block 32, Pirst Addition to the City of KlamathvF

NO BID

R3809-029CD-12100-000-00
368998
KFALLS

Lot 6, Block 32, First Addition To Klamath Falls, KlamathvCoun

NO BID




TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACRRAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX ILOT NUMBER
KEY '
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

STATE ZIp

24166

R3809-029CD-19000-000-00

368836 )

KFALLS _

Lot 6, Block 22, First Addition to Klamath Falls, KlamathvCoun

NO BID

R3809-030AB-02300-000-00
752634
KFALLS

Lot 8, Block 47, Supplementary Plat of Buena Vista Addition to

$650.00
ALEXANDER NGUYEN
P.O. BOX 81 .
MALIN, OR 97632

R3809-03100~00400-000-00

428371

KFALLS

The SWANE4; N2NW4SE4 in Section 31, Township 38 South, Range 9
60.00 - :

$18,000.00

OLGA B. JOHNSON

P.0. BOX 312

MALIN, OR 97632

R3809-031DD-00600-000-00
630561
KFALLS

Lots 1 & 2, Block 5, Westlake Park Addition To Klamath Falls,V

$575.00
HYLARIO VALLEJO
4227 ALTAMONT DRIVE
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

R3809-031DD-01000-000-00

630598

KPALLS |

Lot 3, Block 10, Westlake Park Addition to Klamath Falls, VKlam

$375.00
HYLARIO VALLEJO
4227 ALTAMONT DRIVE
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603




TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGR

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zIpP

20167

' R3809-032BA-06500-000-00

410594 '
KFALLS ' ,
Lots 8 & 9, Block 29, First Addition To Klamath Falls, Klamath

$2,200.00

" DENNIS & TERRY BENNETT

630 N. 5TH
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3809-033AA-00500-000-~00
482739
KFALLS

A parcel of land situated in the NE4NE4 of Section 33, Townshi
7

NO BID

R3805-033CA-05900-000-00

611822

KFALLS »

The S1/2 of Lots 29 & 30, Block 2, LESS the Sly 39' of thevInd

NO BID

R3809-034DA-00100-000-00
445245
KFALLS
Lot 8, Block 1, Tract No. 1031 Shadow Hills - I, KlamathvCount
.47 :
$7,750.00 :
D. BRUCE & SHIREEN M. MASL
417 LINCOLN STREET
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3809-034DA-00300-000-00
445227
KFALLS

Lot 6, Block 1, Tract No. 1031 Shadow Hills - I, KlamathvCount
25 ,

$6,500.00
ALICIA HUGGINS

417 LINCOLN STREET
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601




TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY .

LOCATION :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZID

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION ,
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIpP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZzIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

CITY, STATE zIP

R3809-034DA-00400-000-00
445218 | o
KFALLS '

Lot 5, Block 1, Tract No. 1031 shadow Hills - T, KlamathvCount
.33 o

NO BID

R3811-001A0-01400-000-00
456937
BLY MTN

The N1/2 of Lot 23, Block 129, Klamath Falls Forest Estatesvii
9.73

NO BID

R3811-002A0—01700-000-00
458472
BLY MTN

Lot 3, Block 116, Klamath Fallsg Forest BEstates Highway 66 Unit
1.99

$1,600.00
REALVEST, INC.
HC 15 BOX 495 ¢ =
HANOVER, NM 88041

R3811-003BO-03700-000-00

459220

BLY MTN '

Lot 1, Block 67, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unity
2.10 . : :

NO BID

R3811-00330-03800-000-00




R3811 004D0- 00500 000 00
460290
BLY MTN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 13, Block 34, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACRBAGE 2.30

SALE PRICE $3,000.00

SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.
STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C
CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-009C0~05200-000-00

KEY 472312

LOCATION BLY MTN.

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 32, Block 44, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29

SALE PRICE $1,750.00

SOLD TO REALVEST, IKC.

STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C

CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-010B0-01500-000-00
KEY 774905 -
LOCATION BLY MIN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Block 72, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unity
1.97

NO BID

R3811-010B0-03500-000-00
465339
BLY MIN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 69, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 UnitV
ACREAGE 2.11
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-015A0-00700-000-00

KEY 470065

LOCATION BLY MIN

L.EGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 37, Block 49, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29

SALE PRICE $1,895. 00

SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.

STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C

CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVBR, NM 88041




R3811 015A0- 01000 -000-00
KEY ' - , 470092
LOCATION BLY MIN '
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 40, Block 49, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29
SALE PRICE $3,350.00
SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.
STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C
CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-015A0-02500-000-00

KEY 469692

LOCATION BLY MIN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12, Block 49, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29

SALE PRICE $3,500.00

SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.

STREET HC 15 BOX 495 C

CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-015A0-02600-000-00

KEY 469709

LOCATION ) BLY MTN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 13, Block 49, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE 2.29

SALE PRICE. $3,220.00

SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.

STREET ' HC 15 BOX 495 C

CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-015B0-00900-000-00

KEY 469556
LOCATION BLY MTN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3; Block 48, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unitv
2.30 .
$2,500.00
REALVEST, INC.
HC 15 BOX 495 C
CITY, STATE ZIP HANOVER, NM = 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-015D0-00100-000-00

KRY 470056

LOCATION BLY MTN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 36, Block 49, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
- ACREAGE 2.29 :

SALE PRICE $2,250.00

SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.

STREET - HC 15 BOX 495 C .

CITY, STATE zIP HANOVER,  'NM. 88041




TAX LOT NUMBER
REY

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STRERT .
CITY, STATE Z1p

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-016B0-01100-000-00
N KEY 471821 : v
LOCATION BLY MTN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 30, Block 43, Klamath Falig Forest
ACREAGE 2,29 ’
SALE PRICE $1,800.00
SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.
STREET

CITY, STATE zIp

B
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE -

015D0-00200-000-0¢

470047
LOCATION BLY MTN-
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 35, Block 49, Klamath Falig Fores
ACREAGE 2.29 ‘
SALE PRICE $2,700.00 .
SOLD TO VEST, INC.
STRERT

HC 15 Box 495 ¢
HANOVER, NM 88041

R3811—616Ao-044oo-ooo-oo
472287

8
LOCATION BLY MIN ;
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 29,-Block 44, Klamath Falls Fores
ACREAGE 2.29 - ,
SALE PRICE $2,250.00
SOLD TO REALVEST, INC.
STREET

HC 15 BOX 495 c
HANOVER, NM 88041

R3811-016

0405100-000-00
471581 o -

2,29
$3,200.00
REALVEST, 1INC.

HC 15 BOX 495 ¢
HANOVER, NM 88047

HC 15 BOX 495 ¢
HANOVER, NM 88041

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-016B0-02800-000-00
. KEY 471153
- LOCATION BLY MTN
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 37, Block 42, Klamath Falig Fores
ACREAGE 1.65 , '
SALE PRICE $3,500.00
SOLD To ROBERT D. MEADE
STREET

CITY, STATE z1p

P.O. BOX 163 :
BONANZA, OR - 97623




LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 21P

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

2a172

R3811-016B0-05700-000-00

471144

BLY MIN

Lot 3, Block 42, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unity
2.63

$16,700.00

FRANK & DIANE ROLLINS

P.O. BOX 918

KENO, OR 97627

R3811-016C0-01100-000-00

470957

BLY MTN

Lot 19, Block 60, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
2.29

$2,200.00 ,

ROBERT W. SKELLHAM

6528 VALHALLA AVENUE

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97603

R3811-016D0-01200-000-00
468684
BLY MTN

Lot 15, Block 58, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
1.63

NO BID

R3811-016D0-04600-000-00

471386.

BLY MTN

Lot 5, Block 60, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 UnitV
2.29
$2,500.00 .

REALVEST, INC.

HC 15 BOX 495 C

HANOVER, NM 88041

R3911-010CA-05900-000-00
606482
BONANZA

Beginning at a point 36' E of Sandstone No. 2, representing th
13

NO BID




LOT NUMBER  R3911-010CA-07300-000-00

KEY 606623

LOCATION BONANZA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6, Block 20, First Addition to the Town of Bonanza, ALSO a
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE $1,470.00

SOLD TO RAY & LISA M. WEST

STREET 5911 HENLEY ROAD

CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALL; OR 97603

TAX LOT NUMBER R4008-017CA-02300-000-00

KEY 623739

LOCATION KENO

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 4, Klamth River Sportsman s Estates, KlamathvCoun
ACREAGE 1.51

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CiTY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R4107-01400~00300-000-00

KBY _ 78560

LOCATION SW OF WORDEN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The N2SE4NW4NE4 Section 14, Township 41 South, Range 7 East of
ACREAGE 5.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R4111-00300-01100-000-00

KEY 105512

LOCATION MERRILL/MALIN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION A parcel of land situated in the NW1/4 SW1/4 of Section 3, VTow
ACREAGE 10.00

SALE PRICE . $4,250.00

SOLD TO OLGA B. JOHNSON

STREET P.O. BOX 312

CITY, STATE Z1P MALIN, OR 97632

STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH:  ss.

Filed for record at request of Klamath County Sheriff's Office the __7th day
of ,August === AD,1996 __at_l:14 oclock PM., and duly recorded in Vol. M6 |
of Needs on Page 24126

Bernetha G letsch, Coung C:?rk
FEE No Fee By i&%ﬁs&z&g_




