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© 5OLD.AT.AUCTION

TAY LOT HUMBER
XEY

IHCATION -

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

BALE PRICE

821D TOC

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LECAL DESCRIPTION
ACREARGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

cITYy, STATE ZI¥P

TAX LOT WUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAT DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SATE PRICE

S0LD 10

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT HUMBER
¥EY

LOCATICN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE FRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIF

TAX LOT RUMBER
KEY

IOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STAYTE ZIF

P33

R2310-019B0=~00200~-000-00

¥E OF SILCHRIST
A tract of land situated in Govermment Lot 2, NWl/4 of Sectio
1.37
$2,800.00
THOMAS €. & CAROL E. 8COTT
¥ O BOX 5%4
AUMSVILIE, OR 87325

R2310~036B0-04500~-000=00

8 MI SE 1A PINE

Lot 83, Block 1, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates, Klamath«Coun
1.00
$4,500.00

BLMER J & LOUAWNE HOUSER

11345 SPLIT RAIL ROAD

LA PIHE, OR 97739-5%226

R2310~036B0-11000-000-~00

8 MI SE OF LA PIHE
Iot 17, Biock 2, Tract 1060 - Bun Forest Estates, Klamath« Co
1.00
£4,000.00
ROY ARNOLD & B. SENSEN
HC 61 BOY 1298
1A PINE, OR 97739

.

R2314~-03680-11100-~000-00

& MI SE OF LA PINE
Lot 16, Block 2. Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates, Klamath« Co
1.07
£3,200.00

JERRY L & BARBARA M KELLY

P O BOX 5866

EVERETT, WA 98206

R2310-036R0-01600~000-00

8 MI SE OF LA PINE

Lot 18, Biock 1, Tract 1060 = Sun Forest Estates, Klamath«Coun
1.0
£3,000.00

¥, R. & FRANC I. HOEFLING

91328 COBURG ROAD

FUGENE, OR 97408




SOLD.AT. AUCTION

TAY LOT NUMBER
TREY

IDCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRIC

SQLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZXP

TAX 10T NUMBER
EEY

LOCATION

LEEAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SaLE PRICE

S0LD 70

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT HUMBER
¥EY

LOCATEION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE Z2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

IRGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREXAGE

SALE PRICE

80LD IO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAE 10T NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SaLE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZXF

R2310-036D0~08100~006=00

8 ¥MI OF 1& PINE ,

Lot 1, Blosk 31, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates, KiamatheCoun
1.13
$3,500.00 :

THOMAS G. & CAROL E., SCOTT

* O BOX B34 .

AUMBSVILLE, OR 97325

R2409-030CC-00500~000-00

CRESCENT
A tract of land located in the SW1l/4 SWi/4 of Sec. 30, T 24 5,
1.312

DELETED

R2607~001A0~01300-000~00

85 OF BWY 538

ot 21, Bleck 8, Tract No. 1842 Two Rivers North, Klamath«Coun
1.065
$5,500.00

¥ D & DIANZ ¥ MARTIN

83448 TOIMAN ROAD

CRESWELL, OR 874286

R2607-001B0~-08500~000-00

S OF BWY 58

Lot 7, Block 15, Tract No. 1042 Two Rivers North, Klamath«Coun
1.06
44,800.00

F D & DIANE K MARTIN

83448 TOLHMAW ROAD

CRESWELL, OR 87426

R2607-00100=-06500-000~0C

8 OF HYY 58

Lot 3, Block 2, Tract NHo. 1068, Kiamath County, Oregon.
1.08
56,000.00

CIVIL INSPECTIONS, INC.

598 NW BASTMAN 4316

GRESHAN, OR 8708230




SOLD.AT. AUCTION

TAY 107 wuHnER RBlﬁ?“ﬁ12ﬂ9~§2§§Q“§G§wQG

RBY :

LOCATION SAND CRERE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Biock 21, Tract Wo, 1027 Ht. Scott Keadow, Klamath«Coun
ACREAGE i1.01

SALE PRICE $3,700.00

S0LL TO HICHAEL & THERFSA SRUBN

STREETY 1443 HORDEN AVENUR

CITY, STATE zIp KLAMATH FALIS, OR 97801

Ta¥X LOT HUMBER R3l%?~ﬁ12§0—64189~ﬁﬁﬁneﬁ

KBY

LOCATION SAND CREER

LECAYL DESCRIFTION Lot 4, Block 24, Tract No. 1027 Mt. Scott Meadow, Kianmath«Coun
ACREASE 1.00

SALE PRICE $3,700.00

80LD TS THOMAS &, & CAROL T, SCOTT

STREET P O BOY 594

CITY, STATE zip AUMSVILLE, OR 97325

TAY Y07 HUMBER RBIG?~GEQDQ~G§2@Q—GGG-GG

EBY

LONCATION SARD CREER

IEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 24, Traoct Heo. 1027 Mt. Score Headow, Klamath«Coun
ACREAGE 1.00

SALE PRICE £3,700.00

501D TO TONY BRKER

STREET 50875 BOE LOoop

CTITY, STATE 7ID LA PINE, OR 97735

TAX 107 HUHMBER R3313-02200~01300-000-00
BEY

LOCATION H¥ OF BLY

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The Hi/2 of the Wi/2 of
ACREAGE 8,79

EALE PRICE

SQLD O

STREREY

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAY 1O7 NUMBER REElB—GEéGﬁwGGGGQwGQG_GG
KRy : '
LocarIon Y OF BLY
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The South 530 faet of ia ; Klamath Falls Forest«Fs
ACREAGE i18.00
SALE = 82,7580, 00
' ROBERT ¥, WE?&ERN, 8R.
STRERT 7018 WIDGEON DRIVE
CITY, 8T ? BONANZA, OR 87823




 SOLD. AT.BUCTION

TAY LOT NUMBER
REY
LOCATION

LEGAL, DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

BALE PRICE

SOLL %0

STREET

CITY, STATE 2Ip

TAX LOT NUMBER
K5y
LOCATION

LEGATL, DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

SRLE PRICE

SOLD ‘To

STREET

CITY, STATE 7Ip

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
IO0CATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

SaALE PRICE

801D TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBRER
KEY
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO
STREET

CITY, STAYE 2IP

TAX 10T NUMBER
REY
LOCATION

LEGAL DERCRIPTION

ZLREAGE

SALE FRICE

SOLD o

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

R3313-02500-01600-000-00

H¥ OF BLY
The 8i/2 W1/2 of Iot 5, Block 15, Klamath Falls Forest Estates
16.310

WO BRID

R3407-034B0-02700~500~00

CHRILOGUIN
That portion of the NW1/4 BWi/4 of Section 34, Township 34«8ou
.52
$3,106.00
TRAIN MOUWTAIN, INC.
38541 & CHILOQUIN RD
CHILOQUIN, OR $7624

R3507-006AC~06500-000-00
AGENCY IAKE

Lot 4, Block 8, Tract 1083 - Oregon Shores, Xlamath County, «Or

HO BID

R3507-006AD=02900~000-00

AGENCY LAKE
Lot 13, Block 14, Tract 1053 - Oregon Shores, Klamath County, «

$3,000.00

J WERTZ & & CURTIS
DID NOT FOLLOW THROUGH WITH PURCHASE

R3807-006AD~08300~000~00

AGENCY LAKE

Lot 7, Bleck 18, Trachk 1053 - O hores, Klamath County, «0

NG BID




 SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX ILOT WUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

80LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

EALE PRICE

SCLD TO

STREEY

CITY, S5TATE ZIP

TAY LOT NUMBER
XeY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SQLD 1o

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
XEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

80LD TO

STREET

CiTY¥, STATE ZIP

TAX 107 Nbﬁﬁua
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SQLD TO

STREEY

QITY, STATE ZIP

R3507~018AB-028060=000-00

AGENCY LARE
Lot 24, Block 46, Tract 1184~Oregon Shores-Unit 2-ist Addition

$4,550.80
AL BORN
704 HWOODLAND AVENUE
WOODLAND PARK, €0 80863

R3507-018AB~04200~000~00

AGENCY 1axE®
Lot 5, Block 46, Tract 1184-Ovsgon Shores-Unit J-lst Addition,

CHIEGQJE?, QR 87634

R3507-0180D~01000-000-00

AGENCY LaKE
Lot 43, Block 24, Tract 1113-0regon Shores-Unit 2, Xlamath«Cou

RO BID

R35%9~914AG-00760—GOG—00

TWEEN CHIL & SPR RVR

Lot 2, Block 1, Lone Pine On The Sprague, Klamath County, «Oreg
1.08
$2,500,00

HICHAEL & CINDY M. SULLIVAN

1625 WIAED STREET

KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97803

R3508-014A0-00800-000-00C

TWEEN CHIL & SPR RVR

Lot 3, Block 1, Ione Pine On The Sprague, Klamath County,«Oreg
1.08
$1,750.00

HICHREL & CINDY M. SULLIVAM

1623 WXARD STREET

RLAMATH FALLS, OR 97803




SOLD.AT. AUCTION

TAYX 10T NUMBER B3I508-014A0~-01L400-000-00

KEY

LOCATION TWEEN CHIL & SPR RVR

T ECAL DESCRIPTION Lots 10 & 11, Block 1, Lome Pine On The Sprague, Klamath«Count
ACREAGE 2.28

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO HC BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-014B0--01000-000-00

RKBEY

IQCATION NY OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGCAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Biock 4, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County, Oregon
ACREAGE 3.25

SALE PRICE $1,002.00

SOLD TO JOSEPH H. & NOI SMITH

STREET 1443 WORDEN AVEHUE

CITY, STATE ZIP  KILAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-015C0=-01700-000-00

KEY

LOCATION HW OF SPRAGUE RIVER

1ECAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 5, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County, Oregon
ACREAGE 3.80

SALE PRICE $1,7060.00

801D TO B WERDEMAN & S WERDEMAHW

STREET P O BOX 321

CcITY, STATE ZIP SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

TAY 1LOYT NUMBER R3510-02340-04700-000-00

EY

IOCATION NW OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 39, Biock 14, Klamath Forest Estates, Klamath County,«0reg
ACREAGE 2.38

SALE PRICE $1,800.00

S0LD TO JOBS WESTERN, INC.

STREET 425 H. ROSS LARE

cITy, STATE ZIP  MEDFORD, OR 37501

TAY LOT NUMBER RI510=-023B0-05400-000~00

XBY

IOCATION BW OF SPRAGUE RIVER

1EGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 16, Bilock 13, Klamath Forest Betates, Klamath County, «QGreg
ACREARGE 2.38

SALE PRICE 52,150,060

S0LD TO JOBS WESTERNW, INC.

STREET 525 M. ROSS LANE

oYY, STATE ZIP KEDFORD, OR 97501




SOLD. AT. AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMRER R3510~-022D0-025800-000-00
REY : :

LOCATION N¥W OF SPHAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3%, Block 26, First addition To Klamath Forest Estates,«Kl
ACREAGE 2.38

SALE PRICE $1,700.00

SULD TO CONSTANCE M WoDD

STREET 22110 ARROWHEAD L.AWE

CITY, STATE ZIP CHILOQUIN, OR 97824

TAX 1OT NUMBER R3510-02680=-03200-000-00

Kuy

LOCATION HY OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 18, Block 37, ¥irst Addition To Klamath Forest Eztates, «XK1
ACREAGE .38

SALE PRICE $1,700.00

S0LD TO JOBS YWESTERN, INC.

STREET 425 N. ROSS IANE

CITY, STATE ZIP MEDFORD, OR 97501

TAX 1LOT NUMBER R3510-027A0~04800-000-~00C

XEY

IOCATION N¥ OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Bleck 42, First addition To Klamath Fores
ACREACGE 2.38

SALE PRICE $1,600.00

SQLD TO JOHN M. & JANRITA R. LAWRENCE

STREET P O BOYX 1374

CITY, STATE 3ZIP CHILOQUIN, OR 57624

TaX ILOT NUMBER R3510-0278B0-03200-000~00

KBY

LOCATION NW OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTICN Lot 15, Block 36, First addition To Klamath Forest Estates, «K1
ACREAGE 2.38

SALE PRICE $2,300.00

SOLD TC R WERDEMAN & 8 WERDEMAN

STREET P O BOX 321

CITY, STATE ZIP SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-027D0=-03100-000~00

XBY .

LDCATION H¥W OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 36, Blook 4%, First Addition To Rlamath Forest Estates, «K1
ACREAGRE 2.38

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO NGO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE Zip




‘gﬁzﬁsaf,§UCTxc§j

TAYX 1OT RuMBER RESI&fQﬁGQ&*%3?GG“GCQwGG
Kgv : : ‘
LOCATION % OF SPR RVR

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The SW1/4 NE1/4 of Sectien 22, Township 35 South, Range
ACREAGE 40.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAY LOT NUMBER R3511~98906=33899m933~36

REY

LOCATION E OF BPR RVR

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The SE1/4 NE1/4 of Section 22, Township 3% South, Range
AURBAGE 40,00

SALE PRICE

S0LD 70 NG BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAY 1LOT NUMBER RSSZI«GOQDQ»GGSGG*OSGnOO

KRY

ILOCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRISTION Lot 6, Bloock 9, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oragon.
ACREAGE 1.55

SALE PRICE

SOED TO HG BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER RBSEEnQG?&QmGGQGG«OQGwOG

KEY

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block g, Oregon Pines, Klamath
ACREAGE 1.55

SALE PRICE

80LD TO NO BID

STEREET

CIiTY¥, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER RBEEluGOQDGnOlOOG»GGG«@G

KEY

ILo087I0ON ] NE OF SPRAQUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION ot 4, Bleck %, OCregon Pires, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.55% :

SALE PRICE

80LD TO HO BID

STRERET

CITY, STATE RIp




17743

| SOLD.AT. AUCTION

TAY LOT NUMBER R3I511-009D0-02600~000-00

HuY

IOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot ig, Block 7, Oregon Pines, ¥lamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE i.51

SALE PRICE $1,002.00

SGLD TO H & TBRUBE & J & n SHITH

STREET 1443 WORDEN AVENUE

CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

TAX 1LOT NUMBER R3511—399§9~02700°69§°OQ

KEY

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lot 17, Block 7, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREBAGE i.51 :

SALE PRICE $1,80z.00

201D TO H&TBRUOEW &3 & N SMITH

ETREEY 1442 WORDEN AVENUE

CITY, STATE Ziv KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97801

TAY 1OT NUMBER R3511m509§9—9430ﬁ-909“96

KEY

LOCATTION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIDPTION Lot 14, Block 8, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.58

SALE PRICE

8CLD 1o HO BID

STRERD

CITY, STATE zIp

TAX 1OT HUMBER R3511-010C0~00200-000-00

KEY

IOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 12, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.51

SALE PRICE

SCLD TO RO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-010C0-00300-000-00

KEY

IOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER .

LEGAL DESCRIDPTION Lot 3, Bleck 12, Oregon Pines, Klamath County,
ACREAGE 1.80

SALE PRICE

S0LD 7o HO BID

BTREET

CITY, STATE ZIP




SOLD. AT, AUCTTON

TaX LOT NUMBER
ExY ‘

IOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STRERT

CITY, BTATE ZIP

TAYX LOT HUKBER
XEY

IOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPYION
ACHERGE

SALE PRICE

80LD TC

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAY 10T NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

80LD 70

STREET

CITI, STATE ZIPp

TaX LOT NUMBER
XEY

I0CATION

LEGAL DESCRISTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

8QLD TO

STREEY

CITY, STATE 21Ip

TAX LOT HUMBER
¥EY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SCLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE Z2IP

RE3511-011C0-001006~000~08

NE OF SPR RVR :

iot 9, Block 23, Cregon Pines, Klamath County, Qregon.
1.850 ’

¥O BID

R3511m§12€0*06236-08&~@9

HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 8, Bleck 29, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
1.84 :

BNO BID

R3512~011C0~018030-000-00

HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 2, Block 27, Orsgon Pines, Rlamath County, Oregon.
1.51

HO BID

R3511-011C0-02000-000-00

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 1, Bleck 27, Oregon Pines, Klamath County,
1.84

HC BID

R3511-011C0~-02500~-000-00

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 7, Block 26, Oregon Pines, Xlawmath County, Oregon.
1.5%

MO BID




SOLD. AT, AUCTION

P!

& e

TR 1LOT HUMBER RISII~-011C0~07100-0006-~00

EY o

IOCATION RE OF ZPRAGUE RIVER

LECAL DESCRIPTION Lot 38, Block 30, Oregon Pines, Elamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.50

SALE PRICE

SCID 1o HO BID

STHEET

CITY, BTATE ZIp

TAY 10T NUMBER RIS51L1-011C0~07200-000-00

KRy

ILCATION NE OF SPPAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 39, Block 30, Oraegon Pines, Klamath Count . Oregon.
ACRBAGE 1.80

SALE PRICE

SCLD TO HO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE zip

TAX LOT NUMBER 511~01100-03800-000~00
KBy
LOCATION OF SPRAGUE RIVER
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 34, Cregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREBAGE .81
SALE PRICE
ip

TAYX LOT RUMBER R3511~01100~-04100~000-00
¥
LOCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 4, Oregon Pines, Kiamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.581
SALE PRICE
8018 7O HC BID
STREET
CITY, STaTE 3IP

TAY LOT NUMBER R3511-011D0-04200«000-00

KEY

IOCATION HE OF SPRAGUR RIVER

LEGRL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Blook 34, Oragon Pines, Xiawmath County,; Oresgon.
ACHEAGE 1.57

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO ¥HO BID

STREET =

CITY, STATE Zip




SOLD. AT, AUCTION

TAY LOT HUMBER 33511»e13A0~33000w9QG~80

BeY

10CATION ¥E OF SPRAGUE RIVER

1EGAL DESCRIPTION 1ot 7, Blogk 44, Orsgon pines, Klamath county, Qregoen.
ACREAGE 1.51

SALE PRICE

2015 TO }¥O BID

STREETY

oITY, STATE ZIP

A LOT WUMBER ®3511~014B0~01100~000-00

BEY

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

1EGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 30, Oregon pines, Klamath County, Oredon.
ACREAGE 1.590

SALE PRICE

soLD T o BID

STREET

CITY, SYAYE 2IP

TaY LOT WNUMBER R3I511~-014B0~-01200~030-00
EEY

TOCATION

1HGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

80LL 10 ®O BID

STREET

cITY, STATE 2IP

PAYX LOT NUMBER R3511—01&86~92366=686666

REY

LOCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

1EGAL DESCRIPTION Lot &, Block 25, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.51

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO WO BID

STREET :

CITy, STATE ZIP

Ta¥ LOT WUMBER 23511-ﬂ1¢cem95596neaﬁm03
KEY
LOCATION NE OF SPR RVR
LEGAL DESCRIPTION 1ot 26, Block 28, oregon Plnes, giamath County
ACREAGE 1.84
- SALE PRICE
0L TO ¥O BID
STREET
oIvY, STATE Zip




OLD. BT, AUCTION

TAX 107 NUHDER H3511-03400-062150~000-00

KEY

LOCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION iot 20, Block 20, Ovegon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREACGE 1.51

SALE PRICE

BOLD TO #HO BID

STRERY

CITY, BTATE ZIp

TAX 10T ¥UMBER R3B11~014C0-08000-000=00

KBY

LOCATION N OF SPRAGUE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6, Block 22, Orzgon Pines, Elamath County, Oregon.
AUREAGE 1.80

SALE PRICE

SOLD 7o NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE z1p

TAX LOT NUMBER R3I5L1~01840-00300-000~00

KEY

IGCATION HNE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 71, Block i8, Cregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
AUEEAGE 1.57

S5ALE PRICE

S0LD O NG BID

STREEY

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-015A0-08100-000-00

EEY

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIDTION Lot 4%, Block 17, Ovegon Pines, Hlamath County, Oregon,
ACREAGE 1.74

SALE PRICE

0L TO NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE gIp

Ta¥ LOT HUMBER R3511-015A0-06600=-000-00

KEY

LOCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 46, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Xiamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.87

SALE PRICE

S0LD T HO BID

STREET

CITY, sTATE




R3511-015A0-07000~000-00

LOCATION HE OF 8pz »vn

IEGRL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 17, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, oOregon.
ACREAGE 1.88

SALE PRICE

80LD TO HO BID

STREEY

CITY, BYATE ZID

TAX LOT WUMBER R3511~015BG~01500-000-00

KEY

1OCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot i%, Biock 1e, Orvegon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.83

SALE PRICE

2CGID Yo HO BID

STREET

CITY, STAYTE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER m3511"61§§&“&1?@6“&%3”98

KEY

IoCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION s Block 16, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE

BALE PRICE

SOLD To

STRERT

CITY, BTATE ZIp

TAX 10T NUMBER R3511~015B0~02700~000-00

KBY ‘

LOCATION FE OF 5PR RVR

LEGAL DESCRIPTION A portion of Lot 111, Block 5, Oregon Pines, more particularly
ACREAGE 2.58¢

SALE PRICE

B0LD T0 BO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2Ip

TAX LOT MUHMDBER RBSEKW@I&BQnGS?G%*Q%O*GG

KgY

IOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION T 81, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Xlamath County, Oregon.
ACRE2GE 1.51

SRLE ®PRICE

801D TO ¥G BID

STRE®RD

CITY, SPaTR 2ip




| SOLD. AT. AUCTTON

Ta¥ LOT NUMBER R3511-0185B0~-07100-000-00

XEY

IDCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 22, Block §, Orsgon Pines, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE 1.50

SBLE PRICE

SOLD 7O NG BID

STREETY

CITY, STATE 2Ip

R3511~015C0~00800=000-~00

IDCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 16, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Orsgon.
ACREAGE 1.85

SALE PRICE

S0LD TG HO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE F1Ip

TAYZ LOT NUMBER R3511-015C0-01300~-00G-00

XEY

LOCATION NE QF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGARL, DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 5, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, Qregon.
ACREAGE 1,863

SALE PRICE

EQLD TO ¥O BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-015D0~02200-000~00

KRY

LOCAPION FE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 40, Bleock 5, Oregon Pinses, Klamath County, Oregen.
ACREAGE 1.54

BALE PRICE

SOLD TO NG BID

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

TAYX 107 NUMBER B351i~018A0~02000-000-00

KEY

IOCATION HE OF SPRAGSUR RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Block 7, Orsgoen Pines, Klsmath County, Gregon.
ACREAGE 1.54

SALE PRICE ‘

SOLD TG HO BID

STRERT

SITY, STATE 31ip




SOLE. AT, AUCTION

PAX TOT HUMBER

KEY

IDCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAG

w
&

SALE PRICE
SOLD 70O

STREET
CIiTY,

STATE

Iy

TaX IOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE

Zip

TAX LOT MUMBER

X8y

LOCATION

IBEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAG

E

SALE PRICE
B8OLD TS

STREEY

CITY,

STATE

Zip

TAX LOT NUMBER

KBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTIOR

BUREAGE
SALE PRICE
S0LL TO

STREET
CITy,

st

TaY LOT NUMBER

KEY

IOCATION

LEGAL
ACREAG

DESCRIFTION

B

SALE PRICE
S0LD T0
STREET
CITY,

STaTE

Z3IP

R35311-016A0~02100-000-00

HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

10t 2, Block 7, Orsgon Plnes, Xlamath County, Orsgon.
1.57

HO BID

R3511-01640~-02300~000-00

HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 4, Block 7, Oregon Pines, Xlawath County, Oregon.
1.65

NGO BXD

R3511-016A0~05500-000-00

KE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 23, Block &, Oregeon Pines, XKlamath County, Oregon.
1.54

RO BID

R3511=022B5-00200~000-~00

HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

1ot 8, Block 4, Oregon Pines, Klamath County, OGzxegon.
1.5%

HO BID

R3511~-02280-01300-000-00

HO BID



TAX LOT NUMBER
XEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

80LD 1o

STREET

CITY, STATE 3IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
REY

IOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE Zip

TRX LOT NUMBER
XEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, SYATE ZIp

TAY ILOT NUMBER
EEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACRRACE

SALE PRICE

§0LD 10

STREET

CITY¥, 8TATE Zip

Ta¥ 10T NUMBER
xBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIFTION
ACREAGE

BALE PRICE

E0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE zIP

R3511-02500~01200~000-00

HE OF ZPRAGUE RIVER

The 81/2 SW1/4 of Section 25, Township 35 South, Range 11 East
546.00

RO BID

R3511~029200~00200-000-00

R3I511~0G3000-01700-005-00

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

The E1/2 W1/2 uwi/a 8Wi/4 of Section 30, Townshi
2.5%9

RO BID

R3511~03500~01800~000-00

HW OF BEATTY )

The W2NE4SE4SW4 of Section 35, Township 35 South, Range 11
5.00

HO RID

R3812-00700~00700<-005-00

W OF BRATTY

The Wi/3 N1/2 ¥1/2 SW1/4 HEI/4 of Ssction 7, Township 35
5.00

HO BID




SOLD.AT. AUCTION

TAY LOT HUMBER
EEY

IOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

80LD 1O

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIpP

TAX LOT NUMBER
EEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

301D TO

STREET

CITY¥, STATE Zip

TAX LOT HUMBER
KEY

I0CATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD 10

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

IocaTION

IFCGAL DESCRIPTIOHN
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE

TAX LOT NUMBER
BEY

IOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

R3512-035B0-03800-000~00

H OF BERTTY
Lot 34, Bleck 1, Spragues Rivey Valley 2ores, Xliamath County, «O
1.82

HO BID

R3513-03380-00700-000-00

HE OF BRaTTY
Iot 8, Block 14, Tract No. i 3 ion To Ferguson«Hou
i.50

HO BID

R3606-003A5-01400-000=-00

ROCRKY POINT
Lot 13, Block 7, Arrvowhead Village, Klamath County, Oregon.
-3
$5,000.00
DENHIS IHNGRAM
505 NE 7H sT
GRARTS PASS, OR ©782&

R3606-010BE-01300-000~00

ROCEY poinm
Lot 15, Pelican Acres, Klamath County, Oregon.
<25
$2,800.00
AL BORW
704 WOODLAND AVENUR
WOODLAND PARK, CO s08s3

R3608-010CA~05300=000-00

ROCKY PpOoInT
The Westerly 100’ of Lot 3%, Frontier Tracts, K
429
$3,000.00
FRANK 8 10w
9136 HONUMENT DR
GRANTS PABS, OR 97525




<

X ariy ]

SOLD. AT, AUCTION

TaX 10T NUMBER RIBHBE~00000-00600~000~00

REY

ILCATION HE OF ALGOMA

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S1/2 81/2 WWl/4 SW1/4 of Section 13, Township 36 South,«Ra
ACREAGE 16.00

SALE PRICE

SOLD TG NQ BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

Ta¥ 107 NUHBER R3I810~001C0-03500-000C~00

KEY

LOCATION ¥ME OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Bleck 37, Fourth Addition Te Nimrod River Park, Klamath
ACREAGE 2.30

SALE PRICE

80LD TO NG BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAY LOT RUMBER R3610-001C0~04200-000-00

¥EY

LOCATION KE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 15, Block 37, Fourth Addition To Nimrod River Park, Klamat
ACREAGE 2.27

BALE PRICE

&0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAY LOT WUMBER R3610-001D0~07200~0300~00

KEY

IOQCATION HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIFPTION Lot 92, Block 31, Fourth addition To ¥imrod River Park,
ACREAGE 1.45

SALE PRICE

SOLD 0 NO BID

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

T&EY LOT NUMBER R3610-00200-00500~-000-00

rBY

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The H1/2 SEl/4 NE1/4 of Section 2, Township 36 South, Range
ACREAGE 20.00

SALE PRICE

SQLD TO ¥O BID

STREET

CITY, STATE Zip




SOLD. AT.AUCTION

TAX 10T NUMBER
RBY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX 10T NUMBER
XEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

501D 7O

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIip

TAX 10T NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

BALE PRICE

501D 7O

STREE?

CITY, STATE %IP

TaX LOT NUMBER
KBy

IDCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

S0LD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAY LOT NUMBER
REY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD ‘TO

STREEY

CIrY, s7aTe z2ip

R3610-011B0-02300=030~00

HE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
That portion of ths 81/2 H1/2 NE1/4 ¥W1/4 of Section 11, «Towns
5.77
1,750.00
JOSEPE H. & NOI SMITH
1443 WORDEN AVENUE
ELAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3610~01250~04000~-000~00

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER
Lot 10, Blosk 27, Fourth Addition To Fimrod River Park, Klamat
1.52

KO BID

R3610-01286~03800~000-00

HE OF SPR RVR
iot 25, Block 31, Fourth Addition To Himrod River Park, Rlamat
1.64 : '

NO BID

R3711-014C0~01900~000-00

BLY MTH CUT-OFF
A tract of land located in Lot 1¢, Block 81, Klamath Palls«¥For
1.00

BC BID

R3811-009B0~03800~0006-00

BLY HTN

Lot 23, Block 37, Klamath Falls Foreat Estates Highway 68 Un
2.43
$5,100.00 ;

GLENN 0. & HELEN L. CLEVEN

28913 SUMMERS LANE

RLAMATH FALLS, OR 37603




SOLD. AT, AUCTION

TAY 1LOT NUEBER RIgL5-00000-00400-500-0G0

XEY

LOCATIOY HE OF GERBER

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The W1/2 ¥W1/4 Section 3, Township 38 South, Range 15 Fast of«
ACREAGE B82.36

SALE PRICE $11,500.00

SOLD TC IVAM ® & ESTHER § FISHER

STREET P O BOX B3

CITY, STATE 2IP BLY, OR 97622

TAX LOT HUMBER R3807-025C0~06500~-000~00

KEY

IOCATION EENO

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 11, First Addition To Klamath River Aores, Klamatb
ACREAGE 1.48

SALE PRICE $131,100.00

B20LD TO BOBBY R & SANDRA K HARTLEY

STREET 1526 PLEASANT AVEHUER

CITY, STATE ZIip KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97801

TAX 1OT NUMRER 8~031CC~03100~000-00

KEY

IOCATION 9 FERW, KEWC

IBGAL DESCRIPTICH s Block 4, Plat of The Town of Doten, Klamath County, Ore
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

8GLD TC THE CORNELIUS FAMILY TRUST

STREET P O BOX 831

CITY, STATE ZIP COLTON, CA 92324

TAX LOT NUMBER R3205-002BB-02800-000~00

KEY

LOCATION 1750 GARY 8T, XF

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 11, Block 9, Pleasant View Tracts EYCEPTING THEREFROE the«
ACREAGE .44

SALE PRICE

SOLD TC ELETED

STREET

CITY, BTATE ZipP

TAX LOT NUMBER R40G8~034BD~-01100~000-00

KBY

LOCATION HWORDEHN

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 50, Plat of Worden, Klamath County, Oregon.
ACREAGE .18

SALE PRICE $1,100.00

S0LD TO CLAUDE E & KARI I. NEILSOW

STREET 19730 KENOC WORDEN ROAD

CITY, BTATE ZIP KLAMATH FRLIS, OR 87603

STATE OF OREGON: COUNTY OF KLAMATH :  ss.

Filed for record at request of Klamath Countv Sheriffs Office the 10th
of June ADLI9 87 m 1138 o'clock Pe M., and duly recorded in Vol. 97
of Deads onPage _ 17732 .
emetha G. Legeeh, County Clerk
No Fee A, f?ﬁ&zL/
1 ¥




