CARLR BURKHART SHERIFF
808 S0. 5TH ST. ~ KLAMATH FALLS, oneconmm —(641) 8835130 — FAX(541) 8834271

June 17,1998 -
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The parcels llsted in the nmclxcd addendum were mld at pubhc auction hcld at the Klamath
County Fairgrounds on June 11, 1998 at 10 OOam

The total revenue for the sale amounted {o Slsl 67; 00. Total regoxdmg fees collected was $2,040.00
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After recordlng return to°
Linda Seater,

Property Sales Deparrment

“To Protect and To Serve The Community”




»fazaos 026DA—0030 ooo,oo'

,,LOCATION A

LEGAL DFSCRIPTION

' ACREAGE

' SALE PRICE

SOLD TO ,

STREET = = =
CITY, STATE zzp

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

" SALE PRICE

“SOLD 7O . :
STREET =~

‘CITY,'STATE ZIP.

TAX LOT NUMBER
‘KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE
' SALE PRICE

SOLD TO -
STREET L
‘»CITY, STATEAZIP»‘

- TAX LOT NUMBER
CKEY

 LOCATION. -
'LEGAL DEOCRIPmION

TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY o

- LOCATION -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

‘SALE PRICE

SOLD TG

STREET

';CITY SIATE zZIP

s OF LA PINE . ' CUME LRI e
That portlon of,the NE4SE4 of Sec.czs;'Twsp_za S, R 9 EWM, Kl. -
2.40- , c : Cawoul oot S g
$6,000.00 4{,," '
- TOM & CAROL SCQT” [”'

P'O BOX 594 -
AUMSVILLE OR. 97325

| R2310401630-06100?odoeoo.‘

S OF LA PINE

]
+

A parcel of land sltaated in fhe SW4NW4 of Sec,‘ls, Twsp 23 S,

7.41

DELETED )
M-101025

R2310- 03680 01000 000 00

SE OF LA DINE Lo ,
Lot' 28, Block 1 Tract 1060 oun Forest Estates
1,00 ¢
$4,500.00°

ALAN 7. DETRICK

6705 AUMSVILLE HWY

SALEM, OR ,97301

R2310 03630 14200 000 00

SE OF LA PIVE "v S e ‘ :
Lot 33, Block 4 ;ract'1060-8uanorest Estates
1.00 - FERCE fallo '
$4,400.00 . . R

T. SCOTT & B REI TERER

P O BOX 594.

AUMSVILLE,: OR 97325

R2310 ~-038C0-~ 11600 000 00

SE OF LA PINE e S

Lot 16, Block 7 Tract 1060 - Sun Fore St Bastates
1.00. . : e ‘
$4, 800 00 S

RON ‘& MINDY KAPHART :

2656 N. 33RD ST.;'-- s

SPRINGFIEJD OR 97477




ETAK LOT NUMBER
‘KEY

v LOCATION
-LEGAL DESCRIDTION
ACREAGE

‘SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

- 'STREET

- CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KBY
LOCATION
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
. ACREAGE

SALE PRICE
SCID TO
STREET
.CITY,‘STATE z1p

- TAX- LOT NUMEER
KEY ™

'-LOCATION

LEGAL’ DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE . .
SALE PRICE

SOLD -TO

" STREET. :

| CITY, STATE ZIP

U TAX LOT NUMBER

. KEY - .

, LOCATION

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

- SALE PRICE

SOLD. TO

- STREET ~

- CITY, STATE ZIP

. TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY _
LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

- SOLD TO

 STREET .~
CITY, STATE ZIP

L 32310'03600 11700 ooo 00"

SE OF LA PINE ’ I ‘
Lot 17, Block 7 Tract lObO - Sun Forest Es:ates
1.00 » . _ .
$4,800.00 -
RON & MINDY KAPHART
2656 'N. 33RD 8T.
SPRING FIELD, OR 97477

R2310-036co-1iaoo;ooo-oo

SE OF LA PINE-

Lot - 18, Block 7. Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estaces
1.00
$4,300.00

T. SCOTT & B.. REISTERER

P O'BCX 594 . 7

AUMSVILLE, OR 973?5

R23100036co~119007000-00'

SE OF LA PINE : : o

Lot 19, Block s, Tract 1060 ~ Sun Forest Estates
1.00 :
$4,000.00

GEORGE ' LANDEN

145055 BIRCHWOOD RD
LA PINE, OR 97739

R?310 036CO 12000 000 00

. 8E ‘OF LA PINE e i o

Lot 20, Block 7 Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates
1.00 ¢ : . [ .
$4,300.00 .

ALAN F. DLTRICK o

6705 AUMSVILLE" HWY‘ =

,SALEM, ‘OR- 97301

 R2310- 036D0 08200 OOO 00

SE OF LA PINE S )

Lot -2, Block ll, Tract 1060 - Sun Forest Estates
1.00 o .
$4,400:00 ‘

ROY ARNOLD - i S

11310 IRONWOOD ‘DR ;7

- PINE, oa 97739'




’SOLD.AT.AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER R2409-030CD-02800-000-0C
KEY P

LOCATION CRESCENT - PR SRR TN e

' LEGAL DESCRIPTION A tract of land located in the SW4 of Sec. 30, Twsp 24 S, R sV
ACREAGE .91 : Db S

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO ) ‘DELETED

STREET C

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R2409- OBODB 07800 000 00
: KEY N L
 LOCATION - - CRESCENT |
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, Block 31, Crescent
“ACREAGE -
 SALE PRICE .
'S0LD.TO . NO BID
. STREET B
CITY, STATE ZIP

R2409 030DB 08100 OOO 00

LOCATION : CRESCENT - . - RN
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 15, 1ock °1, Crescent -
"~ ACREAGE ‘ : . ’ '
“SALE PRICE - ’

‘SOLD TO : NO BID

‘STREET : '
. CITY, STATE ZIP

. TAX LOT NUMBER R2409- 030DB 08200 000- 00
. KEY n ‘

LOCAT ICN o CRESCENT ' ' S
 LEGAYL DESCRIPTION The N2 oF Lot 16 Block 31 Crescent:“
- ACREAGE :

* ‘SALE PRICE ' $275.00
- 80OLD TO EILEEN GOOLEY & PAUL MCCORD
';STRFET P O BOX 424 . -
: TY, STATE ZIP . LA PINE, OR ,97739

TAX LOT NUMBER R2409-031BB-00200-000-00.
KEY '
LOCATION ‘ CRESCENT = .~ : . o Lo ' S
LEGAL DESCRIPTION A tract of land loca*ed 1n the NW4NW4 of Sec 31, Twsp 24 .S, R
- ACRERGE 1.16 ‘ o - ST
SALE PRICE ‘ e
SOLD TO. . DELETED .
© STREET - - ‘ :
CITY, STATE ZIP




,sow.;\j:‘.'zucwzq

’ TAX LOT NUMBER RZBOB 020B0 00900 000 00 B

KEY . ‘

- LOCATION . BEAVER MARSH ,»,' O e LR I .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 'S, Block i, North“Beaver‘MarSh;grMobile hcme not included.
ACREAGE : .61 ' § » oot e ' i
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO - “NO BID
STREET . v
CiTY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-001A0-00300-000—00
KEY ‘e . ot .

LOCATICON . SAND CREEK L
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 4, Mt Scott Meadow
ACREAGE - ‘ 1 oo

SALE PRICE : ,

SOLD TO : NO BID

STREET ' ‘

~CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3107-001D0-09200r000400

LOCATICN - SAND CREEK e o S .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 13, Block 12, Mt ,acott Meadow
ACRERGE : 1.14 C
SALE PRICE

‘SOLD TO ~ NO BID

STREET ‘ ’

CITY, STDTE ZIP

R3107 012D0 02100 000 00

_LOCATION : SAND CREEK- P ‘ R
" LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 16, Block 21 Mt. Scott’ Veadow
ACREAGE ~ 1.05 '
- SALE PRICE
'S8OLD TO NO ‘BID
STREET o S
| CITY, STATE ZIP

KEY
LOCATION ' . SAND CREEK o S
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 15, ‘Block 21, Mt Scott Meadow
 ACREAGE S 1.08 SR
 SALE PRICE R
~ SOLD TO » NO BID -
'STREET -
CITY, STATE 2IP

. TAX LOT N?MBEQ R3107- 012D0 02260 000 00




AT.AUCTION’

| TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

“STREET ,
CITY, STATE ZIP

_~TAX LOT NUMBFR

: LEGAL DWSCRIPTION
ACREAGE .
SALE PRICE
. SOLD TO

- STREET

5 LITY STATE ZIP

 TAX LOT NUMBER -
KEY

. LOCATION

- LEGAIL,: DESCRIPTION

LCREAGE
SBLE-PRICE -

‘SOLD. TO

STREET - .
CITY, STATE ZIPp

TAx 10T NUMEER
KEY .
" LOCATION -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE :
< SALE: PRICE
©SOLD TO'
" STREET
| CITY, STATE ZIP

" TAX LOT NUMBER

KEY .
LOCATICN
LEGAL DESCRIDTIOV
ACREARGE ‘
SALE- PRICE
“80LD TO

STREET .
ffFITY, STKTE ZIP

R3107 012D0 05100 ‘OD 00

SAND CRnEK

Lot 14, Rlock 24, Mt Scott Meadow
.1.00 , o s

—NO"BIDU

R3107 012D0- 06700 000 00

SAND CREEK =~ - - el G i

Lot 30, Block 24 Mt Scott Meadow Co
1.00 ‘ o R N

' NO BID

RSllO 00000 00400 000 OO

SILVER LAKE : -
A parcel of 1and containing ;.14 acres, m/1l, recorded in Vol.Y
1.14 ' o
-$1,000.00 : D
MARK MATTHEWS - @ -
220 WASHINGTON. " '
KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

R3’307-.V159D-02300-jooo-ooj

FORT KLAMATH

A tract of land’ 81tuated in Lot 4 in the bE4SE4 of Sec 16, VTw
.20 el

NO BID

R3313- 02700 05600 000 00

SYCAN UNIT . SR L o

Lot 16 :E, Block. 10 Klamath Falls Forest Estates Sycan Unltv
10.35. : : _ :
$2,850.00 - .

DENIS & ANNE CORBIN

. HC.63 BOX 330

CHILOQUIN, OR 97624




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

“TAX LOT NUMBER
"KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
_'ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

. SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE 2IP

“TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY .
LOCATICN

* LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE . .
SALE PRICE .
SOLD' TO

STREET .
CITY, STATE 2ZIP

- LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE -
SALE PRICE.

80L.D TO .-

. -S8TREET. :

t CITY STATE ZIP

»~1ﬁx LOT NUMBER
KEY '

. LocaTioN
i - LECAL DESCRIPTION
" ‘ACREAGE

“SALE PRICE

- 8OLD TO
“STREET

‘CITY, STATE ZIpP

~ TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY -
LOCATION :
 LEGAL’ DFaCRIPTION
ACRERGE

SALE PRICE

' SOLD'TO .

' STREET |, \
“CITY, STATE ZIP

‘R3313 03000~ 03200 000 00

R3313 02700 05700 000 OO

SYCAN UNIT SRR -

Lot "16 ' D, Block 10, Klamath Fallg,ForestrEstates Sycan Unit
$2 500.00 v

DENIS & ANNE. CQRBIN

“HC -63 BOX 330

CHILOQUIN, OR 97624

R3313-o3009f02soa-000700 ‘
SYCAN UNIT
'9.86

NO BID-

SICAN UNIT SR
That portlon of Lot 1, Block 2
9. 14

sitﬁaﬁed N. and W. of a pointy

NO BID

R3313 0“200 00400 000 00 E

SYCAN UNIT . - R v R
The S2W2 of LoL 7 Block 7, Klama*h Falls Fcrest Estates Sycan:

- 8. 86
NO BID'

R3313~ 03400 00800 000 co

SYCAN UNIT

The S. 460" of’the E2 of Lot 4, Block 12, Klamath Falls. Forest:

9 85

NO BID'

The N2W2 of Ldt 4, Blcéka,,KlamAEh Falls-Fo:est Estates Sycan :



_TAX LOT NUMBER o R3313 0%400 02600 000‘00
KEY ;

- LOCATION SYCAN UNIT . o IR AT P S
‘LEGAL DES;RIPTION The N2E2 of Lot 11 quck 10, Klamath Falls Forest EstatesVSyc’
ACREAGE , 9.86 o ’ ST : B

. - SBALE PRICE ,

. SCLD' FO . NO BID
STREET '

CITY, STATE ZIP.

TAX LOT NUMBER R3407-004DA-00100-000-00
KEY : oo
LOCATION = CHILOQUIN - F e S R
LEGAL DEaCRIPTION All that portlon of bhe NE4SE4 of Sec. 4, Twsp 34 S, R 7 EWM,V |
ACREAGE' 5.70 . S e R :
'SALE PRICE
~ SOLD . TO : NQ BID
STREET o
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER ' R3407- 034DA-03700 000 00
KEY . , .
'LOCATION CHILOQUIN -
- LEGAL DESCRIPTIOM Lots 1 &2, Block 4 Chlloqu1n Helghts To Chlloqu1n
. ACREAGE s S
_SALE PRICE :
. 8OLD 70 .. NO BID
. STREET - ' :
',CITY STATW Z;P

TAX;LOT NUMBER_?' R3407 034DB 00200 000 -00

LOCA "ION S CHILOQUIN ‘

LEGAL DWSCRIPTION Let 2, Block 1 Second Addxthn to Chllquln
. ACREAGE , , .16 S , \ ;
"SALE PRICE . :
. “SOLD TO NO BID

STREET S

FCITY; STATE Zip

TA& LOT NUMEnR :RJ407 034DB 00400 000 00
‘KEY"~ : : e _
LOCATION | CHILOQUIN . e S
‘LEGAL" DEQCPIPTION Lot 4, Block 1; Second Addition‘To‘Chiloquin .
'ACREAGE 213 e : Rt ‘ .

- NO BID[',.<I’
fCTTY STATE ZIp '




‘SOLD.AT AUCTION =~

TAX 10T NUMBER R34O7—034D8901000-000&QO;‘
KEY : : e o
- LOCATION CHILOQUIN . :

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 11 & 12, Block i, Sccond Addtlon to- Chllquln
ACREAGE .16 .

‘SALFE. PRICE v

-S0LD TO NO BID

STREET
{-CITY, STATE ZIP

fTAX LéT_NUMBER R3407- 034DD 06000 000 00

‘CHILOQUIN o '
‘Lot 15, B1ock 4 Chlloquln
C.13

- NO BID

'R3413-00400- ooeoo ooo oo

S OF SYCAN UNIT

The N2 of Gov't Lot 5 sltuated in: Sec. 4, Twsp 34 S, R 13 EWM,
17.88 v s .

- NO BID

CITY, STATE ZIP

LTAXﬂLOT'NUMBER ‘R3507- OOGAD 00800 000 00
vLOCATION AGENCY LAKh .f' : : '
“LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 19, Block 15 Oregon Shores
ACREAGE . ; v
'SALE PRICE :

SCLD. TO -~ ‘NO BID

STREET o

CITY, STATE ZIP

‘R3507-~ OOGAD 08800 000 00

VLOCATION S ACENCY LAKE S ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 16, Oregon Shores

‘ NQ'BID

'CITY, STATE ZIP. =




"TAX 1.OT NUMBER R3507 006AD 09200 000 00

CKEY . o ) S
LOCATION R AGENCY LAKE — ‘ .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 6 Block 16, Oregon Shores

' ACREAGE _
SALE PRICE i

- 8OLD TO . . NO BID

. ‘STREET '

- CITY, STATE ZIP

. TAX LOT NUMBER Rsso7-oovcb-oiabcgoooéoo

v AGENCY 'LAKE - L ‘ o
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Block 5, Latakomie Shores;f"
_ACREARGE - - ) '
SALE PRICE $1 375.00°
.. SOLD 70 GARRY RUITER f
STREET ' 528 MESA,DR S
YCITY, STATE ZIP : KLAMATH FALLS OR 97601

ATRD M oM
bbraon ek

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507 OO/CD 13400 ooo oo

KEBY .

. LOCATION . AGENCY LAKE P RE T :
‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 3 Latakomle Shores
ACREAGE
“SALE PRICE 81, 450 oo ,1,}

SOLD TO : - GEORGE LANDEN - .~ -
STREET o 145055 BIRCHWOOD RD = - '
CITY, STATE zxp LA PINE, OR ‘97739

TAX LOT NUMBER ;,‘R3SO7-007DO;034005000400'
KEY ) ! b
_LOCATION . AGENCY LAKE " . : '
"LEGAL' DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 5 Bella Vlsta - Tract 1235
‘ACREAGE : 1.00. ;
SALE: PRICE ‘ ‘

SOLD TO j~NO BID

. STREET '

CITY, STATE ZIP

NTAX LOT NUMBER - R3507- 007DD 03500 000 00

KEY .

LOCATION . AGENCY LAKE : ,’ N ' p
“.LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5,-Block 5 Bella Vlsta - Tract 1235
. ACREAGE 1. 00 :

' SALE PRICE o

SOLD . TO : : NO‘BID
" STREET : o

CITY, STATE ZIP




‘SQLDﬁaT;AUCfidNT

" TAX LOT. NUMBER R3507 017c5 04600 000- oo‘”'°
_KEY o :
LOCATION - AGENCY LAKE

. LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 54, Block 29, Tract 1113.— Oregon Shores - Unit 2
ACRERGE. Lo - : L

.“SRLE 'PRICE
SOLD TO
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP -

TAX LOT NUMEER ‘ R3507-018AAf01300—OOO-00
KEY ‘
 LOCATION . AGENCY LAKE ‘ o Bk
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 44, Tract 1184 - Oregcn Shores - Unlt 2 - 1stVAdd |
ACREAGE , S
 SALE PRICE R
 SOLD TO - : "NOvBID,A; -
" STREET" o
X - CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER - R3507- 018AA 07500 ooo 00 .

KEY -

LOCATION = AGENCY LAKE =~ -~ .o o
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, Blogkfgz;;r:agt'1184 - ‘Oregon Shores - Unit 2 - 1st Ad

" ACREAGE

SALE PRICE o
soLD O NO BID
‘STREET - ' '
CITY, STATE ZIP.

'/TAX LOT NUMBER R3507 OleAB 02900 000 00.
KEY :

- LOCATION- ;A,' AGENCY LAKE R ‘ - ‘

. LEGAL- DESCRIPTION Lot 25, Block 46, Tract 1184 - Oregon Snores'— ‘Unit 2 - 1st/hd
- ACREAGE v S ,

. SALE PRICE

. SOLD 'TO

- STREET '

‘CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER . R3507<018ABAO7900#000-00
.KEY: ,‘~ . S
- LOCATION _ AGENCY LAKE E ‘ PR '
~ LEGAL. DESCRIPTION Lot 58, Block 48 Tract 1181 - Oregon,Shores - Unlt 2 - lstJhd
* ACREAGE I e T L
- SALE PRICE
-SOLD . TO
STREET -
CITY, STATE ZIP




.TAX LOT NUMBER R3507 018AC 07700 ooo oo f‘

KEY

LOCATION: * AGENCY LAKh : o ’ ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 22 Block 49, Tract 1184 - Oregon Shores»- Unit 2 - 1st/hd
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE o

-SOLD" TO o NO'BID :

STREET = e

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER 33507-018DA-05100-000—00'f
KEY . _ o Bk
- LOCATION " AGENCY LAKE =~ o ’ ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 50, Block 24 Tract 1113 - Oregon Shore54— Unit 2
ACREAGE o
SALE PRICE i
 SOLD TO . NO BID
STREET =~ , :
- CITY, STATE 21p

TAX LOT NUMBER R3507-018DA<086001ooo-ob;
KRY S

LOCATION - AGENCY LAKE : ’ '

LEGAL DBSCRIPTION Lot 11 Block 29 Tract 1113'- Oregon shores - Unit 2
ACREAGE . , . 1 L : o

“SALE PRICE 7

"SOLD TO- S ~,NO_BID'

STREET . S

,CITY STATE ZIP

‘,'TAX LOT NUMBER ; R3509 014A0 01900 000 00
‘KBY . ‘
LOCATION LONE PINE. . - ‘, R L
"LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1, Block 6, Lone Pine On The Sprague
ACREAGE : 1.27 - , . g I T S T

- 'SALE PRICE $1,750.00
SOLD TO ELLEN ' SUING

. STREET - PO BOX 302 :
CITY  STATE: ZIP SPRAGUE RIVER, OR 97639

TAX LOT NUMBER | 33509-014Ao-6280d§600400"
L ER RN

. CITY, STATE zIP




55104014co-007qo 00-00

v 'SPRPGUE RIVER SRR ' ' N
LEGAL -DESCRIPTION: Lot 10 Block 17 Klamath Forest Estates b
. ACREAGE 4.44 .
SALE PRICE
“S0LD TO "NO BID
STREET S
C17Y¥, STATE ZIp

'TA& LOT NUMBER R3510 014C0 01900 000 00
KEY
~LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

LEGAIL DESCRIPTION Lot 60, Block 16, Klamath Forest Escates
ACREAGE e 2.41 "

SALE: PRICE o

SOLD TO S "NO BID

STREET S -

CITY, STATE.ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-01580~04200=000400'

"KEY -

‘LOCATION ' SPRAGUE RIVER B
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot -3, ‘Block 6 Klamath Forest Estatesv.
‘ACREAGE 3.68

SALE PRICE ,

S0LD TO : MO BID

STREET ..

CITY, STATE zxp

TAX LOT NUMBER R3510-023D0-00800?000"00

: SPRAGUE RIVER ’

-LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 39, BIock 13 First Addltion to Klamath Forest Estates.
- ACREAGE . "2.38 . :

SALE PQICE '

JSOLD TO. - NO BID

STREET - - - . ‘
_.CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER  R3510- 02300 ozaoo ooo 00
KEY ; :

LOCATION - SPRAGUE RIVER .=
 LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, Block 26, VFirst Addltlon To Klamath Forest Estates
. ACREAGE N 2.38 L ‘ i

'SALE PRICE -

/SOLD.TO. . - . NO BID

‘STREET .~ . -

iCI”Y,'STATE zxp :




_/SOLD TO

'SOLDAT AUCTION

TAX LOT NUMBER.
KEY - ’
'LOCATION -

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET o
CITY, STATE ZIP:

‘TAX LOT NUMBER .
KBY -
" LOCATION .
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
- ACREAGE
" SALE PRICE

‘STREET
CITY STATE ZIP

TAX’LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION ‘
LEGAL D”SCRIPTION
- ACREAGE .

- SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

¢ STREET

 CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY
LOCATION
 LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE
 SALE PRICE
SOLD TO

" STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP
| locatron'
- LEGAL DEaCPIPTICN

';SOLD TO -

STAT& ZIP

3R3510 02500 00100 000?00

NE OF. SPRAGUE RIVER

The 22NE4NE4 of Sec. 25 Twsp 35 s, R 10 EWM Kl Co., OR.
- 20.00 - i e

NO BID

R351O 02500~ 02500 000 00

NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

The . ﬂZSE4SE4 of Sec. 2§> Twsp 35 S R 10 EWM, Klamath County,/
20.00 i e

NO BID

R3510-026A0-017Qo:ooo-oo

SPRAGUE RIVER '
Lot. 47, Bleck 32 Flrst Additlon To Klamath Forest Estates
2.38 . .

NO BID

R3510-026D0-01600€000r00 

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 17, 'Block: 39 Flrst Addltion To Klamatn Forest Estates
3.31 ‘ A SR

NO BID

R3510 026D0 01700 000 00

SPRAGUE ?IVER o g B ’

Lot '16, Block 39 Flrst Addltlon To Klamath Forest Estates
4. 83 DT . :

NO BID




’le LOT NUMBBR ‘R3510 DZBAO 00100 000 00
KEY o

,LOCATION ' SPRAGUE RIVER : | R : i '
‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 34, Fzrst Addltlon To Klamath Foresc Estates
" ACREAGE . . 2.38 . _ v L

SALE PRICE : $1,850. 00 i

SOLD TO - W.V.T. SERVICE, INC o

"STRERT : 63 CALLE INDUSTRIAS #544,.

CITY, STATE ZIP SAN CLEMENTE, CA 92672

TAX LOT NUMBER R?Slo 028C0 01000 000 -00
KEY
LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 22, Block 44, Flrst Addition'To‘Klamath Forest Estates.vMo :
-ACREAGE 5.12 ) ; S : ‘

SALE PRICE - ';5 375, 00 S

SOLD TO K N MARK GOHLKE. & MARGARET GRACE

STREET ‘ 200 NW S3RD: ST #8

CIiTY, STATE ?IP CORVALLIS OR 97330

R3510-028D0- 02700 000 00

SPRAGUE - RIVER : L
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 9, Block 44, Flrst Addltlon To Klamath Forest Fstates

ACREAGE 2.58

SALE PRICE ‘ $2,800.00

SOLD TO JOBS WESTERN, . INC
STREET 17 PERRYDALE AVE |
CITY, STATE ZIP MEDFORD, ‘OR 97501

-TAX 10T NUMBER "~ R3510-035C0- 00600 000 00
XEY

LOCATION : ' SPRAGUE RIVER , : Sl
LEGAL DESCRIP"ION Lot 18, Block 2 Junlper Acres L
. ACREAGE . 3.57 _ s
. SALE PRICE 1 $3,000.00 S P
.- BOLD.TO ‘rf DOMALD & MARGARET RIESCH
. STREET - . P 'O"BOX: 7387
CITY STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 9760”

rax LOT NUMEER R3511- ooooo 04700 ooo -00
KEY
LOCATICH - " NE OF BEATTY . 8 _ AL
LEGAL DEOCRIPTION The SWANW4 of- Sec 21 Twsp 35'8, R 11 EWM, Kl. Co., OR.
ACREAGE = - 40.00 ‘ e A
SALE PRICE .
SOLD TO - . NO BID
STREET - - .~ S
‘CITY, STATE ZIP




"7_R3511 -00200- 011fo.ooo 00"

 LOCA”1ON s NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER DI ‘ '
. LEGAL DESCRIPTION A tract of land sztuated 1n Sec. 2; Twsp 35 S, R 11 EWM, K1.Vc.
- ACREAGE 41.00 BRI : PR

SALE PRICE - . :

SOLD .TO - T NO BID

STREET - Ll

CITY, OTATE ZID :

-5TAX’L0T NUMBER  R3511-011C0-01800-000-00
e , -01800-000-

10CATION ’ NE OF SPRAGUE! RIVER: :
" LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 27, Oregon Plnes
"ACREAGE. 1.58
SALE PRICE ;
--8CLD .TO" v' NG BiD
'STREBT - o :
“CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX QOT NUMBER R3511 011co 02300 000 00

Ky
" LOCATION ' NE OF °PRAGUE RIVER o
'LEGAL" DESCRIPTION Lot 9, Block 26 Oregon Plnes
ACREAGE - _ 1.57 R
SALE PRICE . :

~8SOLD TO - NO BID

‘STREET ' '

'CITY; STATE ZIP

TAX LCE JUMBER R3511- OlICO 06800 000 00
“KEY ‘ .
- IOCATION - i NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER g ‘ :
- “LEGAL D”SCRIPTLON Lot 35, Block 30 Oregon PlﬂES'
.. ACRERGE - 1. 62 o ,
- SALE PRICE

SOLD TO . - NO BID.

STREET

CITY STATE ZIP

f,TAX LOT" MUMBER R3511 011D0 03900 000 00
“‘KBY- . S v
- LOCATION- - NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER Sl
"LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 34 Oregon Pinns
- ACREAGE l1.61 .
.. SALE PRICE v
-80LD TO NO BID
~ STREET h
CITY, STATE 2Ip.




TAX LOT NUMBER R3511 014BO 02300:000 00

KEY :

LOCATION i NE ‘OF SPRAGUB RIVER I
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 35 Oregon Pines RER
ACREAGE o 1.51 L -
SALE PRICE ' $1,000.00 . .

SOLD TO - ULRICH &. SPANG

STREET P O BOX 7960 - : L

CITY STATE ZIP KLAMATH FALLS OR 97602 ”

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-014BO-082004000}00j:ﬂ”

KEY ) v ERRAEROS) -
LOCATION - NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER. - : i
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 37, Block 18 Oregon Plnes‘~'
ACREAGE , 1.60 . '
‘SALE PRICE o
SOLD TO - NO BID

. 'STREBET - .~ o

- CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-015A0—028004000700
LOCATION 'NE OF SPRAGUE RIVEP -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 60, Block 5, Oregon Pines
ACREAGE - 1.66 :

SALE PRICE , ,
80LD .TO . . . NO BID

" STREET o L
-PITY STAT” ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511 015DD 01100 000 00
KEY : v
LOCATION ' NE OF SPRAGDB RIVER .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 58, Block 5, Oregon Plnes :
ACREAGE -~ . -1, 53 S : ‘
SALE BRICE v
80LD TO -~ - , ‘NO‘BID_

- STREET s e
CITY, STATE.ZIP'

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-017oo-oozoo-ooo:oo1
XEY - o
LOCATION. " NE OF SPRAGUE." L L
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION ‘The W2NW4SW4 - of Sec. 17 Twsp 35 s R 11 EWM, Kl. Co., OR.
" ACREAGE -9, 50
SALE PRICE ‘
SOLD TO L DELETEDY
_ STREET , :
. CITY, STATE ZIP




"sbLD;AT;AUQTIONf

- TAX LOT NUMBER R3511—01900-018004000-00pv
KEY : '

. LOCATION - . NE OF SPRAGUE RI\nR B R
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2N2 of GOV't LOt 3 Bltuated 1n Sec 19/:Twsp 35 S, R 11VE -
ACREAGE - : 9.53 ‘ T
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO NC BID
STREET ‘
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-01900-02500-000~00
KEY T E U

LOCATION ) NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER S e

LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S28E4SW4 of Sec. 19, Twsp 35 S, R 11 EWM, Kl.
ACREAGE 20.00 S S :

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO o NO BID

STREET"

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-0228B0-00300-000-00

KEY :

LOCATION : ME OF SPRAGUE :RIVER . .
‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 4, 0 regon Plnns
ACREAGE S 1.57°

SALE PRICE L :

SOLD T -~ NO BID

STREET - T ‘

CI1TY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511~03200-01200-000400
KEY . - '

LOCATION .. .. NE .OF SPRAGUE RIVER '

LEGAL DESCRIPTIPN The WZSEéNE4 Of ‘Sec. 32, Twsp 35 S R 11 EWM, Kl.
 ACREAGE . 19.00 ’ '
SALE PRICE

soLD TO - - ‘ ‘NO BID

"STREET o

CITY, STATE ZIP

R3511—03500?00300F660-00‘

LOCATION NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER = e '

 LEGAL DESCRIPTION The N2NW4NE4 of, Sec. 35, Twsp 35 s, R 11 EWM, Kl. Co., OR.
CACREARGE - 20,00 . ,

_ SALE PRICE. . E

SoLp TO .. - - ' NO BID'

STATE 2IP-




H;TAX LOT NUMBER 7'R3511 03500 00500 000 00
- KBY - . R
LOCATION = NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER

. LEGAL DESCRIPTION The NW4 of Seu. 35 Twap '35 S, R 11 EWM Kl CO , OR
. ACREAGE. v 60 00 ' Rt
. 'GALE PRICE ‘
SOLD TO - L NO‘BID :
"STREET B
- CITY, STATE ZIP

ThX LOT NUMBBR ,R3511 03500 00900 ooo oo ‘
. KEY . -

‘LOCATION " 'NE OF. SPRAGUE RIVER _ : - B

LEGAIL DESCRIPBION The NE4SE4 of °ec 35 Twsp 35 s R 11 EWM, Kl Co., OR

ACREAGE 40.00 R ,

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO o NO BID -

STREET g o '

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER ‘R3511- 03500 02300 000 00
KEY

LOCATION - NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER 2 ' ’ :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION ‘The E2SWASE4 Of ec 35 Twep 35 S R 11 EWM, K1.

ECREAGE - - +20.00
SALE PRICE

'SOLD TO . NO BID
 STREET S LIRS :
cxwx, STATE ZIP

- TAX LOT NUMBEQ , R3511 o3soo 02400 ooo 00
KEY Do
LOCATION : NE OF SPRAGUE RIVER . E L
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The SE4SE4 of Sec 35, Twsp 35 s R 11 EWM
ACREAGE . 40.00 v
SALE PRICE _ B
SOLD TO ‘ NO- BID
" STREET . R
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER - R3512 00200 01000 000 00
KEY

LOCATION ‘N OF BEATTY  '»' e ’ '“'f’V, o B
LEGRL DESCRIPTION The W2N2NE4$E4 of Sec 2, Twsp 35 ¢R'12VEWM, Kl. Co., OR.
ACREAGE - 10.00 , P A
SALE PRICE ,
SOLD TO ,DELETED

. 8TREET .. R
CITY, STATE ZIP




A_TAX LOT NUMBER ‘R3512 oo7oo 01300,000 oo
-KBY -
LOCATION - N oF BEATTY S : NI S :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The" 2282N28W4NE4 of Sec 7 Twsp 35 s, R 12; EWM, Kl1. Co., OR
ACREAGE "~ 5.00 , , ’ o ‘
SALE PRICE
- SOLD 'TO B NO BID
STREET ' ‘
CITY, STATE ZIP

. TAX LOT NUMBER R3512-013oo-ooaoo-ooo¢oo
- KEY AGAS S SRt
‘ LOCATION N OF BEATTY - B S ’ :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2S2NW4NE4 of Sec. 1 Twspv351$¢ R 12 EWM, Kl. Co., OR
ACREAGE 10.00 B T _ :
SALE ERICE : ©$3,875.000 .
SOLD TO . JELD-WEN, INC.,,v~ :
STREET .- P O BOX 2097 : :
CITY, STATE zxp KLAMATH FALLS OR" 97501

TAX LOT NUMBER R3512 O35AO 01900 000 00
KEY

'LOCATICHN : N OF BEATTY 1», ' : s
LEGAL DE&CRIDTION Lot 6, Block 6, Sprague Rlver Valley Acres
ACREAGE . 3.92 . .
SALE PRICE -

SOLD TO NO BID

STREET R ‘

CITY, STATE 2Ip.

.. TAX LOT NUMBER R3513-033B0-04100—000—OQ i
KEY " :
LOCATION NE OF BEATTY.. ‘ e
- LEGAL DnSCRIPTION Lot 12, Block 17, Flrst Addltlon To Ferguson Mountain Pines
'ACREAGE 1.51 sl : :
 'SALE PRICE-
. SOLD' TO e NG BID
STREET .
“LITY STATE ZIP

TAX-LOT NUMBER R3610 012A0 07400 000 00
KEY . .
-LOCATION & SPRAGUE RIVER o
LEGAL DFSCRIPTION Lot 22, Block 27 Fourth Additxon to Nlmrod Rlver Park
ACREAGE ; 1.51 o v
.SALE PRICE . -
,,"SOLD TO . NO BID S
$  STREET ‘
-_TCImY, STATB ZIP




IVTAX LOT NUMBER - f3R3610 014BB oosoo ooo oo, :
KEV-,’. . ) S . -
{ " LOCATION - - = SPRAGUE RIVER » SN Syt T
. LEGAL DWSCRIPTION Lots 6, 7 & tne N2 of Lot 8 Block 4, SpraguevRiver
. ACREAGE ~ I ] _ _ R
© SALE'PRICE. - I
¥80LD TO ;v-No BID
' STREET o
CITY, STATE ZIP

ffﬁx LOT;NUMBER‘ flR3610 014BB- 04300 ooo oo
KEY (o .

LOCATION *'fSPRAGUE RIVER .

: Lot 16, Block 6,kSprague Rlver

L 8175.000 0
L SOHN STURDEVANT e

~ J P C BOX 7577 &
,CITY,‘STATE ZIP;a vAn<suxs, ca. 91409

J TAX LOT NUMBER R3610 014BD 10300 000 00
XEY .- e i

" LOCATION . . 'SPRAGUE RIVER : ' ‘ R .
LEGAL DESPRIPTTON A tract of land Jn Gov't Lot 14 in the Nw4 of Sec 14, Twsp 36

28
-~ NO st.“

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611 OOlAO 02800 000 00

KEY. : ’

LOCATION ' SPRAGUE" RIVER e : : )

LEGAL: DESCRIPTION Lot 18, Block 64 Flfth Addltlon To Nlnrod Rlver Park
¥ ~1.86 : . .

NQ‘BID
"CITY, STATE ZIB

R3611‘ooino-oizoéyqqo-ooc

: SPRAGUE RIVER = . . = '

'LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 15, Block 65,.F1fth Add‘tlon To N*mrod Rlver Park
'ACREAGE . 1487 - ,

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO NO BID

STATE 2IP




 R361l 001DO 01500 000 00

~LOCATION

“LEGAL . DESCPLPTION
ACREACE :

. SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET o
CITY, STATE ZIP

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

- SALE PRICE
“SCLD “TO

 STREET :
cITy; STATE:ZIPi

“TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY -
LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

" ‘SALE PRICE

- SOLDL TO

STREET
CITY, STATE 21IP

TAX LOT NUMBER
 KEY
 LOCATION

o LEGAL D”SCRIPTION

- ACREAGE -

SALE PRICE.

. SOLD T0

- STREET .
CITY, STATE zzp

'TAX~LOT-NUMEER

KEY

- LOCATION = -
LEGAL DESCRIPTION,
" ACREAGE 3

- SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

~ STREET

© CITY, STATE 2IP

SPRAGUE RIVER S

Lot 12, Block 65,v?ifbh Additiqn*To:ﬁimx¢d'Riﬁér Park
1. 57 R B NI I AL

“NO BID '

R3611 00380 04600 000 00

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 4, Block 70' Flfth Additlon To Vzmrod Rlver Park
1 73 . ‘ . T

‘MO BID,

R3611 004C0 00200 000 00

SPRAGUE RIVER : ' e o

Lot 1, Block al Pourch Addltlon To Nlmzod Rlver Park
4.68 \ o

NO BID '

R3611-oosco-oésoo#doo;ool
SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 105 Block 31 Fourth Addltibn;TotNimrod River Park
1. 82 - B L

“‘No BID'

R3611-007A0- 01100 000 00

SPRAGUE RIVER

Lot 1, Block 74 Slxth Addltlon To Nimrod River Park
1.66 TR , ,

NO BID




' TAX ‘LoT NUMBBR

: JOCATIOV .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO .
STREET - .
CITY, STATE ZIP -

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION

LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET ,
CITY, STATE 2zIp

- TAX LOT NUMBER

. KEY

LOCATION

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION
'ACREAGE

' SALE PRICE

SOLD TO

STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

.TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY :
LocaTIOoN

LEGAL DESCRIDTIJN
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

"SOLD ‘TO

. BTREBET

CITY, STATE ZIp

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

LOCATION
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

-~ 8QLb 1T0..
STREET -

. CITY, STATE ZIp

'Raell oo7Ao—01zoo”ooc 00
SPRAGUE RIVER ==

Lot 2, Block 24 Third1AdditidﬁfTbﬁNihrbd'River'Park"
C1.500 : T T ’

NO BID

R3611 ~007A0~ 04400 000 OOv
SPRAGUE RIVER . LT

Lot 4, Block 1, First Addition'TofNimrod River Park
1.50 R S o

NO BID

R3611~ OO7B0 00400 000 00

SPRAGUE RIVER - ‘ S '

Lot 23, Block 24 Third Additlon To Nlmrod Rlver Park
1.50

NO BID

" R3611-007B0- 00600 OOO OO

SPRAGUE RIVER - T I
Lot 21, Block 24 Th*rd»Addition_To“Nimrod,River Park
1.75 R e

NO BID -

R5611 ~007B0- 04200 000 00

SPRAGUE RIVER : R

Lot 10, Block 2 erst Addltlon To Nlmrod River Park
~1.50 o
$2,000. OO

FRED KLOTZ

P O BOX 291

 SPRAGUE RIVER; o& 9#533,;*f




TAX LOT NUMBER "R3611 00730 04400 ooo oo
KEY : ,
LOCATION . SPRAGUE RIVWR -

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 2 Fifst Additlon To Nlmrod Rlver Park
ACREAGE IR 1.50

SALE PRICE :
SOLD TO ‘ NO BID
"STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3511-008Ao—04sddéoob4oc'f

TAX 500-000-00
LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER . ‘

. .LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 22, Block 78, Elghtk Addltlon To Nlmrod RlVer Park
| . 1.00

- NO BID

. CITY, STATE 2IP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611- OOBBO 00800 000 00
KEY :
LOCATION . SPRAGUE- RIVER : i B
_ -LEGAL DEQCRIPTION Lot 128, Block 31, Fourth Additlon t0 Nlmrod Rlver Park
"ACREAGE" - 2.36 ¢
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO - NO BID
- STREET o
CITY, STATE ZIP-

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611 OOQBO 02100 000 00
KEY '
LOCATION - .. SPRAGUE PIVER o R ’ .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12, Block 75, Seventh Addltlon to Nlmrod Rlver Park
ACREAGE -1, 91 v o o
SALE PRICE o
.. SOLD .TO NC BID
'STREET = S
VCITY STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUﬂBmR ' vR3611 -009B0~ 07100 000 0o
KEY :
LCCATION SPRAGUE RIVER/BEATTY

LEGAL DESC&IPTION Lot 11 Nlmrod Rlver Park togetner w1th a portlon of Lot 27 Jh
ACREAGE B : 5 :

 SALE. PRICE.

°_SOLD TO

. STREET - -
CITY, STATE ZIP




,TAx LOT NUMBER jt 35511 OIOAO 01400 ooo‘oo
KEY . : .
- LOCATICN' . ' ‘SPRAGUE RIVER o SR a '
“LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 11 Second Addltlon To Nlmrod Rlver Park
ACREAGE . . 1.59
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO" ... 'NO BID
STREET EEEEDS '
CITY, STATE-ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611 010A0 01900 000 00
KEY

LOCATION . SPRAGUE - RIVER S

LEGAL DESFPIPTION Lot 29, Block 11, Second Addltlon To Nlmrod River Park
- ACREAGE ST 1.52 ‘

SALE PRICE - ‘

‘SOLD TC R NO BID?

_STREET .
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-01030—02300-000f00

KEY. ‘

LCCATION SPRAGUE RIVER R :

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block 9 Second Addwtlon To Nlmrod Rlver Park
ACREAGE S 1.800 L U ,

'SALE PRICE - ‘

SOLD. TO ‘ NO BID

-STREET ) :

CITY, STATE‘ZIP

"TAX LOT HUMBER RoSll OIOBO 03400 000 00

KEY :

LOCATION ' SPRAUUE RIVER : '

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 23, Block 8, Second Pddltlon fo Nlmroa River Park'
ACREAGE , 1.52° : e

SALE PRICE )

:SOLD TO : NO BID

STREET o

CITY STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-010BO~ 03600 000 OO
- KEY :
. LCCATION K SPRAGUE RIVER o o '
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 21, Block 8 Second Addztlon To Nlmrod Rlver Park
. ACREAGE L 1 52
3 SALE PRICE
< SCLD TO NO BID
. STREBET -
CI”Y, STATE ZIP




‘ f;fpasli 01030 ossoo -00
. LOCATION . gprague’ RIVER ~ . B JEREL
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 2, Bleck 8, Second?Addition.TcJNimrod‘River Park
: B 1.52 S T TR
"NO BID'

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAZ LOT. NUMBER R3611- 010B0 06200 000 00
KEY

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER B Ll ' :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION A parcel of land sifuated in Gov't Lots 11 & 14, Twsp 36 S, R
“"ACREAGE 5, 91 o o ‘
-~ SALEPRICE ,
~'SOLD. TO ° NO BID
+ STREET - : -
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3611-010B0-06300- 000 00
" KEY
- LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER o e o :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION A parcel of land_situatedvin Gov't Lots 11 & 14 Twsp 36 S, R 1
ACREAGE . 5,56 LT L -
- SALE PRICE ‘ Lo
~80LD TO ' .+ NO. BID
STREET ° ' -
i*CI"Y STATE ZIp

R3611-011A0-00900-000-00

o SPRAGUE RIVER ST b e «

- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 14, Second_Addition\tnglmrddeiver Park
* ACREAGE 1.52. » Dy T ed Rives
'SALE PRICE . ,

'SOLD TO . NO BID

 STREET, :

‘CITY, STATE ZIP

- 'R3611- 01130 01700 000-00
~_ SPRAGUE RIVER | T L T :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 10, ‘Block 12; Second'Addition to Nimrod River Park
ACREAGE .52 T A LR
NO BID
cITy, STATE zrp




'R3611 01900 00100*

LOCATION | - SPRAGUE RIVER . -
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 18, Block 1 Tract No
- ACREAGE - 20.01
SALE PRICE =~ . ifa
S SsopTo No BID .
STREET = " ..
- CITY, STATE ZIP

MTAX‘LOT MUMBER‘ ' R3611 01900 oozoo ooo oo
KEY ‘

LOCATION SPRAGUE RIVER S
~LEGAL DESLR;P TION Lot 17, Block 1, Tract No
E 20.07.

NO BID
CITY, STA’I'B' ZIP

TAX ‘LOT NUMBEP 1 R3611 01900~ 01100 ooc 00
KEY :
" LOCATION . SPRAGUE RIVER ’ BT
- LEGAL DESCRIPWION Lot 15, Block 1 Tract ‘No. 1154.1~ﬁ~s
| ACREAGE " 23.30 . '
- SALE PRICE _
“-SOLD TO . W0 BiD
STREET S o
CITY, STATE ZIp -

. TAX LOT NUMBER "R3611 01900-01200~ ooo .00
KEY : ,
TOCATION' ~ - - SPRAGUE RIVER - .. SRR AP
LEGAL DESCRIFTION Lot 16, Block 1, Tract No. 1164
'ACREAGE 23.21 . ,
SALE PRICE - - $8,350.00 - :
SOLD TO. C." LAWRENCE & J. GRZ&SIAK
" STREET P O BOX 2097 -
'CITY, STATE 21p LEBANOV OR 97355

1 TAX LO" NUMBBR N R3611 01900- 01500 ooo oof‘.,
| ey )
LOCATION . SPRAGUE RIVER S
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 1, Tract ‘No.
. ACREAGE - - 20.11 -
SALE PRICE ‘
SOLD TO . NO BID
STREET .
- CITY, STATE 2ZIP




"TAX LOT NUMBER R3612 ooooo oosoo ooo oou-“
KEY ‘ L
LCCATION ‘ Nw OF BEATTY ‘ o ‘ '
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The E2E2NE4NE4 of Sec '5,. Twsp 36 s, R 12 EWM Kl. Co. OR
ACREAGE . 10.30 -
SALE - PRICE '
“SOLD TO NO. BID
STREET g
- CITY, STATE ZIp

. TAX LOT NUMBER Rsslz-ooooo—ooeoo-ooo-oo
© KEY - :

- LOCATION - KW OF  SPRAGUE RIVER S B . .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The E2E2SE4NE4 of . Sec. 5, Twsp 35 '8, R 12 EWM that lies N ofvt
"ACRBAGE - . 5.00 ' R

SALE PRICE

SOLD TO . 'NO BID

STREET = ‘

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3612-002A0-03500-000-00
LOCATION ‘ N OF BEATTY . : :
. . LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 10 Sprague Rlver Vall@y Aczes.:
. ACREAGE 1. 52:
SALE PRICE :
SOLD TO ‘ NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

'pTAX LOT NUMBER , R3612-02383-043007000—00
"KEY e " :

. LOCATION- N BEATTY. S '
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 3, B’Ock 9 Beatgy
ACREAGE » , .66

. SALE PRICE  ',’ $3,€600. 00 : ‘

.. SOLD TO .. FLOYD G. BAR”RAM

. “STREET — . P O BOX 97 S

‘ CITY STATE ”IP EEATTY OR. 97621'

TAX LOT NUMBER R3612- OJSDO 00900 000 00
.. KBY . 358428 ) , A
- LOCATION . - SE OF BEATTY ‘
JLEGRL DESCRIPTION The E2W2W2SE4. Of SAC. :5 Twsp 36 S, R 12 EWM, KL. Co., OR.
ACREAGE 20,00 SRR
SALE PRICE . $4,500,000 '-t-f
SOLD ' TO A LLOYD. & JOAN LIDTH w
STREET © 21047 DERSCH. RD T'ff“
,CITY STATE ZIP ..ANDERSON, CA 96007




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

. "33513 005B0- oo7oo ooo 00
- KEY o
'LOCATION NE OF BEATTY

LEGAL D?SCRIPTION Lot 3, Block 1 Ferguson Mountaln Plnes
ACREAGE . .3.98

"SALE PRICE - . o
soLD TO NO BID
STREET ,

CITY, STATE ZIP

~TAX LOT NUMBER R3613- OOSBO 03500 000 00

" KEY :

LOCATION NE OF BEATTY , : ‘ o
-LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 5, Block 4 Ferguson Mounualn Plnes o
ACRERGE 4. 02 : , - ; v
SALE PRICE

~8OLD . TO . ~ NO BID

'STREET.

CITY, STATE Z;P :

',TAX LoT NUMBER g R3613-OOSCO-01500%060f00’

NE OF BEATTY : : PP '
‘Lot '8, Block 7 Ferauson Mountaln Plnes'
‘2. 40 : - ST

NO BID

" CITY, STATE zxé

LTAX LOT NUMBER : R3613-005C0—01600;000-00

KEY ~ g : :

- LOCATION. T 'NE OF BEATTY : et .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 7, Block 7, Ferguson Mountaln Plnes

" ACREAGE : 2.39° S
SALE PRICE

- soLb TO . NO BID

" §TREET . - :

‘yCITY, STATE ZIP

‘TAX LOT NUMBER Q7613 005C0- 02500 000 00
KEY : .

- LOCATION ~ NE QF BEATTY ~' L o Lo e
*LEGAL DEaCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 8 Ferguson Moutaln Plnes
- ACREAGE : 2 27 - SR Sl
.- SALE PRICE '
SOLD TO - : ';.NovB:D




“TAX LOT'NUMBER_ R3613=oosco~o3zoo+ooo-00 X

Bl ER )-00.

~LOCATION * *. ' NE OF BEATTY o e DR
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 14, Block a Fergusonfmeuntainipines
ACREAGE 5.71 L
SALE FRICE ,

80LD.70 . . NO BID

- STREET ' ‘

'CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3613 OOGCO 02400 000 00
KEY
LOCATION - . NE OF BEATTY * - R RN
LEGAL D?SCRIPTION Let 24, Block 20 Sprague River: Valley Acres
. ACREAGE o 3.28 ¢ ' A . T
. SALE PRICE S
7~ 80LD TO- - - ;, ;NO.BI,D’ '
.STREET . Cee
icITY STATE ZIp

R3613 006D0 - 06500 000 00

. NE OF BEATTY L PR
LEGAL DBS“RIPTION Lot 7, Blook 23, Spragun River Va;leY,Acres

-ACREAGE 8. 36
SALE PRICE : ’
SOLD TO - NO BID.
STREET A o

. CITY, STATE ZIpP

v ;TAX LOT NUMBER "~ R3614- 00300 00600 000 00
- KEY

LOCATION - : N OF BLY' o . N A TR C
'LEGAL DESCRIPTION The S2S25W4SE4 of Se ; 3,;Twsp'3sys;aR114~EWM, Kl. Co., OR
ACREAGE: - 10.00 Co T A
SALE PRICE . $1,950.00 o
' 80LD TO ' LARRY D. OLSON
' STREET - ° " 31678 DOWD RD -
-CITY, STATE ZIP ST. HELENS, OR 97051

'TAx LOT'NUMBER ' ‘R3614 02900 00900 ooo 00
KEY »

LOCATION . N#W OF BLY . P AT R
:_LvGAL DESCRIPTION The N2N2Nn4<n4 of Sec,:zsr"Twsp13§ S: R 14.EWM, K1. Co., OR;VL.
ACR 5.04 T T .

_SAdL pwxcn .

SOLD'TO  NO BID

' STREET '
CITY, STATE zrp




m°f;R3614 034DB 01000-000-00

TOCATION CBLY & RN ' e : ‘
" LEGAL DESCRIPTION ‘The NW4SE4 of Sec 34 Twsp 3o s R 14 FWM Kl .Co., OR, more/
. ACREAGE L2 - :
" 'SALE PRICE S0 $1,000.00. :
80D TO - - ‘JERRY & JEANNA LEWIS
STREET . 2320 DARROW . ‘.
§ = CITY, STATE ZIP® KLAMATH FALLS,-oxy

. TAX LOT NUMBER R3614-034Dd-06606?0bb;oo.7"'
KEY Rl | o
LGCATION BLY - ‘

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 4 - 6 and rhe SEly 10'8" of Lot 14 and the Ly 34 of o

DELEIED_~‘
CITY, STATE zzp

; TAX‘L'T NUMBER*" Q3614 034DC 06500 000 OO
CKEY IR s
- LOCATION ’ BLY : : : S
- 'LEGAL. DESCRIPTION Lots 1e2z, Block 7 North B'Ly;
- ACREAGE

" BALE PRICE . - 81, 500 00

‘SOLD TO - ETHAN LOCKS L

STREET . - 323 RICHARDSON WAY s

CILY, SIATE ZIP MILL VALLEY, CA 94941

» TAX LOT NUMBER R3614-034DC-05600-000~00*
KBy | ]

LLOCATION . BLY . RS
. LEGRL DhSCPIPTLON Lot 3, Block 7, North Bly
- ACRERGE

" SALE PRICE © - $400.00"
/80LD TO ; " ETHAN LOCKS
STREET - 323 RICHARDSON wAY

. CITY STATE ZIP  MILL VALLEY CA 94941

~’TAX'LOT NUMBER R3710- oosoo 00300 ooo oo
CUKBY . B
"LOCATION , ‘B OF ALGOMA 5 :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION The N2NE4 of Gov't LOL 6 of Sec 5, Twsp 37 s ‘R 10 EWM, Kl;Jb
. ACREAGE 5.00 o . S .
SALE PRICE .
soLD TO . ND BID
'STREET T
,PITY, STATE zrp




TAX LOT NUMBBR ,‘p3710 oosoo oosoo ooo 0"
‘ LOCATION o OF ALGOMA [ PR ' .
LEGAL DESCR;PTION The wzszz & the N2 2w2 of Gov‘ Lot 6 of Sec. 5, Twsp 37 5, R
ACREAGE “7.50 ¢ : L e , C
. 8ALE PRICE j
sowy TO e 'NO BID
-STREET. . -~ R
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711- 01430 00100 ooo -00.
KEY ,
LOCATION = BLY MTN. i TR e ‘ o
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 13, Block 1;,Klamath Falls;Forest,Estatés'Hwy 66 Unit Plat
ACREAGE ‘ 2.10 R R o s :
SALE PRICE ' .. - . = - '
SOLD TO ~ NO BID
STREET . - '
. CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-014BO-01500#000;00

KEY ‘

LOCATION ‘ ELY MTN. ‘

LEGAL DESCRIPTIOh Lot 7, Block 75 Klamath Falls Forest Estates Hwy 66 Un:t Plat
ACREAGE 5.28 e , R P
- SALE PRICE 52, 650 00 . Gi

SOLR - TO - W.V.T. SERVICE, . INC. - -

STREET 63 CALLE INDUSTRIAS #544

CITY, STATE ZIP SAN CLEMENTE CA 92672 ‘

TAX‘LOT NUMBER? R3711- -014B0-~ 04500 000 -00
KEY

_LOCATION - BLY . NTN : ' L
~LEGAL DESCRLPTION’Lot 57, B]ock 79 Klamath Pal 8" Forest Estates Highway 66 Unlt x
- ACREAGE . 2.19 v .
SALE PRICE
SOLD TO . NO'BID
- STREET. :
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER ‘ R3711-014C0-02500-000~00

~ KEY ' -

LOCATICN. ~ BLY MTN ' o ‘
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 56, Block 79, Klamath Fal;s Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit -
 ACREAGE . 1.99 : : Lt g e : S
SALE PRICE .+ $1,850.00 ; o

“SOLD. TO .  W.V.T. SERVICE, INC. =

. STREET B 63 CALLE- INDUSTRIAS #544

- CITY, STATE ZIP. SAN CLEMEN”E CA 9"67”




_LOCATIOM :

‘LEGAL DESCPIPTION

'ACREAGE .

‘SALE PRICE

. SOLD TO

" STREET -
CITY, STATE zxy

TAX LOT NUMBER.
KEY - -

- LOCATION ~
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREAGE

SALE PRICE

S0LD .TO

STREET - o
CITY, STATE 2ZIP

. TAX LOT MUMBER

" KEY ,

. LOCATION »
LEGAL DESCRIPTION

ACREAGE

SALE PRICE -

SOLD TO

STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

 TAX LOT NUMBER
" KEY ‘
LOCATION :
LEGAL DESCRIPTION
ACREZGE |~ =
'SALE PRICE
(SOLD TO -

STREET

CITY, 'STATE z:p

TAX LOT NUMBBR
KEY _
LOCATION
'LEGAL DnSCRIPTIOV
ACREAGE .

SALE PRICE~
SOLD TO !
_STREET =
ey, STATE zxp

R3711 015A0 03100 000 00

BLY MIN : e Er Lo
Lot .3, Block 78, Ylamath Falls Foresr Estates nghway 66 Unltf'
2.859 '
$1,975.00 - .. o
W.v.T. SERVICE,~INC; PR
63 CALLE INDUSTEIAS: #544
SAN CLEMENTE, CA 92672

R3711;015304643dq990q€oqj”

BLY MIN ' ’ : .

Lot 15, Block. 78 KlamaCH Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unxt
3.75 v o , '
'$1,875.00° ' .

MARANNA - RESOURCE MANAGERS/BLY MTN RESOURCE GROUP, LLC
P O BOX 5091

‘KLAMATH ALLSiiOR 97601

R3711-01SDo-oo§ooéoooéoo

BLY MIN e R Lol _— , . T

Lot 67, Block 79, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit.
2.29° .” L Gian. el L . 0
81, 775 00 L h

W.V.T. SERVICE, INC. L

63. CALLE: INDUSTRIAS #544

SAN CLEMENTE, CA 92672

R3711-016A0102500:000«00
BLY MIN.

Lot 4, Block 7 Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 UnltJP.Q
.1.92 St A S ‘ P

DELETED

R37115017Ao40509§;000460;;’"

BLY MIN B ' L s
Lot &3,_Block 12 Klawath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66: bnlt
4.04 . : s ! BRI S .
52, 300 00 . L

ROBERT. V.,WE"HERN,L

7015 WIDGEOMN LN
'BONANZA, OR: 97623




Eden;m;Atic'r;on

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-oéono¥oésd6§ooqéob“

| BLY o : . S R : o
LEGAL- DESCRIPTION Lot 42 Block 15, Klamath Falls Forest Estates'ﬁlghway 66 Unit
: v 2.29 :
. $1,475. 00
CW.V.T. SERVICE,'INC. ,'v
63 CALLE INDUSTRIAS #544
CITY, STATE ZI1P .- SAN CLEMENTE, CA 92572

]

R3711-ozono-oévoorooo7bd

BLY MIN ) L ) : :

Lot 43, Block 15, Klamath Falls Forest Estates H;ghway 66 Unltvf
2.29 . S

' §2,000.00 &

W.V.T. SERVICE, INC. g

63 CALLE INDUSTRIAS #544

SAN CLEMENTE, CA' 92672 .

" TAX 10T NUMBﬂR ~ R3711-021A0-01100-000-00 -
" LOCATION BLY MTN R ST RS
_ LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 59, Block 12, Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unit
. ACREAGE » 3.96 RS A IR R N B L
. SALE PRICE $1,350.00 '

SOLD TO _ W.V.T. SERVICE, INC. :

'STREET . . 63 CALLE INDUSTRIAS #544

fCITY, GTATE ZIP  SAN CLEMENTE, CA 92672

TAY LOT NUMBER R3711~021BO-00200—000-00

-LOCA "TON BLY MIN ' ’ S L
‘LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 66, Block 12, Klamath Falls Forest hstates nghway 66 Unltt
ACREAGE ' 16.19: SRR e D . :

“SALE PRICE S 83, 100 00 -

SOLD TO - jj,‘i' ROBERT V.- WEfHERN, SR. _

-STREET o 7015 WIDGEON LN f:' SRR

,CITY, STATE ZIP - BONANZA, OR 97623 5 ‘x

STAX LOT NUMBER R3711-022D0~03000-000f00j

XEY DUMRTEEY :

- LOCATION BLY MIN I PR E
- LEGAL" DESCRIPTION Lot 20, Block 92 Klamath Falla Foreat Estates Highway 66 Unit:
 ACREAGE .19 S e ‘j D R
- SALE 'PRICE $1 350.00 = ’ :
 8OLD “TO . - 'MARANNA RESOURCE MANAGERS/BLY MTN REQOURCE GROUP LLC

STREET . .. P O BOX 509%L - 0
© CITY, STATE 2ZIP KLAMAiH FALLS OR 97601




, TAX LOT NUMBEF R3711 023co 01100 ooo oo
- KBY: : : i
LOCATION ~ ° = BLY MTN : ' G
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 44, Block 91 Klamath Falls Foreat Estates nghway 66 Unlt
ACREAGE ‘ 2.73 , _
SALE PRICE ‘ '
SOLD TO 4 NO BID
STREET ,
- CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711-023C0e01200f000-00__
- KBY , ' ’ A RO

LOCATION : BLY MIN S el . SRR
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION ‘Lot 43, Block 91 Klamath.Falls;Forést,Estates Highway 66 Unit

ACREAGE S4.18 0 ¢ e T T Co Coe

SALE PRICE ; 3

SOLD 10 . - ) NO BID -

STREET : ﬁ

CITY, STATE ZIP

. TAX LOT NUMBER R3711- 026D0 03300- 000~ 00

" KEY

'LOCATION _ BLY MTN i : ' ’ I,
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12, B‘ock 103 Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Un1
ACREAGE 2.79 L Lt

SALE PRICE $1,575.00 '

3S0LD TO . MARANNA - RESOUR”E MALAGERS/BLI MTV RFSOURCE GROUP bLC

STREET . L P- 0. BOX 5091" -

CITY, STATE 2ZIP  KLAMATH FALLS OR 97601

TAx LOT NUMBER R3711-028A0-01200-000f00 ;
 Key o v b T
LOCATION - ‘BLY MTN s u ' o
LEGAL DESCRIPTION ‘Lot . 36, Block 21 Klamatn Falls Forest Estates nghway 65 Unlt
ACREARGE - . - 2.30 e L , ,
SALE PRICE -"/, $1,375.00 - ~:M-
SOLD TC ,i;'. . W.V.T. 'SERVICE," INC. g
‘STREET o 63 CALLE INDUSTRIAS #544
. CITY, STATE ZI? SAN CLEMENTE, CA,_92672 »‘

TAX LOT NUMBER R3711- OZBAO 01500 000 00

KEY

LOCATION : BLY MIN - ' ‘

LEGAL DnSCR;PTION Lot 37, Block 21 Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Unlt
ACREAGE S - 2.307 R S

" SALE- PR;CE. o 81, 375 00 G PR

“80LD .TO. " . WV, T, SERVICE, INC.A 5

STREET. - .. . 83 CALLE INDUSTPIAS #544

CITY, -STATE ZIP  SAN CLEMENTE, CA. 92672




I'TA& LOL NUMBER S R3711 033D0 004 0= OOOxOO
KEY o : IR

LOCATION " - ' BLY MTN. , T TI E E SR

LEGAL DESCRIPTIOV Lot 4, Block 63 lamath’Falle,goreSchstate Highway 66 Unityp
~ ACREAGE 8.56 - Lo SR s O ' v ,

' SALE PRICE - .

SOLD TO "~ NO BID

STREET ' ’ v

,CITY STATE. ZIP

TAX 1LOT NUMBER‘ R3711- 034C0 00600 000 00
KEY

LOCATION h BLY MTN '
LEGAL. DESCRIPTION Lot 8, Block 64 Klamath Falls Forest Estatp nghway 66 Unlt/Pﬂ
ACREAGE 1.57 . S ,
SALE PRICE - $1,750. 00~ SN
SOLD TO o BILL MIDDLEBRGOKS
' STREET Lo P O BOX 95 b

CITY, STATE ZIP -MERRILL OR 9763°

TAX LOT NUMBER ‘R3711- -035A0- 01300 000 00
KEY
- LOCATION BLY MTN ' B A S N .
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 20, Block' 104 Klamath Falls Forest Estate Highway 66 Unit
ACREAGE » 2.20 EERE B :
-~ SALE PRICE"
" SOLD TO NO BID
STREET : .
CITY,;STATE‘ZIP:

' TAX LOT NUMBER _ 23711eo3sno;002do§600400f

, LOCPrIOV Av ‘ BLY MIN e e : o
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 27, Block 108 Klamath Falls Fo*est Estate nghway 60 Unlt'
ACRERGE 2.38 . S
SALE. PRICE - = $2,200.00 ‘v""
sOLD TO . W,V.T. SERVICE, INC.
- STREET -~ - 63 CALLE. INDUSTRIAS #544 .
B CITY, STATE ZIP SAN CLEMENTE CA 92672 j:a'

TAX LOT NUMBER R3715-013D0-0080030Q0§0Q
KEY
LOCATION ' SE OF BLY n
-LEGAL DESCRIPTION The E2NW4SW4SE4 of Sec 13, Twsp 37 S, R 15 EWM, K1.
. ACREAGE - 5.00 IS o !
© “SALE PRICE $2, 000 00 3y f
- SOLD TO i ; : '
. STREET : §
. CITY, STATE ZIP MERLIN OR 97532




SOLD;AT.AUQTIQn;

: TAX LOT NUMBER R3809 019AD 07600 ooo oo sfﬁi
KEY ; :
LOCATION o KLAMATh PALLS T o o
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lots 1 & 2, Block 28 Chelsea Add:tion to Klamath Falls, OR
" ACRERGE. P : ; L
SALE PRICE - $1, 100 00
" 80LD TO- ~ BNTONIO & SARA COBIAN
STREET .3402 .LINDBERG ST " -
CITY, STATB 2IP  KLAMATH FALLS OR 97601\

TAX LOT NUMBER R3809 OBZBC 00300 000 00

KEY

LOCATION - KLAMATH FALLS R T T SRR
LEGAL DESCRIPTION A parcel of land 1y1ng in Lot" 3 BlOck4103,~Buena vistavAdditi’
ACREAGE o _ ) R o L

SALE PRICE e

sSOLD TO : NO BID

STREET '

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3809-OBZBC-004005000—00'
. KEY - :
. LOCATION . KLAMATH FALLS De ' K

LEGAL DESCRIPTION parcel of lard l,ing in Lot 4 Block 103, ‘Buena VistayAdditi -
 ACREAGE : A
' SALE PRICE -

SOLD TO -

STREET ,
_.CITY, STATE Z1P

TAX LOT NUMBER R3809—03208-013004000-00
KBV > ,

LOLATION KLAMATH FALLS S R L ' L )
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 1 and Lhe le 5' of'Loti2.“Block 7, Riverside Additien
' ACREAGE S e :
" SALE PRICE . 58, 100 00 :

SOLD. TO - -PAUL & JUANITA FAIRCLO

STREET. . 6422 HILYARD - N

‘CITY, STATE ZIP KLAMA H FALLS, ORf 97603 

TAX LOT NUMBER jR3809 033AC 05000 000 00
KEY i .
vLDCATIOh< ' KLAMAld FALLS SRR
-LEGAL DESCRIDTION Lot 398, Block 110 Mllla Addltlon
. ACRERGE o . .
- SALE PRICE . .. . $3 725 00
SOLD TO: EEE e e
STREET = i 3815 THICKET Cr o
CITY, STATE ZIP - KLAMATH FALLS OR 97601




| Tax LOT NUMBER u»,Rasoq 033BA 13200", -0
"LOCATION. =~ = = . KLAMATH FALLS

' LEGAL DES"RIPTION Lot €, Block 11, industrlal Addltton :
- ACREAGE

SALE- PRICE . “ $1 000. 00 B

SOLD. TO - . ROBERT & PATTY GREGCRY
STREET .+ . 303-8. ELDORADO.AVE
CITY, STATE ZiP KLAMATH FALLS, OR 97601

TAX LOT NUMBER Raao9-osase-osbooeoob-oo
KEY :
LOCATION KLAMATH FALLS

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 12 C, Block 4, Supplemental Plat of Railroad Addition to t
ACREAGE

“SALE PRICE - ‘ .
SOLD TO NO BID

 STREET

CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3809-033BB-031b09000-oo

KEY R , .
'LOCATION" KLAMATH FALLS

LEGAL DESCRIPTIO? Lots 11C, 11B, 12A, 12B & 12D, Block 4 Supplemental Plat ofJR

ACREAGE -

" SALE-PRICE
SOLD TO NO BID
STREET
CITY, STATE ZIP

TEX LOT NUMBER R3809-03353-039005000-oo_‘
KEY R
. LOCATION : KLAMATH FALLS L R T
- LEGAL DESCRIPTION The le 80" of Lot 25 nﬂ.the‘N1Y3807>of<thevE2 of Lot 26,VBlo
" ACREAGE - , BT e D A R
¥ SALE PRICE S s
7SOLD TO . NO BID
STREET - L
u“cxrv; STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811—002AOF05400—000-00
KEY . o ‘
LOCATION - .- BLY MIN : o ' B L I Ry
LEGAL DESCRIDTION Lot .3, Block 126 Klamatn Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unlt
"ACREAGE . . 1. 52 e ,
v,-SALE DPICE L £ 750,00
- 8CLD TO : '
-~ STREET g il SRS
,.cxrx, STATE ZIp ~ PORTLAND, OR 97220 EEE I




- R3811 OOZAO 05500 000,00

.. BLY MIN e o ' ' :
{"LEGAL DhSCRI TION Lot 2, BIOC{ 126 Klamatn Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Uni6
CACREAGE ~ . 3 34" v : ,
SALE 'PRICE Lo $2,000. 00 . . : .
" SOLD T0O R W.v.T. SERVICE INC Lo
8TREET 63" CALLE" INDUSTRIAS #544 -
fCITY STA”E ZIP SAN CLEMENTE ‘CA 92672 )

TAX LOT NUMBER Rssll-oq4Ao—o4oco4oqo4oo'
v v 4

LOCATION BLY MTN ' ' i
LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 34 Klamath Fulls Forest Estates Hlahway 66 UnltJ'
ACREAGE 2.21 : L i :
- SALE PRICE o $§2,775., 00 : ‘~*1 T
© SOLD- TO o ROBERT V. WETHERN ~8R.-
. STREET - 70185 WTDGEON LN -
- CITY, STATE ZIP BONANZA OR 9/623

TAX 107 NUMBV? R3811;60450-025669000~oo
b £300-C
LOCATION - BLY MTN .

LEGAIL DESCRIPT;ON Lﬂt 10, Block 32 Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unlt‘"

ACREAGE 1.49 A
SALE PRICE $3,000.00. .
,SOLD TO  ALLEN & ARLENE DEAMARAL
' STREET . P O BOX 366 = . .
erry, STATF ZIP  BONANZA, OR 97523

V‘TEK LOT NUMBER R3811- OOBDO 00400 -000- 00
‘KEY

-LOCAfION : BLY MTN . - : ﬁu, P R PRI B
-~ LEGAL. DEQCRIPTION Lot 19, Block 39 Klamath’Falls.Foresc Estates Highway 66 Unit
ACRERGE v 2.26. P e s s e : el
SALE" PRICE f}'f" $2,000.00 o

. 80LD TO - S DANNY .ALLEN

" STREET: : ) 6054 BRANT DR e

,CITY STATn ZIP ‘_BONANZA, OR ]97623

'TAx 0T NUMBER ' 53811 OllBO 00500 000 00

KEY . ) , _—

LOCATICN ’ BLY MIN - . . it T :
- LEGAL DE¢CRIPTION Lot 28, Block 117 Klamauh Falls ﬂorest Bstates Highway 66 Unl'
ACREAGE 2:37. - L — ‘

SALRE PRICE : $1,875. 00 i
. SOLD /TO - . . . W.V.T. SERVICE, ‘INC. RS
- STREET. - A 63 CALLE- INDUSTRIAS #544

Y, STATE 2IP ' SAN CLEMENTE, .CA' 92672




, R3811 01400 02400 -000- 00
- KEY s - g :
- LOCATION | = BLY MIN ' 5 ‘ - Lo ‘
- "LEGAL DESCRIPTTON Lot 40, Block 50 Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Unlt
ACREAGE 30 . [P S
-SALE PRICE “
SOLD TO , - NO EID\L
STREET ‘ o
CITY, STATE zrp

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811 OlSAO 02400 000 00

KEY

LOCATION . BLY MTN : '

LEGAL DEoCQIPTION Lot 11, Blo»y 4J, Klamath Falls Forest Estates nghway 66 Unlt

ACRERGE 2.30. o . o } ) ’
. SALE PRICE . - 52, 100,00 " g 'j';f
_8CLD TO o ROBERT. V., WETHERN SR. i
" STREET . 7015 WIDGEON LN :

CITY, STATE ZIP - BONBANZA, OR ‘97623

TAX 1LOT NUMEER R5811 015D0 06000 000 00
KEY
uOCATION ' : .BLY MTR ’ o l
LEGAL DESCRIPTTON ‘Lot 3, BlocP 57 Klamach Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 Unity.
ACREARGE . L 5.42 o o AT - : .
* S8ALE PRICE 8L, 350. 00
SQLD TO - . JERRY SAVAOE
STREET . Y. 3939.8. 6TH. ST '
o CITY, STPTE ZIP \MAAATh FALLS OR 97603

TAX LOT NUMBER R3811-017A0- 02900 000 00
KEY: R :
LCCATION . ) BLY MTN S
LEGAL DnSCRIPTION ‘Lot 16, Block 40 Klamath Falls Forest Estates Highway 66 . Unlt
ACREAGE: - 7 8.72 - o
. SALE PRICE : $2 825.60
sOLb TO - BILL MIDDLhBROOKS
STREET : ) P O0.BOX 95 T
‘CITY, STATE‘ZIP MERRILL OR 97633

TAX LOT . NUMBER - R3908- o3snc 02100 ooo oo '
- KBY. - & . . . )
LOCATION. .. ~ MIDLAND. -~ .~ .

. LEGAL DESCRIPTIQN Lot 3,:Blogkq12

~ACREAGE - - -
'SALE PRICE.  $1,000.00 S
/SOLD'TO -~ . DOUGLAS Q. CLEMENT. e
 STREET . 1759 CARLSON:DR. " = - . ..
- CITY, STATD zzp 'KLAMATH ?ALL» OR 97603

,‘,




SOLD.AT.AUCTION

7,R°909 u12CA-05500 ooo 00"

*LEGAL DESCRIPTION
"ACREAGE
"SALE PRICE-
'SOLD 10
_STREET =~ -
CITY, STATE ZIP

TAX LOT NUMBER
KEY

. LOCATION
LEGAL DBSCRIPTION
ACREAGE

“SALE PRICE

¥, STATE Z1P

| TAX LOT WUMBER

LOCATION

LECAL DRSCRIPTION.
'ACREAGE -
~ SALE PRICE

‘CITY, S?ATE zip

 KLAMATE FALLS S P S | k
The SH 2" of Lot 14, Block 12, Eighth Addition to SunsetyVilla

,.vno‘BID"

'23911-01dca-014oof000—¢0

 BONANZA . : ‘ e
uots 9 - 12, Block,§3 Grandv1ew Addl 1¢n”

;-,000 09 -'.:'
LOUISE E. HAGERMAN
9143 SHADY PINE RD

KLAMATH FALLS, CR 97601

' 33911—01900;008ddfooo-oo‘

BONANZA RSN L L T
A tract of land situated*in~the E2 of Sec., 19, Twsp 39 S, R.11
5.01 : , ' S TR I '

 $8,175.00

C. LAWRENCE & I, GRZBGLAK

P O BOX 2097
LEBANON, OR:’ 9"355

 R3913-00200-00200- ooo 00
',114628

" GERBER RESERVOIR "

Tne West 330" of the Fast 495' of Gov't?Létﬂllof Sec. 2,'Twsp] _
110.02 R : v e T

. $5,000.00 "~
'RUSSELL & JAN;CE LERVITT

53920 GERBER ‘ROAD.:

_BONANZA, oR 97523

;Ras;s 02400 01200 ooo oo o

;fLEGAL DESCRIPTION
., ACREARGE =
“:SALE. PRICE

L E OF GERBER RESERVOIR

The N2N2SW4SW4 Of Sec. 24 Twsp 39: s, R 15 ‘VM?“




: ",Rwoa oasnA--oo3oo -000= oo#;v_;_

TOCATION * - '* WORDEN e
LEGAL DESCRIPT ION Lot ‘8, Blor-k 21 Worden et

9400 00 T

DAVID G.. ERUHER

. : 2414 WESTERN  ST.
,CIT" STAT‘-" Z P ;KLAMATH FALLS OR 97603‘

TAY 10T NUMBER --‘moos nsqsn 01200 ooo oo
LOCATION: - HORDEN L

LEGAL DESCRIPTION Lot 4, Block 50 Wc‘den

' ACREAGE _

" SALE PRICE - . ssoo 00 - bieu

| S0LD TO . CLAUDE &. KART NELSON g

" STREET o 19730 KENO WORDEN RD-“'. . .-
CITY, STATE zxp KLAMATH. FAL LS, OR " '97603 ' ' -

TAX LOT NU‘MBER . R4107 01600 00800 300 00"
- KEY : s
-LOCATION o HAMAKER M'I’N : Y e
LEGAL DE.:L.RIPTION The W2 of C'ov't Lot 2 of Sec. 16" 1Twsp 41 S R 77 EWM,
ACREAGE & . : 10,67 Sl ‘
" SALE PRICE - .$2,250.00 "
. SOLD TO .. ‘JELD-WEN, INC. ,
'-VVSTREET ~ . P OTBOX 2097 : T e
3 ~I'I*k S'I‘A’IE ZIP KI.:AMATH PALLS OR c3'7::0:!. ey

- STATEOF omsson COUNTY OF KLAMATH :

Filed fo rrecord atrequcst of. KLAMATH (‘OU‘NT'). : S the . 18TH
of Jung AD,1998  at. 2:36 . “o'clock__ P _ M and duly recorded in Vol. ___498
: o Lo : G Lclsch. County Clerk

- FEE‘ ;NQNE ?HF 1'/ﬂ :J‘m” ,_?:vf;‘jﬁ; ;x ’é¥?




