KLAMATH COUNTY SHERIFF’S OF F ICE

.
Timothy M. Evinger, Sheriff

3300 Vandenberg Road 2 9 1 4 7
Klamath Falls, OR 97603 Vgt _MQ1__Pege__—___~

June 18, 2001

01 JUN 19 a43:24

ne

Sheriff's Return of Sale

The parcels listed in the attached addendum were put up for sale at public auction held at
the Klamath County Courthouse Public meeting room, located at 316 Main Street,
Klamath Falls, Oregon 97601 on June 7, 2001 at 10:00am.

The total revenue for the sale amounted to § 281,000.00. Total recording fees collected
was $1,995.00.

Timothy M. Evinger
Sheniff

%@@5

Rebecca Dailey
Civil/Records Supervisor

After recording return to:
Property Sales Dept.

e
Phone: (541) 883-5130 + Fax: (541) 883-4271




Sheriff Report 06/07/01

29148

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2309-001C0-04000
Lt 13, Blk 8, Wagon Trail Acr No. 1, 2nd Addn
1

$0.00
NOBID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2309-001C0-06400

Lt 25, Blk 6, Wagon Trail Acr #1 2nd Addn
1

$0.00

NO BID

MTL
MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2309-013C0-05900
M-120474

Lt 11, Blk 17, 2nd Addn to River Pines Est. Together with a 1971

Sahara, Serial #83645151848
1.09

$16,000.00

Newton, Bradley J. & Maci D.
P O Box 1644

L.a Pine, OR 97739

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2310-016A0:01600

Lt 13, Blk 1, New Pine Acres
1.71

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29149

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2310-036D0-12100

Lt 4, Blk 13, Sun Forest Est

1

$2,050.00

Bowden, Donald T. & Alice M. & Plance, Glenn E.
P O Box 553

La Pine, OR 97739

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2407-007B0-01300

Lt 12, Blk 1, Leisure Woods - Tract 1074
1.79

$4,000.00

Briery, Ronald D. & Sandra K.

1587 Bigham-Brown Rd
Eagle Point, OR 97524

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2607-001A0-11300

Lt 4, Blk 10, Tract No. 1042 Two Rivers North
1.03

$2,250.00

Householder, Ron & April

68211 Hwy 20 W

Bend, OR 97701

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

Ciy, State Zip

R-2607-001A0-11400

Lt 3, Blk 10, Tract No. 1042 Two Rivers North
1.02

$2,250.00

Householder, Ron & April

68211 Hwy 20 W

Bend, OR 97701

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-2607-001D0-04000

Lt 8, Blk 1, Tract No. 1069
1.01

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29150

MTL R-2607-001D0-05700
Legal Description 1t 10, Blk 3, Tract No. 1069
Acreage 1

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-2808-020B0-03000

Legal Description The N% of the following desc real property located in the SW
NWY of Sec 20, T 28 S, R 8 EWM, being more particularly desc as
follows: Baap on the SEly r/w bndry of the Dalles-California Hwy
in the SW% NW'4 of Sec 20, T 28 S, R 8 EWM, which point of

begin
Acreage 0.08
Amount Paid $1,400.00
Sold To Calkins, Tal Bert
Street HC 30 Box 124

City, State Zip Chemult, OR 97731

MTL R-2808-020B0-03100

Legal Description A portion of the W'z NWY of Sec. 20, T 28 S, R 8 EWM, Kl Co,
OR being more particularly desc as follows: Baap on the Ely v/'w
line of the Dalles-California Hwy, which point bears S along the
Sec line, 1667.8', and E, 491.6' from the Sec cor common to Secs

Acreage 0.32
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street

City, State Zip

Monday, June 18, 2001 ) Page 3 of 39




29151

MTL R-2808-020B0-03200

Legal Description A portion of the W/2NWY; of Sec. 20, T 28 S, R 8 EWM, Kl. Co.,
OR, more particularly desc as follows: Baap on the Ely r/w line of
the Dalles-California Hwy, which point is S along the section line,
1667.8' and E 491.6' from the section corner common to Sec

Acreage 0.3
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street

Ciry, State Zip

MTL R-2808-020B0-03700

MTL R-2808-020B0-03300

Legal Description A portion of the W' of the NW' of Sec 20, T 28 §, R 8 EWM, Kl
Co, OR, desc as follows: Baap on the Ely r/w line of the Dalles-
California Hwy, which point bears S along the section line 1667.8'
and E, 491.6', from the sec.cor common to Secs 17, 18, 19 & 2

Acreage 0.82
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3307-01800-01200

Legal Description The WY.SWYSEYSEY: of Sec. 18, T 33 §, R 7 EWM, Kl. Co., OR.
Acreage 5

Amount Paid $3,500.00

Sold To Whiskey Creek Timber Co, an Oregon Corp

Street 4764 Glenwood Dr

City, State Zip KFalls, OR 97603

MTL R-3307-01800-01300

Legal Description The E2.SWYSESEYs of Sec. 18, T 33 S, R 7 EWM, Kl. Co., OR
Acreage 5

Amount Paid $3,500.00

Sold To Whiskey Creek Timber Co, an Oregon Corp

Street 4764 Glenwood Dr

City, State Zip  KFalls, OR 97603

Monday, June 18, 2001 ’ Page 4 of 39




29152

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3313-01300-03100

The N 415' of the E 1000’ of Lt 18, Blk 18, KFFE Sycan Unit
9.53

$3,050.00

Sinkewitsch, Nicholas M

P O Box 457

Bonanza, OR 97623

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3407-34DB-3200-0U2

An undivided % interest in Lt 6, Blk 3, 2nd Addn to Chiloquin
0.13

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3413-021C0-00700

The Sz SEY. NWY4 SW% of Sec 21, T34 S, R 13 EWM, K1 Co, OR
5

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Seld To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-003AA-04900
Lts 15 & 16, Block 5, Chiloquin Drive Addn
0.23

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-003AB-07000

Lt 17, Ponderosa Park
0.11

$1,850.00

Severin, James M.
36358 Modoc Point Rd
Chiloquin, OR 97624

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29153

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-003AB-07100

Lt 18, Ponderosa Park
0.11

$1,850.00

Severin, James M.
36358 Modoc Point Rd
Chiloquin, OR 97624

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-006DA-04900

Lt 18, Blk 16, Tract 1053 - Oregon Shores
0.25

$2,750.00

Spring Creek Properties, Inc.

36941 S Chiloquin RD

Chiloquin, OR 97624

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-007CD-08200

Lt 18, Blk 6, Latakomie Shores
0.26

$4,000.00

Souza, Pixie Marie

33707 Witam Bluff

Chiloquin, OR 97624

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-017BB-06000

Lt 21, Blk 37, Tract 1184 - Oregon Shores - Unit 2 = 1st Addn
1.16

$5,000.00

Spring Creek Properties, Inc.

36941 S Chiloquin RD

Chiloquin, OR 97624

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3507-018DA-09200
Lt 60, Blk 28, Tract 1113 - Oregon Shores - Unit 2

$4,250.00

Spring Creek Properties, Inc.
36941 S Chiloquin RD
Chiloquin, OR 97624

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29154

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3509-014A0-02900
Lt 9, Blk 4, Lone Pine On The Sprague
0.96

$2,000.00
Walker, Roger J. & Shirley M.

204 Peach St
Klamath Falls, OR 97601

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-014C0-01000

Lt 51, Blk 16, Klamath Forest Est
2.89

$2,050.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-014C0-03000

Lt 21, Blk 16, Klamath Forest Est
2.73

$1,100.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-014D0-00200

Lt 16, Blk 22, Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$1,000.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-015C0-00400

Lt 30, Blk 5, Klamath Forest Est
5.09

$1,800.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29155

MTL R-3510-01900-01700

Legal Description The SWY4 SEV4 SEY4 NWY, and the W' EY2 NE% SW4 lying N of
Sprague Rvr Hwy in Sec 19, T 35 S, R 10 EWM, K1 Co, OR

Acreage 7.91

Amount Paid $8,000.00

Sold To Jackson, James C. & Barney, Teresa D.
Street P O Box 211

City, State Zip Corbett, OR 97019

MTL R-3510-022B0-00500

Legal Description Lt 22, Blk 6, Klamath Forest Est
Acreage 4.94

Amount Paid $3,150.00

Sold To Mullen-Feeley, Jill

Street P O Box 7827

City, State Zip KFalls, OR 97602

MTL R-3510-022B0-04100

Legal Description Lt 16, Blk 9, Klamath Forest Est
Acreage 2.38

Amount Paid $2,800.00

Sold To Michael E. Long, Inc.

Street 21065 NW Kay Rd

City, State Zip North Plains, OR 97133

MTL R-3510-023A0-04800

Legal Description 1.t 40, Blk 14, Klamath Forest Est
Acreage 2.38

Amount Paid $1,500.00

Sold To Samango, Alfred

Street P O Box 700

City, State Zip Haleiwa, HI 96712

Monday, June 18, 2001 ' Page 8 of 39




29156

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-023B0-02100

Lt 31, Blk 15, Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$1,600.00

Grace, Margaret

P O Box 63

Sprague River, OR 97639

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-023C0-02800

Lt 34, Blk 26, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.37

$1,550.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-026B0-00200
Lt 12, Blk 32, Ist Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$1,500.00
Realvest, Inec.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Seld To

Street
City,"State’Zip

R-3510-026B0-03500

Lt 19, Blk 37, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$1,600.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-026B0-05300

Lt 1, Blk 41, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
3.06

$1,500.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29157

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3510-026C0-00900
Lt 7, Blk 40, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.76

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-026C0-04400

Lt 18, Blk 47, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$2,750.00

Michael E. Long, Inc.

21065 NW Kay Rd

North Plains, OR 97133

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-026D0-01400

Lt 19, Blk 39, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
3.07

$1,600.00

Umbarger, Charles H.

38745 26th StE

Palmdale, CA 93550

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-027A0-02800

Lt 6, Blk 36, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$1,900.00

Werdeman, Richard E. & Werdeman, Steven A.
P O Box 321

Sprague River, OR 97639

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-027B0-01300

Lt 22, Blk 33, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$3,500.00

Michael E. Long, Inc.

21065 NW Kay Rd

North Plains, OR 97133

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29158

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-027D0-00200

Lt 38, Blk 41, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
4.48

$2,000.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-027D0-04600

Lt 3, Blk 46, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$2,200.00

Michael E. Long, Inc.

21065 NW Kay Rd

North Plains, OR 97133

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-028A0-03000

Lt 6, Blk 35, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$2,500.00

Grace, Margaret

P O Box 63

Sprague River, OR 97639

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-034B0-00100

Lt 11, Blk 51, 1st Addn to Klamath Forest Est
2.38

$2,400.00

Michael E. Long, Inc.

21065 NW Kay Rd

North Plains, OR. 97133

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3510-035B0-02800

Lt 14, Blk 1, Juniper Acres

4.82

$3,250.00

Realvest, Inc.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29159

MTL R-3510-035B0-03700
Legal Description Lt 7, Blk 2, Juniper Acres
Acreage 3.81

Amount Paid $2,275.00

Sold To DesPois, Gary & Penne
Street P O Box 32

City, State Zip Sprague River, OR 97639
MTL R-3510-035C0-00500
Legal Description Lt 17, Blk 2, Juniper Acres
Acreage 3.57

Amount Paid $3,500.00

Sold To Realvest, Inc.

Street % Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
City, State Zip Hanover, NM 88041

MTL R-3511-009D0-04100
Legal Description Lt 12, Blk 8, Oregon Pines
Acreage 1.51

Amount Paid $925.00

Sold To Samango, Alfred

Street P O Box 700

City, State Zip Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL - R-3511-01000-00200
Legal Description  The N2 NWYs NEVY4 of Sec 10, T35 8, R 11 EWM, K1 Co, OR
Acreage - 20

Amount Paid $4,950.00

Seld To Seized Properties

Street P O Box 431

City, State Zip Mira Loma, CA 91752
MTL R-3511-010C0-01200
Legal Description Lt 11, Blk 10, Oregon Pines
Acreage 1.52

Amount Paid $1,200.00

Sold To Samango, Alfred

Street P O Box 700

City, State Zip Haleiwa, HI 96712

Monday, June 18, 2001 ' Page 12 of 39




29160

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-010C0-03300

Lt 4, Blk 14, Oregon Pines
1.64

$1,100.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700
Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Soid To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-011C0-05500

Lt 22, Blk 30, Oregon Pines
1.59

$1,000.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-011C0-05600

Lt 23, Blk 30, Oregon Pines
1.6

$1,000.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-011C0-05700
Lt 24, Blk 30, Oregon Pines
1.55

$1,025.00
Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700
Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-011C0-05800

Lt 25, Blk 30, Oregon Pines
1.67

$1,025.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

Monday, June 18, 2001
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23161

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-011D0-00900

Lt 16, Blk 29, Oregon Pines
1.5

$1,000.00

Umbarger, Charles H.
38745 26th St E

Palmdale, CA 93550

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-013A0-00700

Lt 10, Blk 45, Oregon Pines
1.51

$1,025.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-013A0-00800

Lt 9, Blk 45, Oregon Pines
1.5

$1,025.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, StateZip

R-3511-013B0-01900

Lt 18, Blk 47, Oregon Pines
1.59

$925.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-013B0-02000

Lt 19, Blk 47, Oregon Pines
1.64

$975.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira L.oma, CA 91752

Monday, June 18, 2001

Page 14 of 39




29162

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-013B0-05600

Lt 3, Blk 43, Oregon Pines
1.64

$1,025.00

Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700

Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-013B0-05700

Lt 2, Bik 43, Oregon Pines
1.55

$1,000.00

Umbarger, Charles H.
38745 26th St E
Palmdale, CA 93550

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-013B0-07200

Lt 8, Blk 40, Oregon Pines
1.65

$875.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-014A0-00300

Lt 16, Blk 42, Oregon Pines
1.53

$1,000.00

O'Neil, Peter R. & Esther Y.
P OBox 124

Midland, OR 97634

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-014A0-02700

Lt 17, Blk 32, Oregon Pines
1.5

$850.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29163

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-014A0-04300
Lt 7, Blk 32, Oregon Pines
1.7

$1,025.00
Samango, Alfred

P O Box 700
Haleiwa, HI 96712

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-014B0-06100

Lt 13, Blk 18, Oregon Pines
1.53

$975.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-014C0-07000

Lt 8, Blk 21, Oregon Pines
1.51

$850.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3511-015A0-00400
Lt 70, Blk 18, Oregon Pines
1.51

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015A0-00500

Lt 69, Blk 18, Oregon Pines
1.55

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29164

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015A0-02700

Lt 59, Blk 5, Oregon Pines
1.55

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015A0-04500
Lt 25, Blk 17, Oregon Pines
1.51

$0.00
NOBID

MTL
Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3511-015A0-06200

Lt 42, Blk 17, Oregon Pines
1.6

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015B0-02100
Lt 4, Blk 16, Oregon Pines
1.51

$0.00
NOBID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015B0-05400

Lt 110, Blk 5, Oreogn Pines
1.5

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29165

MTL R-3511-015B0-05700

Legal Description A portion of Lt 55, Blk 6, Oregon Pines, K1 Co, OR, more
particularly desc as follows: Beginning at the SW cor of Lt 8 of
said Blk 6; th N 49° 15' 22" W, 581.32' to a line running from the E
Va cor of Sec 16; th along said line N 50° 14' 29" E, 269.47"; t

Acreage 3.02

Amount Paid $600.00

Sold To Seized Properties
Street P O Box 431

City, State Zip Mira Loma, CA 91752
MTL R-3511-015C0-01500
Legal Description Lt 7, Blk 5, Oregon Pines
Acreage 1.51

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3511-015C0-02400
Legal Description Lt 1, Blk 6, Oregon Pines
Acreage 1.58

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL " R-3511-015C0-03100
Legal Description Lt 8, Blk 6, Oregon Pines
Acreage 1.52

AmountPaid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip
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29166

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015C0-03900

Lt 14, Blk 2, Oregon Pines
1.51

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015D0-00400
Lt 41, Blk 18, Oregon Pines
1.72

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-015D0-00500

Lt 42, Bik 18, Oregon Pines
1.6

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-016A0-00600
Lt 1, Blk 8, Oregon Pines
1.61

$0.00
NO BID

MTL
Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-016A0-02400

Lt 5, Blk 7, Oregon Pines
1.55

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29167

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-016A0-04400
Lt 34, Blk 6, Oregon Pines
1.73

$0.00
NO BID

MTL
Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3511-016A0-04500
Lt 33, Blk 6, Oregon Pines
1.54

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-016A0-05400

Lt 24, Blk 6, Oregon Pines
1.53

$800.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira LLoma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3511-01700-00200

The W% NWVs SW¥ of Sec 17, T 35S, R 11 EWM, Kl Co, OR

19.5

$4,100.00

Deibert, Charles L.
201 NE Salzman Rd
Corbett, OR 97019

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29168

MTL R-3512-00800-00600

Legal Description The S¥2 N% S%2 NW' of Sec 8, T 35 S, R 12 EWM, lying W of the
Sycan River, K1 Co, OR

Acreage 2.72

Amount Paid $1,650.00

Sold To Kalita, William K.
Street P O Box 431

City, State Zip Chiloquin, OR 97624

MTL R-3606-010CA-04500

Legal Description A tract of land situated in the NEY of the SW% of Sec 10, T 36 S,
R 6 EWM, Kl Co, OR, more particularly desc as follows:
Beginning at the center Y4 cor of said Sec 10; th S 0° 36' W a dist of
669.40'; th S 89° 24' W a dist of 978.98'; th N 3° 07" W a dist

Acreage 0.17

Amount Paid $4,000.00

Sold To Akins, DeAnn L.
Street 25750 Rocky Point Rd
City, State Zip KFalls, OR 97601
MTL R-3610-014BA-00200
Legal Description Lts 13 - 17, Blk 4, 1st Addn to Sprague River
Acreage 0.34

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3610-014BA-00300

Legal Description Lts 18 & 19, Blk 4, 1st Addn to Sprague River
Acreage 0.14

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

Monday, June 18, 2001 Page 21 of 39




29169

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3610-014BA-00500
Lts 1 - 4, Blk 4, 1st Addn to Sprague River

0.28
$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3610-014BA-01800
Lts 13 - 19, Blk 2, 1st Addn to Sprague River
0.48

$900.00
Casebier, Clinton L. & Barbara G

925 Dumosa Dr
Red Bluff, CA 96080

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3610-014BA-02300

Lts 11 & 12, Blk 2, I'st Addn to Sprague River
0.14

$375.00

Casebier, Clinton L. & Barbara G

925 Dumosa Dr

Red Bluff, CA 96080

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3610-0148A-02400

Lts 1 - 5.and Lts 20 - 24 of vacated Blk 1 and Lts 6 - 19, Blk 1, 1st

Addn to Sprague River
1.65

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29170

MTL R-3610-014BA-02500

Legal Description Lts 1 -5, Blk 5, 1st Addn to Sprague River
Acreage 0.34

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-00000-00100

Legal Description The EY2 NWY4 & the NWY% NWY  of Sec 2, T 36.S, R 11 EWM, K1.
Co., OR

Acreage 123.21

Amount Paid

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-001B0-01200

Legal Description 1t 18, Blk 61, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
Acreage 4.76

Amount Paid $1,200.00

Sold To Seized Properties

Street P O Box 431

City, State Zip Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL R-3611-001C0-02100

Legal Description Lt 79, Blk 66, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
Acreage 1.57

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip
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29171

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-001C0-02300

Lt 15, Blk 61, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
5.43

$1,200.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-001C0-07300
Lt 11, Blk 65, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
2.07

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-001D0-01300

Lt 14, Blk 65, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.57

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Seld To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-002C0-00700

Lt 2, Blk 58, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
4.5

$875.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-002C0-00800

Lt 1, Blk 58, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
3.07

$900.00

Seized Properties

P OBox 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

Monday, June 18, 2001

Page 24 of 39




29172

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3611-002C0-00900
Lt 36, Blk 66, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park

1.75
$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-002D0-00300

Lt 5, Blk 60, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
3.83

$750.00

Seized Properties

P O Box 431

Mira Loma, CA 91752

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-003B0-01700

Lt 5, Bik 55, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
4.78

$1,000.00

Rose, Randal W.

4945 San Jacinto Cir E

Fallbrook, CA 92028

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-003B0-02700

Lt 2, Blk 70, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.58

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-003C0-03400

Lt 115, Blk 70, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.5

$1,350.00

Realvest, Inc.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29173

MTL R-3611-003C0-03500

MTL M-093864

Legal Description Lt 114, Blk 70, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park. Together with a
1974 Westwind, Serial #3266

Acreage 1.52

Amount Paid $8,000.00

Sold To Shockley, Judy A.
Street P O Box 336

City, State Zip Beatty, OR 97621
MTL R-3611-003C0-04600
Legal Description Lt 126, Blk 70, 5th Addn to Nimrod River Park
Acreage 1.74

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-003D0-04900

Legal Description Lt 3, Blk 20, 2nd Addn to Nimrod River Park
Acreage 1.52

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-004A0-00700

Legal Description Lt 17, Blk 52, 4th Addn to Nimrod River Park
Acreage 4.89

Amount Paid $1,200.00

Sold To Seized Propetties

Street P O Box 431

City, State Zip Mira Loma, CA 91752
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- 29174

MTL R-3611-005A0-00300

Legal Description The W2 NEY4 NWY, NEVY4 of Sec 5, T 36 S, R 11 EWM, Kl Co, OR
Acreage 5.04

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-005A0-01200

Legal Description The W% SW¥% SEY4 NEY of Sec 5, T 36 S, R 11 EWM, Kl. Co., OR
Acreage 5

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-005C0-00800

Legal Description The SWY% NWVs SW'% of Sec 5,T36 S, R 11 EWM, Kl Co, OR
Acreage 10

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3611-006C0-00100

Legal Description Gov't Lt 6 and the NEY4 SW¥% of Sec 6, T 36 S, R 11 EWM, K1 Co,
OR

Acreage 78.16

Amount Paid $7,100.00

Sold To Deibert, Charles L.

Street 201 NE Salzman Rd

City, State Zip Corbett, OR 97019
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29175

MTL
Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-007B0-05900

Lt 12, Blk 3, 1st Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.59

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-008A0-01200
Lt 148, Blk 31, 4th Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.99

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-008B0-03100
Lt 4, Blk 48, 4th Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.57

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-009B0-00600
Lt 33, Blk 49, 4th Addn to Nimrod River Park

- 1.68

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3611-009B0-01700

Lt 8, Blk 75, 7th Addn to Nimrod River Park
1.88

$0.00

NO BID

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29176

MTL R-3611-009C0-00600

Legal Description A portion of Gov't Lt 19, being a por of the NEY4 SWY4 of Sec 9, T
36 S, R 11 EWM, Kl Co, OR, more particularly desc as follows:
Beginning at the SE cor of Lt 6, Nimrod River Park; th S 1° 04' E to
a point on the N bndry of Gov't Lt 19 for the true pob; th

Acreage 1.38
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3612-00000-00900

Legal Description The EV2 EY2 SEV4 NEY4 of Sec 5, T 36 S, R 12 EWM, that lies N of
the rim of the Knot Table Land, K1.Co. OR

Acreage 5
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3612-001B0-04800

Legal Description Lt 3, Blk 13, Sprague River Valley Acres
Acreage 1.52

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3612-00400-01200

Legal Description The S¥2 SEY SEV4 NWY, and the SEYs SWY4 SEY4 NWV4 and that
part of the S¥2 8% SW%4 NEVY; that lays W of the Rimrock in Sec 4,
T 36 S,R 12 EWM, K1 Co, OR

Acreage 16.1
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street

City, State Zip
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29177

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3612-035D0-01000

The W2 W'Y, W', SEY: of Sec 35, T 36 S, R 12 EWM, Kl. Co, OR
20

$5,500.00

List, Lloyd K. & Joan 1.

21047 Dersch Rd

Anderson, CA 96007

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3613-005C0-00500

Lt 10, Blk 5, Ferguson Mtn Pines
2.13

$0.00

NO BID

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3613-006A0-02000

A parcel of land situated in Sec 6, T 36 S, R 13 EWM, Kl Co, OR,
being more particularly dese as follows: Commencing at the NW
cor of the NEV4 of said Sec ¢; th N 89° 55' 50" E along the Nly line
of said Sec 6, 901.75'; th leaving said section line S 20°

5.04

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3614-02900-01100

The NV 82 NEY. SW4 of Sec 29, T 36 S, R 14 EWM, K. Co., OR
10

$0.00

NO BID
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29178

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3710-00500-00300

The N2 NEY4 of Gov't Lt 6 of Sec 5, T 37 S, R 10 EWM, K1 Co, OR
5

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3710-00500-00700
The S¥: S% of Gov't Lt 6 of Sec 5, T 37 S, R 10 EWM, K1 Co, OR
10

$0.00
NOBID

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3710-00500-01100

The S’z W2 W2 N2 N2 of Gov't Lt 7of Sec ST, 37 S,R 10
EWM, Kl Co, OR

2.5

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid

Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-015A0-00900

Lt 10, Blk 4, KFFE Hwy 66 #1

6.6

$3,750.00

Realvest, Inc.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

Monday, June 18, 2001
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29179

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-016A0-01000

Lt 8, Blk 8, KFFE Hwy 66 #1

22

$2,150.00

Realvest, Inc.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

MTL
Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street
City, State Zip

R-3711-016A0-02800

Lt 4, Blk 7, KFFE Hwy 66 #1
1.92

$3,400.00

Realvest, Inc.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-021B0-00300
Lt 67, Blk 12, KFFE Huwy 66 #1
21.33

$13,000.00
Wethern, Robert V., Sr.

7015 Widgeon Ln
Bonanza, OR 97623

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-027C0-01100

Lt 28, Blk 19, KFFE Hwy 66 #1

2.26

$2,000.00

Realvest, Inc.

% Pauline Browning, HC 15 Box 495 C
Hanover, NM 88041

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-028D0-01800

Lt 33, Blk 21, KFFE Hwy 66 #1
2.3

$2,500.00

Pederson, Yvonne

P O Box 225

Dairy, OR 97625
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29180

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-028D0-04500
Lt 17, Blk 23, KFFE Hwy 66 #1
3.15

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-029A0-00400

Lt 66, Blk 14, KFFE Hwy 66 #1
2.32

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3711-034C0-00300
Lt 3, Bck 65, KFFE Hwy 66 #3
4.59

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3712-00400-03300

The SE SEYs SW¥4 of Sec 4, T 37§, R 12 EWM, K1 Co, OR
10

$0.00

NOBID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-021DD-00100

Lts 3, 12 & 13, Blk 4, 1st Addn to East Kfalls
0.34

$450.00

McClements, David A

5316 153rd Ave SE

Bellevue, WA 98006
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29181

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-028CD-12200
The Ely 50' of Lts 1 & 2, Blk 5, Williams Addn

$0.00
NO BID

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To
Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-028DB-00600

Beginning at the NE cor of Dixon Addn to the City of Kfalls, OR,
and running th; N 45° 46' W 181.2' to.a point on the Ely r/w line of
the Old Fort Klamath Rd; th N 46° 29' E along said Nly r/w line a
dist of 184.65' to a point on the 40 line; th'S 1° 02

0.38

$7,500.00

Monti's Construction, Inc.

1504 Oregon Ave

Klamath Falls, OR 9760

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-028DC-11400

A parcelof land lying in Lts 5 & 6, Blk 11, Dixon Addn to the City
of Kfalls, K1 Co, OR and being a portion of that property desc in
that deed to the State of Oregon, by and through its State Hwy
Comm, recorded in Bk 170, Pg 317 of Kl Co Record of Deeds;

$0.00

NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-029AB-05300

Lts 1 & 2, Blk 20, 2nd Addn to Kfalls
0

$0.00

NO BID
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29182

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To
Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-029BB-05500

Lt 4, Blk 14, North KFalls. Except that portion conveyed to the
State of Oregon by deed recorded 8/4/58, in Vol 301, Pg 521, Deed
Records of K1 Co, OR

$1,000.00

Morris, Phyllis J.
2220 Van Camp
KFalls, OR 97601

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-032AD-04900
Lts 8 & 9, Blk 94, Klamath Addn to Linkville

$29,000.00

Klamath Pawn & Loan Co
435 S. 6th St

Klamath Falls, OR 97601

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-032CC-03900
Lts 4, Blk 9, Lakeside Addn to Kfalls

0
$0.00
NO BID

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-3809-033BB-03700

Lts 6C & 6D, Block 4, Supp! Plat of Railroad Addn to the City of
Kfalls

0

$5,650.00

Unity Faith Full Gospel Church

251 Commercial
KFalls, OR 97601
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23183

MTL R-3811-004A0-04100

Legal Description Lt 5, Blk 34, KFFE Hwy 66 #2
Acreage 2.21

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-3811-010B0-02500

MTL M-187502

Legal Description Lt 2, Blk 70, KFFE Hwy 66 #3. Together with:a 1966 Belmont,
Serial #3682

Acreage 2.06

Amount Paid $7,000.00

Sold To Cains, Curtis L.

Street 2713 Via Festivo

City, State Zip Carlsbad, CA 92008

MTL R-3911-010CD-00900

Legal Description The W 65' of Lts' | & 2, Blk 4, Bonanza

Acreage 0

Amount Paid $5,500.00

Sold To Nelson, Donald M.

Street P O Box 347

City, State Zip Bonanza, OR 97623

MTL R-3915-02500-00800

Legal Description The N N% SEVa NW of See 25, T 39 §, R 15 EWM, K1 Co, OR

Acreage 10

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip
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29184

MTL R-4012 01900 00800

Legal Description Lt 4 and the WY, SEV4 SWY4 0of Sec 19, T40 S, R 12 EWM, K1 Co,
OR. Reserving therefrom a right of way for road and utility
purposes, 60' wide, lying 30' on each side of the center line of the
road desc in r/'w Agreement recorded in Bk 328, Pg 443, deed recor

Acreage 28.42

Amount Paid $12,500.00

Sold To Clawson David B. & Beverly A.
Street 20843 South Poe Valley Rd

City, State Zip Klamath Falls, OR 97603

MTL R-4012-02700-01200

Legal Description The S¥2 SE'4 SEV4 of Sec 27, T 40 S, R 12 EWM, Kl Co, OR,
Excepting therefrom a tract of land situated 1n the SEV4 SEY of Sec
27,T40S, R 12 EWM, K1 Co, OR, more particularly desc as
follows: Beginning at the SW cor of the SE% SEVa; th N along the

W line of
Acreage 18
Amount Paid $0.00
Sold To NO BID
Street
City, State Zip
MTL R-4013-00200-00600

Legal Description That por of Lt 4 in Sec 2, T 40 S, R 13 EWM, Kl Co, OR, more
particularly desc as follows: Commencing at the intersection of the
Sly line of the county road along the N line of said Lt 4 with the Ely
line of the county road along the W line of said Lt 4

Acreage 1

Amount Paid $600.00

Sold To Harless, Charles L.

Street 9852 East Langell Valley Rd

City, State Zip Bonanza, OR 97623
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MTL R-4014-00600-00600

Legal Description That portion of the W of the NW'4 of the SEV4 of Sec 6, T 40 S, R
14 EWM, lying W of the r/w line of Langell Valley Rd

Acreage 2.58

Amount Paid $2,000.00

Sold To Reddell, C. G.

Street 5200 Teare Ln

City, State Zip Bonanza, OR 97623
MTL R-4107-00900-00205
Legal Description The SY2 N, SEVa NWY, 0f Sec 9, T 41 S; R 7 EWM, K1 Co, OR
Acreage 10

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-4107-01400-00800

Legal Description The SEVa NEY4a NW of Sec 14, T'41 S, R 7 EWM, Kl Co, OR
Acreage 10

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip

MTL R-4107-01400-00900

Legal Description The SWY NEY NWY of Sec 14, T 41 S, R 7 EWM, Kl Co, OR
Acreage 10

Amount Paid $0.00

Sold To NO BID

Street

City, State Zip
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MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-4107-01400-01200
The SEV4a NWY% NWY of Sec 14, T 41 S, R 7 EWM, Kl Co, OR
10

$0.00
NO BID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-4107-01600-00100
The NEY: NE'4 NEY of Sec 16, T 41 S, R 7 EWM, Kl Co, OR
10

$0.00
NOBID

MTL

Legal Description
Acreage

Amount Paid
Sold To

Street

City, State Zip

R-4107-01600-00403

The S¥2a NW¥ NEV4 of See 16, T 41 S, R 7 EWM, Kl Co, OR
20

$0.00

NO BID

MTL
Legal Description

Acreage
Amount Paid
Sold To
Street

City, State Zip

R-4112-021DA-00100

Beginning at the SW cor of the Gov't Lt 1 of Sec 21, T 41 S, R 12
EWM, Kl Co, OR; th E 730" along the S line of said Gov't Lt 1 to
the true pob; th E along the S line of Gov't Lt 1, 100’ to a point; th N
200' to a point; th W pll to the S line of said Gov

0.39

$0.00

NO BID
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State of Oregon, County of Klamath
Recorded 06/19/01, at £4:2Y a_. m.

In Vol. MO1 Page £9/¥7

Linda Smith,
County Clerk Fee$ N C
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